
Bid #13-33SC Landscape 

& Irrigation Services & 

Installation

IRRI*TECH - Dallas, 

TX

Fannin Tree Farm - 

Frisco, TX

Ewing Irrigation - 

McKinney, TX

Weisz Selection 

Lawn and 

Landscape - 

Weston, TX

Supervisors/Foremen 5 8 7

Licensed Technicians 14 2 2

Laborers 23 30 14

Other 6 7 3

Total Employees 48 47 4 26

A

1 Response Time 2 days 2 to 4 days No Bid 2 days

B

2 Red Oak No Bid 245.00$                 No Bid 612.50$                 

3 Live Oak No Bid 245.00$                 No Bid 612.50$                 

4 Chinquapin Oak No Bid 265.00$                 No Bid 575.00$                 

5 Lacebark Elm No Bid 255.00$                 No Bid 575.00$                 

6 Cedar Elm No Bid 245.00$                 No Bid 575.00$                 

7 Chinese Pistachio No Bid 245.00$                 No Bid 625.00$                 

8 Redbud No Bid 210.00$                 No Bid 350.00$                 

9 Desert Willow No Bid 195.00$                 No Bid 412.50$                 

10 Crape Myrtle No Bid 215.00$                 No Bid 418.75$                 

11 Wax Myrtle No Bid 215.00$                 No Bid 375.00$                 

12 Mexican Plum No Bid 225.00$                 No Bid 375.00$                 

13 Possumhaw No Bid 225.00$                 No Bid 412.50$                 

14 Tree Staking No Bid 22.50$                    No Bid 40.00$                    

15 Bermuda Sod No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.63$                      

16 Mulch No Bid 38.50$                    No Bid 72.00$                    

17 Spray Heads 7.93$                      No Bid 4.39$                      25.00$                    

18 Flood Bubblers 1.60$                      No Bid 1.09$                      20.00$                    

19 Rotary Heads 17.77$                    No Bid 7.49$                      50.00$                    

20 1" Master Valve 170.80$                 No Bid No Bid 120.00$                 

21 1 1/2" Master Valve 192.60$                 No Bid 43.43$                    250.00$                 

22 2" Master Valve 222.80$                 No Bid 63.64$                    250.00$                 

23 Ball Valves 29.10$                    No Bid 6.09$                      37.50$                    

24
SL800 Electrical 

Controller
762.00$                 No Bid 52.48$                    1,500.00$              

25
SL1600 Electrical 

Controller
890.00$                 No Bid 94.98$                    1,600.00$              

26
SL4800 Electrical 

Controller
905.00$                 No Bid 249.98$                 2,500.00$              

27
SLSolar24 Battery 

Controller
3,790.00$              No Bid 3,695.00$              10,649.68$            

28
SLSolar48 Battery 

Controller
4,230.00$              No Bid 4,195.00$              12,103.00$            

29 Quick Coupler Valve 184.60$                 No Bid 72.32$                    200.00$                 

30 Backflow Device 639.00$                 No Bid 119.28$                 1,000.00$              

31 Piping 1.66$                      No Bid 1.86$                      1.60$                      

32 Piping from Connection 2.50$                      No Bid 7.25$                      9.00$                      

33 Drip Line Tree Rings 18.00$                    No Bid 29.35$                    0.75$                      

34 Drip Control Zone Kit 211.90$                 No Bid No Bid 500.00$                 

35 Hose Bibs 139.60$                 No Bid 7.10$                      300.00$                 

36 Conduit 20.00$                    No Bid 2.94$                      6.00$                      

Total Installed Materials 

Cost
12,436.86$            2,846.00$              8,653.65$              37,153.91$            

37 Percentage Markup 18% No Bid 19% Per Bid

Withdrew bid - 

Vendor does not 

offer services and 

installation


