

City of McKinney
16-61FP Erosion Control Materials

1	4" X 8" Gabion Riprap							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	TN	\$36.00	\$36.00			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
2	8" X 12" Riprap							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
3	18" X 24" Riprap							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
4	24" X 36" Riprap							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	TN	No Bid	No Bid			
5	6' X 3' X 3' PVC Coated Gabion							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, Inc.		EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$59.00	\$59.00			81984
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	\$87.488	\$87.488			
6	9' X 3' X 1' PVC Coated Gabion							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$52.00	\$52.00			81491
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	\$78.075	\$78.075			
7	9' X 3' X 1.5' PVC Coated Gabion							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$58.00	\$58.00			89267
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	\$87.063	\$87.063			
8	9' X 3' X 3' PVC Coated Gabion							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$84.00	\$84.00			89264
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	\$127.325	\$127.325			
9	12' X 3' X 1' PVC Coated Gabion							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$65.00	\$65.00			81402
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	\$121.875	\$121.875			
10	12' X 3' X 1.5' PVC Coated Gabion							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			

	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$75.00	\$75.00			81581
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	\$116.238	\$116.238			
11	12' X 3' X 3' PVC Coated Gabion							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$107.00	\$107.00			81463
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	\$171.575	\$171.575			
12	150' Gabion Roll Top Lid							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$560.00	\$560.00			89226
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
13	Galvanized Hog Rings - 1600 per box							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	Box	\$115.00	\$115.00			85075
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	Box	\$153.338	\$153.338			
14	Geo Textile Fabric (8 oz material)							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	SF	\$390.00	\$390.00			38121
						38121 Terretex N08 Geotextile 8 oz.		
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	SF	\$508.50	\$508.50	Fabric (4500')		
15	Pneumatic Hog Ring Gun (Stanley brand or equivalent)							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
						*King Hughes brand is submitted as		
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	equivalent		85496
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
16	12" class III Reinforced Concrete Pipe							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
17	15" class III Reinforced Concrete Pipe							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
18	18" class III Reinforced Concrete Pipe							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
19	24" class III Reinforced Concrete Pipe							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num

	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
20	30" class III Reinforced Concrete Pipe							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
21	36" class III Reinforced Concrete Pipe							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
22	48" class III Reinforced Concrete Pipe							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
23	60" class III Reinforced Concrete Pipe							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
24	5' X 7' class III Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	LF	No Bid	No Bid			
25	Intel Protection Rock Basket Filter							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
26	Orange Safety Fence (4' x 100')							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	Roll	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	Roll	\$28.50	\$28.50			38389
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	Roll	\$38.00	\$38.00			
27	8" Silt Fence Cable Ties (1000 per package)							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	Package	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	Package	\$16.50	\$16.50			81542
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	Package	\$22.00	\$22.00			
28	Wheat Straw Hay Bales							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	25.338	25.338	87214 9"x25' Straw		
29	P 550 Curlex material 40 sy (6.5' x 55.5")							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num

	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	Roll	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	Roll	\$346.67	\$346.67			87025
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	Roll	No Bid	No Bid			
30	C 350 Coconut Mesh Curlex material 40 sy (6.5" x 55.5")							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	Roll	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	Roll	\$133.22	\$133.22			87019
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	Roll	No Bid	No Bid			
31	Wire Back Silt Fence (3' x 100')							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	Roll	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	Roll	\$22.50	\$22.50			76052
						76021 Silt Fence Fabric TXDOT W/12.5 GA WireAlso Available...76052 Silt Fence 14Ga Wire Back @		
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	Roll	\$51.00	\$51.00	\$31.638 per roll.		
32	Sod Staples - 8" metal staples - 250 per box							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	BX	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	BX	\$60.00	\$60.00	500/Box		85733
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	BX	\$85.50	\$85.50	500 per box		
33	Silt Fence T Post (4' metal posts)							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	\$2.13	\$2.13	TXDOT Spec 1.25#/FT		79709
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	\$2.663	\$2.663			
34	S 75 Straw Curlex material 100 sy (8' x 112.5")							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	Roll	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	Roll	\$21.50	\$21.50	Single Net Straw		87324
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	Roll	\$50.00	\$50.00			
35	10' Precast Inlet							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	52.5	52.5			
36	4' X 4' X 4.5" Precast Wye Inlet							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
37	18" X 30" Forged Storm Sewer Grate							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			

38	19" Inlet Lid (with McKinney logo)							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
39	23" Inlet Lid (with McKinney logo)							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
40	32" Manhole Lid (with McKinney logo)							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
41	18" X 30" Storm Sewer Frame							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
42	19" Inlet Ring							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
43	23" Inlet Ring							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
44	32" Manhole Ring							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
45	Percentage mark-up for materials not listed on this bid form							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	David Copeland Sand & Gravel, I	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	Hanes Geo Components	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid			
	SiteOne Landscape Supply	1	EA	1	1	0 - 10% off Shelf Pric		
	<i>Note-Bid for Hanes Geo Components was submitted manually.</i>							

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

38

39

40

41

42

43

44

45