Bid 25-23AC Concrete Ready Mix

Holcim-SOR, Inc

Line item DESCRIPTION uom ESTIg’_:_AvTED UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST
2-Sack Flowable Fill
L1/ picked up at plant by City of McKinney cy 100 $ 135.00 | $  13,500.00
12| pelivered to City of McKinney specified location during normal business hours* cy 100 $ 150.00 [ $  15,000.00
13 Delivered to City of McKinney specified location outside of normal business hours* 94 50 No bid | $ -
3-Sack Pea Gravel/Flowable Fill S -
21 picked up at plant by City of McKinney cy 200 S 138.00 | $  27,600.00
22| pelivered to City of McKinney specified location during normal business hours* cy 100 $ 153.00 [ $  15,300.00
23 Delivered to City of McKinney specified location outside of normal business hours* Y 50 No bid | $ -
6-Sack Concrete/Fly Ash/4.000 psi strength @ 7 days/5,000 psi strength @ 28days S -
31 picked up at plant by City of McKinney cy 1500 $ 180.00 | $ 270,000.00
3.2 Delivered to City of McKinney specified location during normal business hours* Y 500 $ 195.00 | $  97,500.00
33 Delivered to City of McKinney specified location outside of normal business hours* 94 200 No bid | $ -
7-sack Concrete/5,200 psi strength @ 28days S -
41]picked up at plant by City of McKinney cy 1000 $ 187.50 | $ 187,500.00
42| pelivered to City of McKinney specified location during normal business hours* cy 200 S 20250 | $  40,500.00
4.3 Delivered to City of McKinney specified location outside of normal business hours* ey 100 No bid | $ -
Section Il. Additional cost, charges and fees S -
>1|Heating - cost per cubic yard cy 1 No bid | $ -
5.2 Cooling - cost per cubic yard cy 1 No bid | $ -
5-3||ce Unit - cost per bag EA 1 $ 750 | $ 7.50
54]sack adjustment EA 1 S 8.00 | $ 8.00
5.5 High-range water reducer - cost per cubic yard cy 1 $ 7.00 | $ 7.00
56 Mid-range water reducer - cost per cubic yard cy 1 $ 3.00 | $ 3.00
5.7 Polypropylene fiber - cost per cubic yard cy 1 $ 7.00 | $ 7.00
5-8steel fiber - cost per cubic yard cy 1 $ 7.00 | $ 7.00
59| color dye - cost per cubic yard cy 1 No bid | $ -
5L short load charge EA 1 $ 600.00 | $ 600.00
5-11|Retarder - cost per cubic yard cy 1 $ 3.00 | $ 3.00
512 pir entrainment - cost per cubic yard cy 1 $ - 0
513 Super Plasticizers - cost per cubic yard cy 1 S 7.00 | $ 7.00
5.14 Demurrage EA 1 No bid | $ -
Total S 1,990.50 | $ -
Grand Total $ 667,549.50
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