

Event Number	17-65FP	Organization	McKinney Purchasing
Event Title	Erosion Control and Miscellaneous Drainage	Workgroup	City of McKinney, Texas
Event Description	The City of McKinney is accepting sealed bids	Event Owner	John Lemmond
Event Type	ITB	Email	jlemmond@mckinneytexas.org
Issue Date	6/25/2017 09:00:01 AM (CT)	Phone	(972) 547-2087
Close Date	7/13/2017 02:00:00 PM (CT)	Fax	(972) 547-7585

Responding Supplier	City	State	Response Submitted	Lines Responded	Response Total
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen allen		TX	7/13/2017 12:16:33 PM (CT)	40	\$7,681.83
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	Keller	TX	7/14/2017 12:50:00 PM (CT)	82	\$211,874.00

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification. No alternate response data is included.

1 EROSION CONTROL SERVICES: Labor for repairs

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	PKG	\$275.00	\$275.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	PKG	\$440.00	\$440.00			

1.1 Labor for repairs to existing erosion control not listed. Price per person, per hour.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hour	\$25.00	\$25.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hour	\$40.00	\$40.00	Labor per man per hour		

1.2 Minimum labor charges (if any) per person, per hour.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hour	\$250.00	\$250.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hour	\$400.00	\$400.00	\$ 400.00 per day		

2 HYDROMULCH SERVICES:

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	PKG	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$1500.00 minimum charge to hydromulch		

2.1 30 pounds cellulose paper mulch, 2 pounds hulled Bermuda seed 95/85, 10 pounds homogenized fertilizer 13-13-13. Tackifier (Tac) brand and quantity to be determined by vendor. Tac will be required to hold mixture together. Pricing should be based on good, level soil. Watering requirements should not be included in bid as requirements may change with each job. Must maintain grass until 80% germination.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Square foot	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Square foot	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00			

2.2 Minimum site visit charges (if any) per visit.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	EA	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	EA	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	Not including watering		

3 CONTRACTOR MOBILIZATION

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	PKG	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	PKG	\$23,000.00	\$23,000.00			

3.1 For each project less than \$25,000; between the hours of 7:00am and 4:00pm Monday through Friday.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
----------	-----	-----	------------	----------	----------------	--------------	-----------

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hour	\$250.00	\$250.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hour	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00			

3.2 For each project \$25,000 to \$75,000; between the hours of 7:00am and 4:00pm Monday through Friday.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hour	\$250.00	\$250.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hour	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00			

3.3 For each project greater than \$75,000; between the hours of 7:00am and 4:00pm Monday through Friday.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hour	\$250.00	\$250.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hour	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00			

3.4 For any project on weekends (after 4:00pm Friday and before 7:00am Monday).

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hour	\$250.00	\$250.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hour	\$8,000.00	\$8,000.00			

4 INSTALLED MATERIALS: Cost per unit including delivery and installation.

Slope and channel protection materials including gabion structures, riprap and geotextiles must meet specifications with the latest NCTCOG Public Works

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	PKG	\$3,170.00	\$3,170.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	PKG	\$28,905.00	\$28,905.00			

4.1 Construction entrance (rock entrance)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	Includes Removal		

4.2 3 to 8 inch gabion rock

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Ton	\$40.00	\$40.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Ton	\$45.00	\$45.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.3 8 inch diameter to 12 inch diameter loose rock riprap

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Ton	\$40.00	\$40.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Ton	\$47.00	\$47.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.4 18 inch diameter to 24 inch diameter loose rock riprap							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Ton	\$40.00	\$40.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Ton	\$50.00	\$50.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.5 24 inch diameter to 36 inch diameter loose rock riprap							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Ton	\$50.00	\$50.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Ton	\$60.00	\$60.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.6 6 feet x 3 feet x 3 feet PVC coated gabion basket							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.7 9 feet x 3 feet x 1 feet PVC coated gabion basket							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$1,800.00	\$1,800.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.8 9 feet x 3 feet x 1.5 feet PVC coated gabion basket							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$1,900.00	\$1,900.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.9 9 feet x 3 feet x 3 feet PVC coated gabion basket							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$2,100.00	\$2,100.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.10 12 feet x 3 feet x 1 feet PVC coated gabion basket							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.11 12 feet x 3 feet x 1.5 feet PVC coated gabion basket							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$2,700.00	\$2,700.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.12 12 feet x 3 feet x 3 feet PVC coated gabion basket

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.13 150 feet gabion roll top lid (mattress)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.14 Galvanized hog rings - 100 per box

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Box	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Box	\$500.00	\$500.00	Material Delivered Only		

4.15 Geo textile fabric (8 ounce material)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Square foot	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Square foot	\$3.00	\$3.00	\$3.00 per SY Material Delivered Only		

5 INSTALLED MATERIALS: Cost per unit including delivery and installation. Reinforced concrete pipe (RCP) and reinforced concrete box culvert must meet specifications in accordance with the latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction Standards, Division 500 Underground Construction & Appurtenances. For underground utility construction, a trench safety plan, sealed by a

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	PKG	\$3,530.00	\$3,530.00			

5.1 12 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$200.00	\$200.00	10' Minimum Charge		

5.2 15 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$230.00	\$230.00	10' Minimum Charge		

5.3 18 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$250.00	\$250.00	10' Minimum Charge		

5.4	24 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$270.00	\$270.00	10' Minimum Charge		
5.5	30 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$300.00	\$300.00	10' Minimum Charge		
5.6	36 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$330.00	\$330.00	10' Minimum Charge		
5.7	42 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear Foot	\$400.00	\$400.00	10' Minimum Charge		
5.8	48 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$450.00	\$450.00	10' Minimum Charge		
5.9	54 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear Foot	\$500.00	\$500.00	10' Minimum Charge		
5.10	60 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$600.00	\$600.00	10' Minimum Charge		
6	INSTALLED MATERIALS: Cost per unit including delivery and installation.							
	Erosion control materials must meet specifications in accordance with the latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction Standards, Division 200 Site Protection							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	PKG	\$1,491.83	\$1,491.83			
	North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	PKG	\$2,779.00	\$2,779.00	\$1500.00 Minimum charge per project		
6.1	Bermuda hydro-mulch							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
	jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Square yar	\$1.25	\$1.25			
	North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Square yar	\$3.00	\$3.00	Watering by the hourly rates		

6.2 VMAX C350 Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mat by North American Green or approved equal (6.5 Feet X 55.5 Feet)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Roll	\$4.00	\$4.00	\$4.00 per SY		
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Roll	\$325.00	\$325.00			

6.3 VMAX P550 Turf Reinforcement Mat by North American Green or approved equal (6.5 Feet X 55.5 Feet)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Roll	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$6.00 per SY		
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Roll	\$700.00	\$700.00			

6.4 EroNet S75 Erosion Control Blanket by North American Green or approved equal (8 Feet x 112 Feet)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Roll	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00 per SY		
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Roll	\$150.00	\$150.00			

6.5 Compacted granular fill

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Cubic yard	\$40.00	\$40.00			
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Cubic yard	\$40.00	\$40.00			

6.6 Flowable fill

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Cubic yard	\$30.00	\$30.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Cubic yard	\$170.00	\$170.00	3 CY Minimum		

6.7 Orange safety fence 6 foot

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Linear foot	\$1.50	\$1.50			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$6.00	\$6.00			

6.8 Inlet protection rock basket filter

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Square Foo	\$42.00	\$42.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Square Foo	\$600.00	\$600.00	\$600.00 per each. 10" Inlet Maximum		

6.9 8 inch silt fence cable ties

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	\$0.15	\$0.15			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$5.00	\$5.00			

6.10 Silt fence T post (4 feet metal posts)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	\$4.00	\$4.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$30.00	\$30.00			

6.11 Wire back silt fence

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Linear foot	\$1.75	\$1.75			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Linear foot	\$3.00	\$3.00			

6.12 Topsoil

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Cubic yard	\$30.00	\$30.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Cubic yard	\$60.00	\$60.00			

6.13 Wheat straw hay bales

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Each	\$21.00	\$21.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$30.00 per CY		

6.14 Redi-rock product (cost per unit includes delivery to our location)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Cubic yard	\$145.00	\$145.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Cubic yard	\$1,750.00	\$1,750.00	\$1750.00 per each		

6.15 Tank dam seed mixture (sold by the pound)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Cubic yard	\$0.18	\$0.18			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Cubic yard	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00 per Pound		

7 INLETS, GRATES AND LIDS - furnish, deliver and install. Inlets, grates and lids must meet specifications in accordance with the latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction Standards, Division 6000 Storm Water Drainage.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	PKG	\$147,200.00	\$147,200.00			

7.1 10 feet precast inlet

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$9,000.00	\$9,000.00			

7.2 4 feet x 4 feet precast drop inlet							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$8,000.00	\$8,000.00			
7.3 18 inches x 24 inches forged storm sewer grate							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00			
7.4 19 inches inlet lid (with McKinney logo)							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$3,200.00	\$3,200.00			
7.5 21 inches inlet lid (with McKinney logo)							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00			
7.6 24 inches inlet lid (with McKinney logo)							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$4,500.00	\$4,500.00			
7.7 32 inches inlet lid (with fish logo)							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00			
7.8 Standard curb inlet 5 feet							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00			
7.9 Standard curb inlet 8 feet							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00			
7.10 Standard curb inlet 10 feet							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$9,000.00	\$9,000.00			
7.11 Standard curb inlet 12 feet							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$11,000.00	\$11,000.00				
-------------------------------	---	------	-------------	-------------	--	--	--	--

7.12	Standard curb inlet 15 feet							
-------------	------------------------------------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$14,000.00	\$14,000.00			

7.13	Standard curb inlet 20 feet							
-------------	------------------------------------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00			

7.14	Standard drop inlet 2 feet							
-------------	-----------------------------------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00			

7.15	Standard drop inlet 3 feet							
-------------	-----------------------------------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$8,000.00	\$8,000.00			

7.16	Standard drop inlet 4 feet							
-------------	-----------------------------------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$7,500.00	\$7,500.00			

7.17	Standard drop inlet 5 feet							
-------------	-----------------------------------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00			

7.18	Standard drop inlet 6 feet							
-------------	-----------------------------------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Each	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00			

8	EQUIPMENT: Cost per hour including operator(s).							
----------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	PKG	\$1,745.00	\$1,745.00			
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	PKG	\$3,020.00	\$3,020.00			

8.1	DUMP TRUCK							
------------	-------------------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hourly	\$100.00	\$100.00	1 2000 international 1HSCBAER2YJ075610 :		
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$150.00	\$150.00	Peterbilt 12 CY Tandem		

8.2 953 CAT TRACK LOADER (or comparable)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hourly	\$150.00	\$150.00	88 953 20Z02280 2.25 yd bucket		
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$200.00	\$200.00	2014 CAT 953 W/2CY Bucket		

8.3 320 CAT EXCAVATOR (or comparable)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hourly	\$175.00	\$175.00	My tractor is bigger than a 320 catMine is 1		
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$220.00	\$220.00	2014 CAT 321 W/30" Bucket		

8.4 308 MINI EXCAVATOR (or comparable)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$120.00	\$120.00	CAT 308 Mini W/12" Bucket		
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hourly	\$125.00	\$125.00	I have a 1996 cat 311B 5PK01607 1/2 yd bu		

8.5 ZERO TURN MOWER

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$60.00	\$60.00	John Deere 2016 Platform Mower		
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hourly	\$60.00	\$60.00	Badboy 5200 lightning BBL5226KA0211100		

8.6 TRACTOR WITH 6 FOOT MOWER

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$80.00	\$80.00	2010 Ford w/72" Platform		
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hourly	\$85.00	\$85.00	1975 International 674		

8.7 12-14 CUBIC YARD SCRAPER

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hourly	\$150.00	\$150.00	1 is 1984 613B 38W07547 cat2 is 1979 613		
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$400.00	\$400.00	Cut Scraper - 8 CY		

8.8 TRACTOR WITH 16 FOOT MOWER

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen	1	Hourly	\$100.00	\$100.00	2014 Kabota 9960 vin 55531		
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$270.00	\$270.00	2010 Ford W/ 16' Mower		

8.9 BOBCAT WITH 6 FOOT MOWER

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$100.00	\$100.00	2015 Bobcat 175		

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen 1 Hourly \$100.00 \$100.00 2007 252B2 cat 0252BVSCP04663

8.10 CONCRETE PUMP TRUCK WITH MINIMUM 125 FOOT REACH

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen 1		Hourly	No Bid				
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$450.00	\$450.00	\$450.00 Per Trip. 1 Day / 1 Pour Rate		

8.11 1,500 GALLON WATER TRUCK (or comparable)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen 1		Hourly	\$125.00	\$125.00	2006 ford 650 2000 gallon tank 3FKNF65E1		
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$140.00	\$140.00	International 7500		

8.12 1,000 HP VERMEER TUB GRINDER (or comparable)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$90.00	\$90.00	TBD		

8.13 MOTOR GRADER

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen 1		Hourly	\$150.00	\$150.00	1984 galion A450E 10963		
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$220.00	\$220.00	2012 CAT 140H		

8.14 LOADER

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen 1		Hourly	\$150.00	\$150.00	1996 case 621B JEE0053103		
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$200.00	\$200.00	2015 Komatsu WA270		

8.15 BULLDOZER

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen 1		Hourly	\$150.00	\$150.00	1992 D4H 9DB04845		
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$200.00	\$200.00	2013 CAT D5		

8.16 STEEL WHEEL ROLLER

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
North Texas Contracting, Inc.	1	Hourly	\$120.00	\$120.00	Ingersoll Rand 2015 SD-45		
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen 1		Hourly	\$125.00	\$125.00	1 is 1980 ingersoll rand sp42 smoothdurm		

Line #	Att #	Attribute Name	Attribute Note	jerry carpenter exc	North Texas Contracting, Inc.
Header	1	GENERAL TERMS AND CO I.	BIDDING BIDS – TI	Agree	Agree
Header	2	CONTRACT TERM	Once a contract is awarde	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	3	MINIMUM SPECIFICATION	GENERAL - It is the intent	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	4	PROJECT ESTIMATES	1. Contractor shall provide	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	5	EMERGENCIES STANDARC	Defined as occasions whe	2 hours	Initial
Header	6	EMERGENCIES AFTER HOI	Defined as occasions whe	2 hours	Initial
Header	7	SPECIFICATIONS - NCTCO	(The City of McKinney, Tex	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	8	SAFETY RECORD	Pursuant to Section 252.0	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	9	SAFETY RECORD QUESTIO	Has the bidder received a	No	No
Header	10	SAFETY RECORD QUESTIO	Has the bidder received a	No	No
Header	11	SAFETY RECORD QUESTIO	Has the bidder ever been	No	No
Header	12	SAFETY RECORD QUESTIO	Has the bidder ever been	No	No
Header	13	SAFETY RECORDS-RESPON	If the bidder has indicat	e	Initial
Header	14	BEST VALUE EVALUATION	Award of contract shall be	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	15	CONTRACTOR'S WARRANT	For a two-year period aft	e	Acknowledge
Header	16	EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS &	If bidder takes exception	None	City of Allen
Header	17	INTERLOCAL CLAUSE	As permitted under Chapt	Yes	Yes
Header	18	FEDERAL IRS FORM W-9	Bidder has attached IRS F	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	19	OSHA	Has the bidder been fined	No	No
Header	20	NUMBER OF YEARS IN BU	Enter the number of year:	50	27
Header	21	INSURANCE REQUIREMEN	The insurance requiremer	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	22	CONSIDERATION OF LOCA	Section 271.9051 of the T	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	23	BIDDER OR AFFECTED SU	Does the bidder or affect	e	No
Header	24	OSHA INSPECTIONS	Has the bidder had any O	! No	No
Header	25	STATE OF TEXAS HOUSE B	Effective January 1, 2016,	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	26	REFERENCES	List at least three (3) com	City of Allen Jimmy	See Attached
Header	27	BONDS	TEXAS LOCAL GOVERNME	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	28	QUESTIONS	All questions regarding th	Acknowledge	Acknowledge
Header	29	DIGITAL SIGNATURE	The undersigned agrees, i	Jack Carpenter	Initial
Header	30	BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGEM	Bidder acknowledges, unc	Acknowledge	Acknowledge

Responding Supplier	Signature Full Name	Signature Email	Supplier Notes
jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpen North Texas Contracting, Inc.	Jack Carpenter	jackcarpenterexe@gmail.com	Hope to here from y'all thanks for the opportunity

