City of McKinney Bid Name: Police Uniform Accessories |

Bid Tabulation Bid No.: 12-18FP

Bid Date: April 19, 2012

| GST Public Safety Supply GT Distributors Tyler Uniform
Grand Prairie, TX Austin, TX Tyler, TX

';f"‘ DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE Ex;lca:f;:r'r? “ Total Cost UNIT PRICE Ex;lca:f;:r'r? “ Total Cost UNIT PRICE Ex;lca:f;:r'r? “ Total Cost
0. Tailoring Tailoring Tailoring
1 |Badge - Mounted Patrol - Gold for Campaign Hat 3 $ 73.05 $ 219.15 Blackinton $ 5176 $ 155.28 $ $ 222.00
3 Badge - Mounted Patrol - Silver for Campaign Hat 3 $ 6211 $ 186.33 = Blackinton $  46.47 $ 13941 $ $ 198.00
4 Badge - Cloth - Gold 200 Classic $ 1.95 $ 390.00 No Bid $ $ $ 600.00
5 |Badge - Cloth - Silver 200 Classic $ 1.95 $ 390.00 No Bid $ $ $ 600.00
6 | Side-Armor Tactical Equipment Bag 5 57.50 $ 287.50 | Uncle Mike's ~ 5349-1 $ 37.82 $ 189.10 $ $ 265.00
7 |Bars - Serving Since 35 9.22 $ 322.70 | Blackinton $ 6.94 $ 242.90 $ $ 350.00
8 Batteries - 20 XP Flashlight 30 42.19 $1,265.70 = Streamlight $ 26.88 $ 806.40 $ $1,170.00
9 |Batteries - Stinger Flashlight 10 18.52 $ 185.20 = Streamlight $ 1179 $ 117.90 $ $ 180.00
10 |Batteries - Ultra Stinger Flashlight 30 33.02 $ 990.60 = Streamlight $ 21.03 $ 630.90 $ $ 930.00
11 |Battery Charger - AC/DC Fast Charger 2.5 hr 6 36.72 $ 220.32 - $ 4081 $ 24486 $ $ 210.00
12 Belt - Duty - Inner - Velcro 50 30.71 $1,535.50 @ Safariland $ 2383 $1,191.50 $ $1,800.00
13 Belt - Duty - Outer 50 61.79 $3,089.50  Safariland $ 4773 $2,386.50 $ $ 3,600.00
14 Belt - Nylon Duty Belt 5 18.40 $ 92.00 Bianchi $ 1421 $ 71.05 $ $ 110.00
15 Cord - Gold hat (Acorns) 3 7.50 $ 2250 No Bid $ - $ $ 21.00
16 Cord - Silver hat (Acorns) 3 7.50 $ 2250 No Bid $ - $ $ 21.00
17 Tactical Elbow Pads 25 15.47 $ 386.75 mm $ 10.74 $ 268.50 $ $ 400.00
18 |[Emblems - Negotiator rockers - subdued 5 Classic $ 1.95 $ 9.75 No Bid $ $ $ 15.00
19 Emblems - Tac Rockers 100 Classic $ 1.95 $ 195.00 No Bid $ $ $ 250.00
20 |[Emblems - Tac Rockers - subdued 100 | Classic $ 1.95 $ 195.00 No Bid $ $ $ 250.00
21 Flashlight — Ultra Stinger w/AC fast charger 30 | Streamlight 78014 $ 14133 $4,239.90 $ 102.88 $3,086.40 $ $3,600.00
22 Flashlight Accessory - Traffic wand Ultra stinger 6.75 $ 20250 @ Streamlight $ 3.98 $ 119.40 $ $ 240.00
24 |Goggles - Special Operations 54.69 $ 546.90 = Blackhawk $ 36.79 $ 367.90 $ $ 690.00
25 'Model 700 Standard Nickel Handcuff 28.28 $ 28280  Peerless PE-4710 $ 20.36 $ 203.60 $ $ 300.00
26 |Handcuff case - Leather 25.00 $ 750.00  Safariland 90-2HS $ 1931 $ 579.30 $ $ 870.00
27 |Accumold, Nylon, Covered Handcuff Case 16.43 $ 8215 Bianchi $ 12.69 $ 6345 $ $ 125.00
28 |Handcuff case - Nylon Closed Top Cuff Case 11.07 $ 5535 Bianchi $ 8.55 $ 4275 $ $ 70.00
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City of McKinney Bid Name: Police Uniform Accessories
Bid Tabulation Bid No.: 12-18FP
Bid Date: April 19, 2012

GST Public Safety Supply GT Distributors Tyler Uniform
Grand Prairie, TX Austin, TX Tyler, TX
Item Extra Charges Extra Charges Extra Charges
DESCRIPTION QTY Manufacturer Item Number UNIT PRICE | /Custom Total Cost Manufacturer Item Number UNIT PRICE =~ /Custom Total Cost Manufacturer Item Number UNIT PRICE =~ /Custom Total Cost

No. Tailoring Tailoring Tailoring
29 |Hat bands - Police Gold 5 Premier P8002 $ 10.86 $ 5430 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - $ 7.00 $ 35.00
30 Hat bands - Police Silver 5 Premier P8001 $ 10.86 $ 5430 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - $ 7.00 $ 35.00
31 1-piece black leather hat strap 5 Stratton ST-1P-BK  $ 5.08 $ 2540 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - Stratton $ 7.00 $ 35.00
32 | 3-piece black leather hat strap 5 ST-3P-BK  $ 6.56 $ 3280 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - Stratton ST-3P-BK  $ 9.00 $ 45.00
33 He.n - Slrayv Mounted Unit - Summer Campaign Style - Flat double SRR s 7344 $ 146.88 o o E No Bid s . ST $  80.00 $ 160.00

brim version
34 |Hat - Felt Mounted Unit - Campaign/MP Style - Long Oval 2 F40 $ 108.59 $ 217.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - Stratton F-40 $ 115.00 $ 230.00
35 Hat - Uniform Double Post Round 10 Midway 5-Star $ 3477 $ 347.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - Midway $ 42,00 $ 420.00
36 Helmet Face Shield - ProTech MultiHit Ballistic 5 702M $ 359.38 $1,796.90 ProTech PTA-702M $ 26254 $1,312.70  ProTech PTA-702M $ 530.00 $2,650.00
38 Helmet - Riot Duty Premier Crown 906 Nonballistic 10 =~ NoBid No Bid No Bid $ - Pc'fg“/;f]’ PC-9065 $  90.69 $ 90690 Premier  PC-9065 $ 106.00 $1,060.00
39 Holster - Leather - Level Il, Plain, Glock 22 30 6280 $ 127.87 $3,836.10 = Safariland = 6280-83-6x $  98.79 $2,963.70 Safariland  6280-83-6x $ 124.00 $3,720.00
40 Holster - Drop Leg with Pistol light - Level I, Glock 22 5 6004 $ 145.36 $ 726.80  Safariland 6004-831-12x $ 112.29 $ 561.45 Safariland 6004-831-12x $ 170.00 $ 850.00
41 |Holster - Z2 Combat Light 5 V70 $ 2143 $ 107.15 SureFire V70 $ 1712 $ 85.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ -
42 |Holster - Nylon - Level Il, Fine TAC, Glock 22 5 6280 $ 8250 $ 41250 @ Safariland  6280-83-13x $ 63.74 $ 318.70 Safariland 6280-83-13x $ 110.00 $ 550.00
43 |Holster - Open-Top Paddle, Plain black,Glock 22, 23, 27 5 5181 $ 2429 $ 121.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - Safarland 5181-83-6x $  39.00 $ 195.00
44 |Holster - Fobus Paddle Holster for Large Frame Glocks 5 GL2 $ 24.00 $ 120.00 Fobus GL2 $ 1719 $ 8595 Fobus GL2 $ 33.00 $ 165.00
45 Holster - Fobus Paddle Holster for Glock 26 / 27 / 33 5 GL26 $ 24.00 $ 120.00 Fobus GL26 $ 1719 $ 8595 Fobus GL26 $ 29.00 $ 145.00
4 |YCket — Patrol - TacShell Jacket - Black — 4660 zips in as liner | 5, 9820-60-11 $ 309.06 $ 600 $1575300  NoBid No Bid No Bid $ - NoBid No Bid No Bid $ -

— Two shoulder patches and one cloth badge
47 Jacket~ Patrol ~SoftShell Fleece Jacket —Dark Navy with Royal | 5, 4660 | $ 10750 $ 600 $567500 NoBd  NoBd  NoBid $ - NoBd  NoBd  NoBid s -

Blue — Zips in as a liner for 9820 TacShell
48 |Jacket - Motorcycle - Black/Hi Vis Yellow - Sizes Small thru 5XL 6 9970-1 $ 389.69 $2,338.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - NoBid No Bid No Bid $ -
49 |Jacket - Black Unlined Windbreaker (Raid Jacket) 10 J31 $ 3547 $ 1000 $ 454.70/ NoBid No Bid No Bid $ - Dutyman J31 $ 36.00 $ 360.00
50 |Jacket - Black Lined for Cold Weather 5 HS3352 $ 13359 $ 667.95  NoBid No Bid No Bid $ - Horace Small  HS3352 $ 125.00 $ 625.00
51 Jacket - Black fleece zipper front with Dispatch Logo 20 1744A $ 2016 $ 1000 $ 603.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - Hartwell 1744A $ 30.00 $ 600.00
52 | Jumpsuit - Green Nomex Flight Suit 5 Atlanco cwuz27/P  $ 17172 $ 1875 $ 952.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - NoBid No Bid No Bid $ -
53 |Keepers - Leather with hidden snaps 20 2311H $ 3.71 $ 7420 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - Dutyman 2311H $ 5.00 $ 100.00
54 |Bianchi 7406 AccuMold Belt Keeper 4-pack - nylon 20 7406-15635 $ 9.29 $ 185.80 Bianchi BI-15635 $ 7.17 $ 143.40  Bianchi BI-15635 $ 13.00 $ 260.00
55 Tactical Knee Pads 25 KP250 $ 1977 $ 494.25 Hatch KP250 $ 1398 $ 349.50 Hatch KP250 $ 2200 $ 550.00
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City of McKinney Bid Name: Police Uniform Accessories
Bid Tabulation Bid No.: 12-18FP
Bid Date: April 19, 2012

Item
No.

56

57

58

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

68

69

70

71

72

73

74

75

76

77

78

79

80

81

DESCRIPTION

Lapel Mic for Moto - Tactical Ear Gadgets Hawk

Case of 24 Def Tech No. 25 Reloads

Disposable Non-Reloadable Flash Bangs

Def Tech No. 23 12 Gauge Bean Bag Round

Flameless Tri-Chamber "Indoor Gas"

No. 4 Triple Charge Continuous Discharge Pyrotechnic Chemical
Grenades

"Safe Smoke" - White

"Crowd Control" Grenade

Def Tech No. 22 12 Gauge Breaching Round

Light - Z2 Combat

TLR-1 Aluminum Tactical Light - Pistol Mounted (LED)

8020 Magazine Pouch - Open Top Double - Nylon

Magazine Holder, Snap-On, Open Top Double - Leather

7320 Magazine Pouch - Open Top Double - Nylon

Salient Search Buddy Telescoping Pole with Acrylic Mirror

3" x 5/8" Name Bar

Name strips - embroidered

Six Pocket Wool Blend Trousers

Taclite Pro Pant, Poly/Cotton Ripstop

Patches - Shoulder

Patches - Shoulder - subdued

Patch - Custom made - 2x 4

Patch - Police-2x 4

Patch - Police - 4x 11

Patches - Custom made - 2 x 11

Patch - Lettering added to 2 x 11

QTY Manufacturer Item Number UNIT PRICE

20

24

24

24

24

24

24

24

24

20

30

10

50

20

10

500

200

50

50

50

30

30

GST Public Safety Supply
Grand Prairie, TX

Ear Phone = EP1323QR

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

Surefire  Z2-S-BK-WB*

69110
31396
079-83-6
18797
No Bid No Bid
J2
GST
8567
I 74273
Classic
Classic
Classic
Classic
Classic
Classic
Classic

$  99.95
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$ 135.95
$ 136.41
$ 16.26
$ 2126
$ 2143
No Bid
$ 8.95
$ 8.50
$ 80.63
$ 4177
$ 3.95
$ 3.95
$ 3.95
$ 2.95
$ 5.95
$ 4.95
$ 4.95

Extra Charges
/ Custom Total Cost
Tailoring

$1,999.00

$ 679.75

$ 682.05

$ 325.20

$ 637.80

$ 214.30

$ 44750

$ 170.00

$ 806.30

$ 208.85

$1,975.00

$ 790.00

$ 197.50

$ 147.50

$ 297.50

$ 14850

$ 14850

GT Distributors

Austin, TX

Manufacturer Item Number UNIT PRICE

Def Tech

Def Tech

Def Tech

Def Tech

Def Tech

Def Tech

Def Tech

Def Tech

Surefire

Streamlight

Bianchi

Safariland

Bianchi

Salient

Blackinton

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

EP1323QR

8001

8001INR

DT-3027

DT-1032

DT-1026-CS

DT-1063

DT-1042

DT-3105

Z2X-A-BK

69110

31396

079-83-6

18797

SAL-MRO1

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$

$

$

78.98

40.97

54.87

5.92

36.80

42.66

30.40

45.93

6.33

92.46

86.94

12.56

21.52

16.54

18.21

7.47

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Extra Charges
/ Custom
Tailoring

Haz-Mat
Fees

Haz-Mat
Fees

Haz-Mat
Fees

Haz-Mat
Fees

Haz-Mat
Fees

Haz-Mat
Fees

Haz-Mat
Fees

Haz-Mat
Fees

Total Cost

$1,579.60

$ 983.28

$1,316.88

$ 142.08

$ 883.20

$1,023.84

$ 729.60

$1,102.32

$ 151.92

$ 462.30

$ 434.70

$ 251.20

$ 645.60

$ 165.40

$ 109.26

$ 373.50

Tyler Uniform

Tyler, TX

Manufacturer Item Number UNIT PRICE

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Streamlight

Bianchi

Safariland

Bianchi

No Bid

Blackintion

No Bid

5.11

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

69110

31396

079-83-6

18797

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 135.00

$ 20.00

$ 27.00

$ 28.00

No Bid

$ 10.00

$ 4.00

No Bid

$  49.00

$ 1.65

$ 1.65

$ 3.00

$ 5.00

$ 5.00

$ 4.00

Extra Charges
/ Custom Total Cost

Tailoring

$ 675.00

$ 400.00

$ 810.00

$ 280.00

$ 500.00

$ 80.00

$ 245.00

$ 825.00

$ 330.00

$ 150.00

$ 250.00

$ 250.00

$ 120.00

$ 150.00
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City of McKinney Bid Name: Police Uniform Accessories

Bid Tabulation

Bid No.: 12-18FP

Bid Date: April 19, 2012

Item
No.

82

83

84

85

86

87

89

920

91

92

93

94

95

96

97

98

929

100

101

102

103

104

105

106

107

108

DESCRIPTION

Pins - Mounted Unit

Pepper spray 2.0 oz Stream

Pepper spray holder small - Leather

Nylon PatrolTek OC/Mace Spray Pouch

Nylon Open Top OC/Mace Pouch

Accumold Nylon Mace/OC Spray Holder

Raincoat

Raincovers for Stratton F-40 Campaign Style Hats

Raincovers for Patrol Caps with Visor Cover

French Blue Long Sleeve Polyester Shirt

French Blue Short Sleeve Polyester Shirt

Shirt - cool max s - 2XL

Shirt - Polo w/logo

Shirt - Tactical Prof. Polo with Logo - short sleeve - Navy

Shirt - Tactical Prof. Polo w/Dispatch Logo/Black & Khaki,
French Blue, Burgundy

Shirt - Tactical Prof. Polo w/Dispatch Logo/Black & Khaki,
French Blue, Burgundy

Shirt - Tactical Short Sleeve - Nylon, Dk Blue, ODGreen

Shirt - Tactical Long Sleeve - Nylon, Dk Blue, ODGreen

Short - men

Short - women

Shoulder loop - sewn - black with red stripe on gold border

Shoulder loop - sewn - Dallas Police blue with yellow stripes

Shoulder loop - sewn - gold

Shoulder loop - sewn - green

Shoulder loop - sewn - red

Shoulder loop - velcro - black with red stripe on gold border

QTY

50

20

10

10

10

20

20

10

10

10

25

125

25

25

25

25

30

20

20

40

10

10

Manufacturer Item Number UNIT PRICE

No Bid

Bianchi

Stratton

Outer Banks

5.11

5.11

5.11

Fechheimer

Fechheimer

GST

GST

GST

GST

GST

GST

GST Public Safety Supply

Grand Prairie, TX

No Bid

5039

38-4-2HS

8007

8008

7307*

447TRC3M

RC-MP

P9008

8670

8675

85R7086Z

OB11

41060

D100

D100W

71175*

72175*

47330*

47330WT*

$

No Bid

10.88

25.00

11.07

9.47

15.00

61.86

6.80

3.05

51.06

47.03

51.61

17.92

29.73

17.17

17.17

41.77

41.77

56.25

56.25

3.00

3.00

3.00

3.00

3.00

3.00

Extra Charges
/ Custom Total Cost
Tailoring

$

$

$

$

$ 544.00

$ 500.00

$ 110.70

$ 9470

$ 150.00

$1,237.20

$ 13.60

$ 61.00

$ 510.60

$ 470.30

$ 516.10

1750 $ 885.50

36.35  $8,260.00

36.35  $1,338.00

36.35 $1,338.00

$1,044.25

$1,044.25

$ 281.25

$ 281.25

$ 90.00

$ 60.00

$ 60.00

$ 120.00

$ 30.00

$ 30.00

GT Distributors

Austin, TX

Manufacturer Item Number UNIT PRICE

No Bid

Def Tech

Safariland

Bianchi

Bianchi

Bianchi

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

5239 (1.47
0z.)

38-4-2HS

8007

8008

7307

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$

$

$

No Bid

8.93

19.31

8.54

7.31

11.58

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Extra Charges
/ Custom
Tailoring

Total Cost

$ -

$ 446.50

$ 386.20

$ 8540

$ 7310

$ 115.80

$ -

$ -

$ -

Tyler Uniform

Tyler, TX

Manufacturer Item Number UNIT PRICE

Blackinton

No Bid

Safariland

Bianchi

Bianchi

Safariland

Neese

Premier

No Bid

No Bid

Flying Cross

Gildan

5.11

Devon &
Jones

Devon &
Jones

5.11

5.11

Fechheimer

Fechheimer UD49330-WT

No Bid

No Bid

38-4-2HS

8007

8008

4271-3-4BL

447RC3M

P9o008

No Bid

No Bid

85R7086Z

OB11

D100

D100W

71158

72158

UD49330

No Bid

$ 12.00
No Bid
$ 3200
$ 15.00
$ 13.00
$ 14.00
$ 6200
$ 6.00
$ 5.00
No Bid
No Bid
$ 5200
$  29.00
$ 55.00
$  26.00
$  26.00
$  49.00
$  49.00
$ 56.00
$ 56.00
$ 4.50
No Bid
$ 3.00
$ 3.00
$ 3.00
$ 5.50

Extra Charges
/ Custom Total Cost

Tailoring

$ 60.00

$ 640.00

$ 150.00

$ 130.00

$ 140.00

$1,240.00

$ 12.00

$ 100.00

$ 520.00

$ 725.00

$6,875.00

$ 650.00

$ 650.00

$1,225.00

$1,225.00

$ 280.00

$ 280.00

$ 135.00

$ 60.00

$ 120.00

$ 30.00

$ 55.00
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City of McKinney Bid Name: Police Uniform Accessories |
Bid Tabulation Bid No.: 12-18FP
Bid Date: April 19, 2012
GST Public Safety Supply GT Distributors Tyler Uniform
Grand Prairie, TX Austin, TX Tyler, TX
Item Extra Charges Extra Charges Extra Charges
N DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE | /Custom Total Cost UNIT PRICE | /Custom Total Cost UNIT PRICE | /Custom Total Cost
0. Tailoring Tailoring Tailoring
109 'Shoulder loop - velcro - Dallas Police blue with yellow stripes 10 GST $ 3.00 $ 30.00 No Bid $ No Bid $ -
110 Shoulder loop - velcro - gold 10 GST $ 3.00 $ 30.00 No Bid $ $ 4.50 $ 45.00
111 | Shoulder loop - velcro - green 20 GST $ 3.00 $ 60.00 No Bid $ $ 4.50 $ 90.00
112 'Shoulder loop - velcro - red 30 GST $ 3.00 $ 90.00 No Bid $ $ 4.50 $ 135.00
113 Stripes - Corporal - Gold 100 GST $ 2.95 $ 295.00 No Bid $ $ 4.50 $ 450.00
114 Stripes - Corporal - subdued 100 GST $ 2.95 $ 295.00 No Bid $ $ 4.50 $ 450.00
115 Stripes - Sergeant - Gold 100 GST $ 2.95 $ 295.00 No Bid $ $ 4.50 $ 450.00
116 Stripes - Sergeant - subdued 100 GST $ 2.95 $ 295.00 No Bid $ $ 4.50 $ 450.00
117 Sweater - Black button down - Dispatch logo 15 6300 $ 3125 $ 1000 $ 618.75 No Bid $ $ 4200 $ 630.00
118 Sweatshirt - long sleeve - 1/4 zip 23.50 $ 235.00 No Bid $ $ 23.00 $ 230.00
119 Sweatshirt - long sleeve - pullover 10 Jerzee 562 $ 9.39 $ 93.90 No Bid $ $ 10.00 $ 100.00
) 26524 & .
120 TASER X26 Yellow XDPM No Bid $ - TASER 44952 $ 844.95 $16,899.00 No Bid $ -
121 TASER Blade-Tech Tek-Lok Holster No Bid $ - TASER AT-44952  $ 3295 $ 659.00 No Bid $ -
122 TASER X26 Extended Digital Power Magazine No Bid $ - TASER AT-26701 $ 38.95 $1,947.50 No Bid $ -
123 TASER M26/X26 Extra Penetration 25-Foot Cartridge No Bid $ - TASER AT-44203  $ 24.95 $2,495.00 No Bid $ -
124 |Tie - Uniform - Black 20 90043 $ 3.59 $ No Bid $ 5.50 $ 110.00
126 Vest - carrier 5 R20-D $ 119.14 $ 187.49 $ 165.00 $ 825.00
Vest - Police Safety Vest, Hi-Vis Yellow, Black Trim, Lettering Spiewak S912 $ 3706 $ 16.75 No Bid $  47.00 $ 940.00
Delivery of items will be made within 30 Delivery of items will be made within 30- Delivery of items will be made within 15-
TOTAL OF ALL CONTRACTED ITEMS = $102,803.02 working days of receipt of purchase ~ $ 42,172.75 | 60 working days of receipt of purchase $ 47,206.27 | 20 working days of receipt of purchase $ 13,424.00
order. order. order.
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