
Total Price $478,285.06 Total Price $1,424,570.00 Total Price ########### Total Price ########### Total Price ########### Total Price ########### Total Price ########### Total Price ###########

Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
Medians (Refer to Minimum 

Specifications in Attributes Tab) 1 EA No Bid ######### $458,100.00 $416,290.00 $416,290.00 $458,799.00 $458,799.00 $722,208.00 $722,208.00 $628,497.40 $628,497.40 ########### ########### $510,830.00 $510,830.00

1.1
Airport Entrance - medians and right of 

ways to include control tower area (from 

FM 546 east to control tower) 52 EA $100.00 $85.00 $92.99 $100.00 $168.60 $219.00 $110.00

1.2
Airport Road  Hwy 380 south to 3 

medians south of FM 546 @ Simpson 

Strong Tie 52 EA $500.00 $475.00 $512.09 $526.00 $641.60 $1,205.00 $542.00

1.3
Alma Road  Hwy 121 north to Fire Station 

8 52 EA $150.00 $150.00 $146.71 $275.00 $206.24 $346.00 $156.00

1.4
Bloomdale Road  Community east to 1 

median past Shawnee 52 EA $45.00 $25.00 $30.00 $185.00 $29.70 $56.00 $40.00
1.5 Cedar Elm- Ash Lane west (3 medians) 52 EA $45.00 $15.00 $30.00 $50.00 $16.45 $32.00 $30.00

1.6
Collin McKinney Parkway  Custer east to 

Boston Lane * Currently maintained by 

HOA 52 EA $65.00 $60.00 $65.86 $90.00 $95.75 $155.00 $70.00

1.7
Collin McKinney Parkway  Alma east to 

Lake Forest 52 EA $320.00 $300.00 $325.49 $432.00 $429.27 $766.00 $350.00

1.8
Community Drive- 1 median north of Hwy 

380 52 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $12.00 $15.00 $15.00 $35.00
1.9 Corporate Drive  1 median @ Redbud 26 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $35.00

1.10
Custer Road  Stonebridge Drive north to 

Hwy 380Corporate Drive  1 median @ 

Redbud - Additional median, Custer Road - 

HWY 121 north to Stonebridge Dr. 52 EA $110.00 $100.00 $102.00 $339.00 $139.31 $240.00 $120.00

1.11
Dogwood Trail- Virginia Pkwy. South to 

Shadow Lane (Push Mower Only) 26 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $73.00 $46.39 $16.00 $60.00

1.12
Eldorado Parkway- Hwy 5/McDonald St. 

west to U.S. 75 52 EA $250.00 $200.00 $221.04 $316.00 $332.47 $521.00 $250.00

1.13

Eldorado Parkway-U.S. 75 west to Ridge 

Road (exclude last median before 

Ridge).Eldorado Parkway- Hwy 

5/McDonald St. west to U.S. 75 52 EA $625.00 $575.00 $604.48 $714.00 $1,189.58 $1,423.00 $640.00

1.14
Gateway Blvd.  Medical Center Dr. west 

to Hwy 75 frontage road 52 EA $45.00 $575.00 $604.48 $27.00 $757.37 $1,423.00 $640.00

1.15
Graves St.- Rockhill Road south (1 

median) 26 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $20.00 $15.00 $15.00 $40.00

1.16
High Point Blvd.- Taylor- Burke Road 

north (1 median) 26 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $21.00 $15.00 $15.00 $40.00

1.17
Hardin Blvd.  Virginia South to Hwy 121 

SRT 52 EA $500.00 $450.00 $493.21 $752.00 $723.68 $1,161.00 $540.00

1.18

Hardin  Virginia north to dead end, north 

of Wilmeth Road, this includes west side 

ROW (2, 100) of Hardin north of Wilmeth 

for future Hardin south bound lanes. 

Wilmeth north side ROW, west of Hardin 

for 1,800 for future Wilmeth west bound 

lanes. 52 EA $525.00 $500.00 $543.02 $790.00 $680.36 $1,278.00 $580.00

1.19
Hudson Crossing 1 median south of 

Eldorado Parkway 52 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $14.00 $15.00 $15.00 $35.00

1.20
Industrial Blvd.-McDonald St. east to F.M. 

546 52 EA $90.00 $75.00 $76.24 $166.00 $54.05 $180.00 $70.00

1.21

Lake Forest Dr.- Virginia Pkwy. North to 

Bloomdale Rd. (includes Farleyville lot on 

west side of Lake Forest and east bridge 

ROW on Bloomdale) 52 EA $500.00 $450.00 $481.59 $675.00 $603.39 $1,134.00 $510.00

1.22
Lake Forest Dr. - Eldorado Pkwy. South to 

Hwy 121/ SRT 52 EA $400.00 $385.00 $409.06 $476.00 $512.52 $963.00 $432.00

1.23
Louisiana/Virginia St.- U.S. 75 east to turn 

around (turf in front of raised bed  bed 

included) 52 EA $45.00 $15.00 $30.00 $27.00 $26.11 $34.00 $40.00

1.24
McDonald St.-Eldorado Pkwy. South to 

Old Mill Rd. 26 EA $45.00 $20.00 $30.00 $28.00 $51.75 $45.00 $45.00

1.25
McDonald St. at Louisiana St (1 median 

north, 2 medians south) 52 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $25.00 $15.00 $15.00 $35.00

1.26
South McDonald St at Tennessee St. (3 

medians) 52 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $49.00 $15.00 $18.00 $35.00

1.27
North McDonald - 3 medians north of 

Hwy 380 and 1 median south of 380 26 EA $45.00 $25.00 $30.00 $50.00 $31.75 $60.00 $55.00

1.28

McKinney Ranch Parkway  1 median east 

of Hardin west to Ridge Road includes 

north ROW from Kathryn to Columbus 

and Ridge south to Stacy 52 EA $525.00 $475.00 $492.38 $739.00 $663.44 $1,159.00 $522.00

1.29
Medical Center Dr.-Eldorado Pkwy. South 

to Hwy. 5 52 EA $90.00 $85.00 $92.65 $199.00 $116.11 $218.00 $100.00

1.30
North Brook Drive- U.S. 75 west (2 

medians) 26 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $20.00 $15.00 $15.00 $70.00

1.31
Redbud Blvd.- Hwy 380 north to 

Bloomdale Road and (all medians) 52 EA $80.00 $50.00 $59.03 $274.00 $73.96 $139.00 $120.00

1.32
Ridge Road  Eldorado south to Stacy Road 52 EA $340.00 $325.00 $340.00 $455.00 $513.83 $800.00 $360.00

1.33
Ridge Road  Virginia 3rd median north of 

bridge north to Hwy 380 52 EA $230.00 $225.00 $237.13 $400.00 $370.30 $558.00 $252.00

1.34
Silverado Trail  McKinney Ranch Parkway 

west to end of medians at bridge before 

Custer 52 EA $105.00 $10.00 $105.37 $364.00 $132.02 $248.00 $112.00
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1.35 Stacy Road  Hwy 121 NW to Custer 52 EA $470.00 $450.00 $463.25 $609.00 $580.41 $1,090.00 $492.00

1.36
Stewart Rd.  Hwy 5 west to Medical 

Center Drive 52 EA $45.00 $20.00 $30.00 $74.00 $26.62 $50.00 $45.00
1.37 Tennessee St. at Midway 52 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $13.00 $15.00 $15.00 $40.00

1.38
Tennessee St.- University Dr. north to 

McDonald St 26 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $40.00 $15.00 $25.00 $40.00

1.39
University Dr., Hwy 380.- U.S. 75 east to 

New Hope Rd. 52 EA $140.00 $110.00 $116.17 $357.00 $145.55 $274.00 $132.00

1.40
University Dr., Hwy 380.- U.S. 75 west to 

Red Bud Drive 52 EA $200.00 $150.00 $166.77 $435.00 $208.94 $393.00 $177.00

1.41
University Dr., Hwy 380 at McDonald 

St./Hwy. 5 (2 triangle shape medians at 

turn lanes) 26 EA $45.00 $20.00 $30.00 $69.00 $24.51 $47.00 $45.00

1.42

Virginia Pkwy- U.S. 75 west to 

Stonebridge medians and Perrigrine west 

to Hagen (includes lot east of Forkhorn 

west of auto repair shop) 52 EA $450.00 $425.00 $437.75 $692.00 $637.94 $1,030.00 $453.00

1.43
Voltaire Blvd.-Eldorado Pkwy. South to 

end of medians 52 EA $60.00 $60.00 $60.88 $179.00 $76.28 $144.00 $70.00

1.44
West Park Dr.- Virginia Pkwy. South to 

Lakeview Circle 26 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $21.00 $15.00 $15.00 $35.00
1.45 White St.- U.S. 75 west to Hardin 52 EA $105.00 $100.00 $103.13 $325.00 $129.22 $243.00 $110.00

1.46
Wilmeth Road- Lake Forest west to 

Ridgeknoll Ave 52 EA $90.00 $100.00 $96.43 $270.00 $120.82 $227.00 $105.00

1.47
Wilmeth Road- Hardin, east to Hwy 5 

(includes small portion of south right of 

way at Community, near white rail fence) 52 EA $200.00 $175.00 $186.51 $541.00 $233.68 $439.00 $200.00

1.48
Wilson Creek Pkwy.- Kentucky St. west to 

Rockhill (includes 1 median on Big Bend) 

Push Mow Only 52 EA $50.00 $50.00 $48.58 $135.00 $334.75 $115.00 $50.00

1.49
Wilson Creek Pkwy at College St. (2 

medians) 52 EA $45.00 $30.00 $30.00 $76.00 $37.95 $72.00 $40.00

1.50
Laud Howell  Hwy 75 north to Trinity Falls 52 EA $90.00 $10.00 $82.93 $193.00 $37.95 $196.00 $100.00

1.51

Sheraton parking lot, east side and Go 

Taps parking lot medians/areas Coit Road- 

Buckeye north to Westridge/Panther 

Creek 52 EA $80.00 $40.00 $42.50 $109.00 $82.06 $100.00 $50.00

1.52
Coit Road- Buckeye north to 

Westridge/Panther Creek 52 EA $90.00 $75.00 $85.00 $179.00 $106.50 $200.00 $90.00

1.53
U.S. Hwy 380  Red Bud Dr. east to Custer 

Rd. 52 EA $75.00 $30.00 $32.59 $88.00 $40.83 $77.00 $45.00
1.54 Virginia (3) Medians 52 EA $60.00 $60.00 $60.34 $99.00 $75.61 $142.00 $100.00
1.55 Independence (2) Medians 52 EA $55.00 $50.00 $53.08 $89.00 $66.50 $125.00 $90.00
1.56 Spur 399 Medians 52 EA $280.00 $250.00 $280.02 $723.00 $408.46 $659.00 $300.00

1.57
Eight )8) Parking Lot Islands between Corp 

3 Hanger and Terminal at McKinney 

National Airport 52 EA $55.00 $75.00 $42.50 $55.00 $50.82 $15.00 $130.00

1.58
6048 Co Ro 124 (NW corner of Wilmeth 

Rd and Future Ridge Road) 12 EA $150.00 $100.00 $42.50 $20.00 $53.25 $15.00 $200.00

2
RIGHT-OF-WAYS (Refer to Minimum 

Specifications in Attributes Tab) 1 EA No Bid $96,590.00 $96,590.00 $43,940.00 $43,940.00 $64,822.68 $64,822.68 $87,438.00 $87,438.00 $90,946.70 $90,946.70 $83,668.00 $83,668.00 $77,532.00 $77,532.00

2.1
Eldorado Parkway- Country Club Dr. west 

to Candide Dr. Southside 18W x 1.4 Miles 

(includes 1 median east of C.C) 52 EA $65.00 $55.00 $59.48 $115.00 $80.29 $108.00 $120.00

2.2
Eldorado Parkway- Candide Dr. west to 

Tom Thumb property 52 EA $45.00 $45.00 $46.75 $95.00 $58.57 $85.00 $95.00

2.3 Wilmeth Rd.- U. S. 75 west to Community 

Drive (Northside 15 W x .3 Miles) 26 EA $45.00 $25.00 $30.00 $47.00 $29.29 $43.00 $47.00

2.4 Wilmeth Rd.- U. S. 75 west to Community 

Drive (Southside 15 W x .3 Miles) 26 EA $45.00 $25.00 $30.00 $47.00 $29.29 $43.00 $47.00

2.5
Industrial Blvd. (Pecan Memorial 

Cemetery Right of Way 26 EA $45.00 $20.00 $30.00 $35.00 $21.97 $32.00 $40.00

2.6
Industrial Blvd. Detention Basin @ 

Railroad Tracks 26 EA $90.00 $80.00 $85.00 $150.00 $106.50 $154.00 $170.00

2.7

Hardin Blvd. (Vistas and El dorado 

Crossing Property, commercial property 

south to MISD property west side and to 

one house lot south of Brittany west side) 

adjacent to vinyl fence 52 EA $45.00 $35.00 $35.08 $71.00 $43.95 $64.00 $70.00

2.8
McDonald St. at Old Central Fire Station, 

Both east and west Sides 52 EA $45.00 $10.00 $30.00 $11.00 $15.00 $15.00 $35.00

2.9
Lake Forest  west right of way from Hwy 

380 south to driveway of residence south 

of Wilson Creek bridge 52 EA $45.00 $25.00 $30.00 $47.00 $29.29 $43.00 $47.00

2.10 U.S. 75 @ U.S. 380- 4 landscaped corners 

and small turf areas, SE,SW,NE NW 52 EA $250.00 $115.00 $180.07 $175.00 $517.31 $218.00 $241.00

2.11 U.S. 75 @ Wilmeth 4- landscaped corners 

and small turf areas, SE,SW,NE  NW 52 EA $250.00 $60.00 $98.11 $100.00 $343.38 $119.00 $131.00
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2.12
U.S. 75  White Street south to Hwy 121 

SRT 52 EA $1,000.00 $425.00 $679.60 $928.00 $567.66 $821.00 $600.00

3 Park Sites and Future Park Sites (Refer to 

Minimum Specifications in Attributes Tab) 1 EA $436,020.00 $436,020.00 ######### $803,030.00 ########### ########### ########### ########### $962,422.00 $962,422.00 ########### ########### ########### ########### ########### ###########
3.1 Falcon Creek Park, 301 Perrigrine Dr. 52 EA $265.00 $265.00 $480.00 $420.00 $419.00 $533.57 $500.00 $660.00

3.2

Winniford Park, 4900 Highlands Dr.-Lake 

Forest Dr. south to McKinney Ranch 

Parkway. Includes hike and bike trail ROW 

south of McK. Ranch south to MISD 

property. 52 EA $570.00 $350.00 $600.00 $525.00 $462.00 $666.96 $625.00 $825.00
3.3 E. A. Randles Park, 5400 Cedar Elm Dr. 52 EA $185.00 $250.00 $400.00 $350.00 $457.00 $444.64 $417.00 $550.00

3.4
Cottonwood Creek Greenbelt- Woodson 

Rd. east to Ash Ln.  Ash east to Lake 

Forest 52 EA $350.00 $320.00 $560.00 $490.00 $564.00 $622.49 $584.00 $770.00
3.5 W. B. Finney Park, 6350 Glen Oaks Dr 52 EA $215.00 $250.00 $400.00 $350.00 $374.00 $444.64 $417.00 $550.00

3.6
Valley Creek Park, 2750 Valley Creek trail 52 EA $120.00 $120.00 $200.00 $175.00 $316.00 $222.32 $295.00 $275.00

3.7

Gabe Nesbitt Community Park, baseball  

softball complexes, tennis complex, skate 

park and McKinney Green Garden, PSA 

grounds and APEX Center 7001 Eldorado 

Parkway  3205 Alma Rd. 52 EA No Bid $2,900.00 $5,400.00 $4,725.00 $2,350.00 $6,362.80 $4,500.00 $5,400.00
3.8 Serenity Park, 6701 Berkshire South 52 EA $215.00 $250.00 $400.00 $350.00 $394.00 $444.64 $417.00 $550.00

3.9
A. Hardy Eubanks Park, 1501 Round hill 

Road 52 EA $215.00 $250.00 $300.00 $350.00 $464.00 $444.64 $412.00 $550.00
3.10 McKissick Park, 2702 Taylor-Burk Drive 52 EA $160.00 $160.00 $280.00 $245.00 $432.00 $311.25 $417.00 $385.00
3.11 Aviator Park, 1201 Monticello 52 EA $215.00 $250.00 $400.00 $350.00 $313.00 $444.64 $353.00 $550.00
3.12 Horizon Park, 401 Flatrock Drive 52 EA $135.00 $160.00 $240.00 $210.00 $320.00 $266.78 $417.00 $330.00
3.13 Ash Woods Park, 10301 JFK Blvd. 52 EA $185.00 $250.00 $400.00 $350.00 $422.00 $444.64 $417.00 $550.00
3.14 Inspiration Park, 4212 Shawnee Drive 52 EA $135.00 $250.00 $260.00 $350.00 $504.00 $444.64 $383.00 $550.00
3.15 Tom Allen Jr. Park, 3301 Bahnman 52 EA $155.00 $160.00 $260.00 $227.50 $303.00 $289.01 $834.00 $360.00
3.16 Rowlett Creek Park, 4200 Big Fork Trail 52 EA $260.00 $450.00 $800.00 $700.00 $631.00 $889.28 $417.00 $1,100.00

3.17
John Whisenant Park, 3700 Hudson 

Crossing 52 EA $135.00 $250.00 $400.00 $350.00 $411.00 $444.64 $417.00 $550.00

3.18
Jim Ledbetter Park, 3212 Bluewood Drive 52 EA $205.00 $250.00 $400.00 $350.00 $409.00 $444.64 $417.00 $550.00

3.19
Cary Cox Memorial Park, 1611 North 

Stonebridge Dr. 52 EA $235.00 $250.00 $400.00 $350.00 $393.00 $466.80 $417.00 $550.00

3.20
Waterford Lane and Castlewood Drive 

area on south and west side 52 EA $100.00 $60.00 $120.00 $105.00 $199.00 $133.39 $375.00 $165.00

3.21
Bonnie Wenk Park  ROW on both north 

and south sides of Virginia on both sides 

east and west of Wilson Creek 52 EA No Bid $450.00 $800.00 $700.00 $614.00 $944.69 $834.00 $1,100.00

3.22
Crape Myrtle World Collection, 6452 

Collin McKinney Parkway 52 EA No Bid $300.00 $275.00 $238.00 $514.00 $388.04 $400.00 $370.00

3.23
Flour Mill city parking lot, east of Hwy 5 

between Virginia and Louisiana adjacent 

to railroad tracks and Flour Mill 26 EA $100.00 $75.00 $100.00 $35.00 $92.00 $19.06 $185.00 $300.00
3.24 George Webb, Mill Bend and Eden 52 EA $345.00 $425.00 $675.00 $584.50 $574.00 $766.30 $696.00 $920.00
3.25 Dr. Mack Hill Park, 1849 Reagan Drive 52 EA $390.00 $400.00 $675.00 $584.50 $530.00 $789.81 $696.00 $920.00

3.26
Robinson Ridge, Muscadine Drive (see 

attachment map) 52 EA $340.00 $400.00 $675.00 $584.50 $518.00 $742.55 $696.00 $920.00

3.27 Creekview Estates Parkland  Fieldcrest Dr. 

@ Lake Forest (see attachment map) 52 EA $800.00 $600.00 $1,080.00 $945.00 $730.00 $1,200.52 $900.00 $1,480.00

3.28
Prestwick Estates (see attachment map) 52 EA $195.00 $250.00 $400.00 $350.00 $316.00 $444.64 $417.00 $550.00

3.29
Greens of McKinney, Eldorado Pkwy 

south to Stewart Road (see attachment 

map) 52 EA $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,090.50 $1,400.00 $3,926.16 $2,944.00 $4,700.00

3.30
McKinney Greens (see attachment map) 52 EA $145.00 $125.00 $200.00 $164.50 $122.00 $208.98 $277.00 $260.00

3.31 Finch 52 EA No Bid $700.00 $1,300.00 $1,134.00 $769.00 $1,440.63 $1,080.00 $1,780.00
3.32 Towne Lake 52 EA No Bid $1,100.00 $2,000.00 $1,750.00 $593.00 $2,250.11 $1,667.00 $2,750.00
3.33 Hill Top 52 Every 2 Weeks $250.00 $225.00 $400.00 $357.00 $336.00 $453.53 $425.00 $600.00
3.34 Craig Ranch 52 EA No Bid $700.00 $1,080.00 $945.00 $871.00 $1,200.52 $900.00 $1,480.00

3.35
Reserve at Westridge Park Lot 1, Block A 

(next to Furr Elementary located at 551 S 

Bluestem Dr, McKinney, TX 75070) 12 EA No Bid $175.00 $300.00 $262.50 $267.00 $333.48 $442.00 $500.00

3.36
Mary Will Craig Park 2701 Bois D'Arc 

Road 52 EA $245.00 $220.00 $400.00 $350.00 $316.00 $444.64 $417.00 $550.00
3.37 City Gun Range 26 EA $140.00 $50.00 $60.00 $52.50 $121.00 $66.70 $188.00 $100.00

4 Fire Stations and Public Safety (Refer to 

Minimum Specifications in Attributes Tab) 1 EA No Bid $66,820.00 $66,820.00 $48,880.00 $48,880.00 $49,920.00 $49,920.00 $106,184.00 $106,184.00 $78,073.32 $78,073.32 $277,628.00 $277,628.00 $83,980.00 $83,980.00

4.1
McKinney Public Safety, 2200 Taylor-

Burke Drive 52 EA $260.00 $200.00 $200.00 $435.00 $321.68 $589.00 $275.00

4.2
Old Central Fire Station, 131 Chestnut 

Street, includes parking lot medians/ROW 

on McDonald Street 52 EA $45.00 $20.00 $40.00 $43.00 $32.17 $250.00 $80.00

4.3
Fire Station # 3, (includes Taylor Park), 

4269 Eldorado 52 EA $90.00 $80.00 $80.00 $174.00 $120.03 $500.00 $120.00
4.4 Fire Station # 4, 2001 Industrial Blvd. 52 EA $90.00 $60.00 $60.00 $130.00 $90.74 $375.00 $110.00
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4.5
Fire Station # 5, 6600 West Virginia 

Parkway 52 EA $90.00 $60.00 $60.00 $130.00 $96.73 $375.00 $110.00

4.6
Fire Station # 6, 1890 market Place Drive 52 EA $90.00 $60.00 $60.00 $130.00 $90.74 $375.00 $110.00

4.7
Fire Station # 7, 861 Independence 

Parkway 52 EA $90.00 $60.00 $60.00 $130.00 $90.74 $375.00 $110.00
4.8 Fire Station # 8, 3445 Alma 52 EA $90.00 $80.00 $80.00 $174.00 $120.03 $500.00 $140.00
4.9 Fire Station # 9 Lake Forest 52 EA $90.00 $40.00 $40.00 $87.00 $76.67 $250.00 $95.00

4.10
Fire Station # 10, 1150 Olympic Crossing, 

McKinney, TX 75071. 52 EA $90.00 $40.00 $40.00 $87.00 $75.86 $250.00 $95.00

4.11
Future Fire Station Site West Side of 

Hardin Boulevard, Approximately 500 feet 

North of Virginia 52 EA $130.00 $120.00 $120.00 $261.00 $193.01 $750.00 $185.00

4.12
Future Fire Station Site in Craig Ranch on 

VanTuyl, See attached map 52 EA $130.00 $120.00 $120.00 $261.00 $193.01 $750.00 $185.00

5
Fertilizer (Refer to Minimum 

Specifications in Attributes Tab) 1 EA $42,246.06 $42,246.06 No Bid $177,112.50 $177,112.50 $311,308.63 $311,308.63 $237,882.00 $237,882.00 $117,067.08 $117,067.08 No Bid $492,139.00 $492,139.00

5.1
Airport Entrance - medians and right of 

ways to include control tower area (from 

FM 546 east to control tower) 3 EA No Bid $375.00 $498.86 $381.00 $170.64 $810.00

5.2
Alma Road - Hwy 121 North to Fire 

Station 8 3 EA No Bid $600.00 $787.08 $601.00 $269.23 $1,260.00

5.3
Dogwood Trail- Virginia Pkwy. South to 

Shadow Lane (Push Mower Only) 3 EA No Bid $50.00 $36.12 $27.00 $15.00 $90.00

5.4
Eldorado Parkway- Hwy 5/McDonald St. 

west to U.S. 75 3 EA No Bid $875.00 $1,185.80 $906.00 $405.62 $1,872.00

5.5
Hardin Blvd.  Virginia South to Hwy 121 

SRT 3 EA No Bid $2,000.00 $2,645.93 $2,022.00 $905.08 $4,177.00

5.6
Lake Forest Dr. - Eldorado Pkwy. South to 

Hwy 121/ SRT 3 EA No Bid $1,750.00 $2,194.51 $1,677.00 $750.67 $3,465.00

5.7
Louisiana/Virginia St.- U.S. 75 east to turn 

around (turf in front of raised bed  bed 

included) 3 EA No Bid $75.00 $77.43 $59.00 $26.49 $180.00

5.8
University Dr., Hwy 380 at McDonald 

St./Hwy. 5 (2 triangle shape medians at 

turn lanes) 3 EA No Bid $100.00 $104.96 $80.00 $35.90 $225.00

5.9
Voltaire Blvd.-Eldorado Pkwy. South to 

end of medians 3 EA No Bid $250.00 $326.61 $249.00 $111.72 $515.00

5.10
Eldorado Parkway- Country Club Dr. west 

to Candide Dr. Southside 18W x 1.4 Miles 

(includes 1 median east of C.C) 3 EA No Bid $250.00 $319.11 $243.00 $109.16 $503.00

5.11
Eldorado Parkway- Candide Dr. west to 

Tom Thumb property 3 EA No Bid $200.00 $250.80 $191.00 $85.79 $396.00

5.12
Eldorado Parkway- Candide Dr. west to 

Tom Thumb property 3 EA No Bid $200.00 $250.80 $191.00 $85.79 $396.00

5.13

Winniford Park, 4900 Highlands Dr.-Lake 

Forest Dr. south to McKinney Ranch 

Parkway. Includes hike and bike trail ROW 

south of McK. Ranch south to MISD 

property. 3 EA $1,028.25 $2,500.00 $3,420.00 $2,613.00 $1,169.87 $5,400.00
5.14 Falcon Creek Park, 301 Perrigrine Dr. 3 EA $822.60 $200.00 $2,736.00 $2,090.00 $935.89 $4,320.00
5.15 E. A. Randles Park, 5400 Cedar Elm Dr. 3 EA $685.50 $1,750.00 $2,280.00 $1,742.00 $779.91 $3,600.00
5.16 W. B. Finney Park, 6350 Glen Oaks Dr 3 EA $685.50 $150.00 $2,280.00 $1,742.00 $779.91 $3,600.00

5.17
Valley Creek Park, 2750 Valley Creek trail 3 EA $342.75 $1,000.00 $1,140.00 $871.00 $389.96 $1,800.00

5.18

Gabe Nesbitt Community Park, baseball  

softball complexes, tennis complex, skate 

park and McKinney Green Garden, PSA 

grounds and APEX Center 7001 Eldorado 

Parkway  3205 Alma Rd. 3 EA No Bid $1,500.00 $21,888.00 $16,727.00 $10,528.81 $34,560.00
5.19 Serenity Park, 6701 Berkshire South 3 EA $685.50 $1,750.00 $2,280.00 $1,742.00 $779.91 $3,600.00

5.20
A. Hardy Eubanks Park, 1501 Round hill 

Road 3 EA $685.50 $1,750.00 $2,280.00 $1,742.00 $779.91 $3,600.00
5.21 McKissick Park, 2702 Taylor-Burk Drive 3 EA $479.85 $1,250.00 $1,596.00 $1,219.00 $545.94 $2,520.00
5.22 Aviator Park, 1201 Monticello 3 EA $685.50 $1,750.00 $2,280.00 $1,742.00 $779.91 $3,600.00
5.23 Horizon Park, 401 Flatrock Drive 3 EA $411.30 $1,000.00 $1,368.00 $1,045.00 $467.95 $2,160.00
5.24 Ash Woods Park, 10301 JFK Blvd. 3 EA $685.50 $1,750.00 $2,280.00 $1,742.00 $779.91 $3,600.00
5.25 Inspiration Park, 4212 Shawnee Drive 3 EA $685.50 $1,750.00 $2,280.00 $1,742.00 $779.91 $3,600.00
5.26 Tom Allen Jr. Park, 3301 Bahnman 3 EA $445.58 $1,100.00 $1,482.00 $1,132.00 $506.94 $2,340.00
5.27 Rowlett Creek Park, 4200 Big Fork Trail 3 EA $1,371.00 $3,250.00 $4,560.00 $3,484.00 $1,559.82 $7,200.00

5.28
John Whisenant Park, 3700 Hudson 

Crossing 3 EA $685.50 $1,750.00 $2,280.00 $1,742.00 $779.91 $3,600.00

5.29
Cary Cox Memorial Park, 1611 North 

Stonebridge Dr. 3 EA $685.50 $1,750.00 $2,280.00 $1,742.00 $779.91 $3,600.00

5.30
Bonnie Wenk Park, 2996 Virginia Parkway 3 EA No Bid $3,500.00 $4,560.00 $3,484.00 $1,559.82 $7,200.00

5.31
Crape Myrtle World Collection, 6452 

Collin McKinney Parkway 3 EA No Bid $1,075.00 $1,550.40 $1,184.00 $530.34 $2,448.00
5.32 George Webb, Mill Bend and Eden 3 EA $1,144.79 $2,750.00 $3,807.60 $2,909.00 $1,302.45 $6,012.00
5.33 Dr. Mack Hill Park, 1849 Reagan Drive 3 EA $1,144.79 $2,750.00 $3,807.60 $2,909.00 $1,302.45 $6,012.00
5.34 Towne Lake 3 EA No Bid $7,250.00 $10,260.00 $7,840.00 $3,899.56 $16,200.00
5.35 Hill Top 3 EA $699.21 $1,650.00 $2,325.60 $1,777.00 $795.51 $3,672.00
5.36 Craig Ranch 3 EA No Bid $4,500.00 $6,156.00 $4,704.00 $2,105.76 $9,720.00

5.37
McKinney Public Safety, 2200 Taylor-

Burke Drive 3 EA No Bid $800.00 $1,140.00 $871.00 $389.96 $1,800.00
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Total Price $478,285.06 Total Price $1,424,570.00 Total Price ########### Total Price ########### Total Price ########### Total Price ########### Total Price ########### Total Price ###########

Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

Yellowstone Landscape LLC Good Earth SRH Landscapes LLCDWW Golf Management LLC/DWW Landscaping (David Willey) Lawn Star Landscape Holland Right of Way, LLC Incircle Management Inc BrightView Landscape Services Inc.

5.38
Fire Station # 3, (includes Taylor Park), 

4269 Eldorado 3 EA No Bid $325.00 $456.00 $348.00 $155.98 $720.00
5.39 Fire Station # 4, 2001 Industrial Blvd. 3 EA No Bid $250.00 $342.00 $261.00 $116.99 $540.00

5.40
Fire Station # 5, 6600 West Virginia 

Parkway 3 EA No Bid $250.00 $342.00 $261.00 $116.99 $540.00

5.41
Fire Station # 6, 1890 market Place Drive 3 EA No Bid $250.00 $342.00 $261.00 $116.99 $540.00

5.42
Fire Station # 7, 861 Independence 

Parkway 3 EA No Bid $250.00 $342.00 $261.00 $116.99 $540.00
5.43 Fire Station # 8, 3445 Alma 3 EA No Bid $325.00 $456.00 $348.00 $155.98 $720.00
5.44 Fire Station # 9 Lake Forest 3 EA No Bid $200.00 $228.00 $174.00 $77.99 $360.00

5.45
Fire Station # 10, 1150 Olympic Crossing, 

McKinney, TX 75071 3 EA No Bid $200.00 $228.00 $174.00 $77.99 $360.00
5.46 Spring Fertilizer 1 Per Bag $12.20 $27.50 $35.00 $42.00 $140.75 $65.00
5.47 Summer Fertilizer 1 Per Bag $37.75 $50.00 $45.00 $42.00 $140.75 $90.00
5.48 Fall Fertilizer 1 Per Bag $17.25 $35.00 $35.00 $42.00 $33.95 $65.00

6 Litter Control 1 HR $19.00 $19.00 $30.00 $30.00 $42.50 $42.50 $29.00 $29.00 $50.00 $50.00 $35.00 $35.00 $45.00 $45.00 $35.00 $35.00
6.1 Litter Control 1 HR $19.00 $30.00 $42.50 $29.00 $50.00 $35.00 $45.00 $35.00
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