Bid No. 13-19FP Traffic Signal Poles
Opening Date: 7/25/2013

No Powder Coat

Paradigm Traffic Systems - Arlington, TX

Structural & Steel Products - Fort Worth, TX

Item [Description Units Qty Unit Cost Extended Cost Days Qty Unit Cost Extended Cost Days
1 [Pedestrian Poles, 14’ pole Each 2 $ 242.00| $ 484.00 30-45 2 $ 618.00| $ 1,236.00 84
2 |CCTV Camera Poles 30’ pole, no luminaire Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 $ 4,406.00| $ 8,812.00 84
3 |CCTV Camera Poles 40’ pole, no luminaire Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 $ 4,971.00( $ 9,942.00 84
4 |Strain Pole (SP), 30’ pole, 8’ luminaire arm Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 $ 2,973.00| $ 5,946.00 84
5 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 24'round arm, 30" | g o 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |3 4,399.00| $ 8,798.00| 84
pole, no luminaire

g |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 24"round arm, 30" | - g 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |3 4,623.00| $ 9,246.00| 84
pole, 8’ luminaire arm

7 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 32'round arm, 30" | g 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |3 4,583.00| $ 9,166.00| 84
pole, no luminaire

g |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 32"round arm, 30" | - g 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |3 4,809.00| $ 9,618.00| 84
pole, 8’ luminaire arm

g |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 40"round arm, 30"| 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |3 5020.00| $  10058.00| 84
pole, no luminaire

10 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 40" round arm, 30" | 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |3 525500| $  10,510.00| 84
pole, 8’ luminaire arm

11 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 48" round arm, 30| ) 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |3 6,15800| $  12316.00| 84
pole, no luminaire

12 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 48’ round arm, 30 Each 6 No Bid No Bid 6 |$ 6,384.00| $ 38,304.00 84
pole, 8’ luminaire arm

13 |tong Mast Arm (LMA), 55" arm, 30" pole , Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |'$ 18,303.00| $ 36,606.00 84
no luminaire

14 |-ong MastArm (LMA), 55"arm, 30" pole , 8 6 No Bid No Bid 6 |$ 1856400\ $  111,384.00| 84
luminaire arm

15 |tong Mast Arm (LMA), 65" arm, 30" pole , Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |'$ 18,536.00| $ 37,072.00 84
no luminaire

16 |-ongMastArm (LMA), 65°arm, 30" pole, 8 ¢ 2 No Bid No Bid 2 |s 18,803.00 | $ 37,606.00 84
luminaire arm
Total $ 484.00 $ 356,620.00




Bid No. 13-19FP Traffic Signal Poles

Opening Date:

7/25/2013

Powder Coat

Paradigm Traffic Systems - Arlington, TX

Structural & Steel Products - Fort Worth, TX

Item [Description Units QTY Unit Cost Extended Cost Days QTY Unit Cost Extended Cost Days
1 [Pedestrian Poles, 14’ pole Each 4 $ 375.00| $ 1,500.00 30-45 4 711.00| $ 2,844.00 84
2 |CCTV Camera Poles 30’ pole, no luminaire Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 4,835.00( $ 9,670.00 84
3 |CCTV Camera Poles 40’ pole, no luminaire Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 5,862.00| $ 11,724.00 84
4 |Strain Pole (SP), 30’ pole, 8 luminaire arm Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 3,356.00| $ 6,712.00 84
5 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 24'round arm, 30" | g o 2 No Bid No Bid 2 4,832.00| $ 9,664.00 84
pole, no luminaire

g |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 24 round arm, 30 Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 5,222.00| $ 10,444.00 84
pole, 8’ luminaire arm

7 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 32'round arm, 30" | g 2 No Bid No Bid 2 5,105.00 | $ 10,210.00 84
pole, no luminaire

g |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 32" round arm, 30 Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 5,497.00 | $ 10,994.00 84
pole, 8’ luminaire arm

g |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 40"round arm, 30"| 2 No Bid No Bid 2 5,611.00 | $ 11,222.00 84
pole, no luminaire

10 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 40" round arm, 30 Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 6,002.00 | $ 12,004.00 84
pole, 8’ luminaire arm

11 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 48" round arm, 30| ) 2 No Bid No Bid 2 6,799.00 | $ 13,598.00 84
pole, no luminaire

12 |Single Mast Arm (SMA), 48’ round arm, 30 Each 2 No Bid No Bid 5 7,183.00| $ 35,915.00 84
pole, 8’ luminaire arm

13 |-ong MastArm (LMA), 55"arm, 30" pole , Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 20,308.00 | $ 40,616.00 84
no luminaire

14 |-ong MastArm (LMA), 55"arm, 30" pole , 8 2 No Bid No Bid 2 21,206.00 | $ 42,412.00 84
luminaire arm

15 [-ong MastArm (LMA), 65"arm, 30" pole , Each 2 No Bid No Bid 2 20,929.00 | $ 41,858.00 84
no luminaire

16 |-ong MastAm (LMA), 65"arm, 30 pole , 8 2 No Bid No Bid 2 21,572.00| $ 43,144.00 84
luminaire arm
Total $ 313,031.00
Grand Total (No Powder Coat Total +
Powder Coat Total) $1,500.00 $ 669,651.00




