
City of McKinne Bid Tabulation
06-49FP EMS Supplies

SECTION II. MEDICINE
Medication Price UOM Cse Qty Cse Price Price UOM Cse Qty Cse Price Price UOM Cse Qty Cse Price Price UOM Cse Qty Cse Price Price UOM Cse Qty Cse Price Price UOM Cse Qty
1. Adenosine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.79$        Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 61.75$        Each No Bid
2. Albuterol .083% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.14$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.83$          Box / 25 qty No Bid
3. Amiodarone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.18$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.85$          Each No Bid
4. Aspirin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.65$          BTL NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.74$          Each No Bid
5. Atropine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.75$          Each NA NA 3.98$          Each 10 39.75$        7.40$          Each No Bid
6. Dextrose 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.16$          Each NA NA 6.04$          Each 10 60.42$        9.37$          Each No Bid
7. Diphenhydramine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.92$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.34$          Each No Bid
8. Epinephrine 1:1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.500$        Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.61$          Each No Bid
9. Epinephrine 1:1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.26$          Each NA NA 7.16$          Each No Bid No Bid 8.97$          Each No Bid
10. Epinephrine 1:10,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.26$          Each NA NA 5.83$          Each 10 58.30$        9.01$          Each No Bid
11. Etomidate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.29$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12. Fentanyl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.05$        Each 10BX 140.50$         No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13. Furosemide No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.98$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.49$          Each No Bid
14. GlucaGen No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 180.46$      Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 236.08$      Each No Bid
15. Glutose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.90$          Each 12PK 140.52$         No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.49$        3 pk No Bid
16. Ipratropium Bromide No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.21$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.88$          Box / 30 qty No Bid
17. Haloperidol No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.30$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 98.57$        Each No Bid
18. Ketamine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.26$        Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19. Lidocaine 2% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.55$          Each NA NA 3.71$          Each 10 37.10$        3.84$          Each No Bid
20. Lidocaine Jelly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.55$          Each NA NA 4.21$          Each Blank 42.14$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

21. Magnesium Sulfate 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.26$          Each 25BX 31.50$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22. Morphine Sulfate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.30$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23. Morphine Sulfate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.20$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24. Naloxone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37.93$        Each 10BX 379.30$         33.66$        Each 10 336.55$      61.22$        Each No Bid
25. Nitroglycerin (Spray) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.30$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.92$        25 / BTL No Bid

26. Phenylephrine Nasal Drops No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.00$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27. Solu-Cortef No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.00$          Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28. Solu-Mederol No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.55$          Each 25BX 163.75$         No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.65$          Each No Bid
29. Succinylcholine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00$        Each NA NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.60$        Each No Bid

30. Tetracaine 0.5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.44$          Each 12BX 113.28$         No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31. Zofran No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.64$          Each 25BX 16.00$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.30$          Each No Bid
32. Zofran ODT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.36$          Each 30BX 10.77$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.80$          Each No Bid
33. Zofran ODT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.37$          Each 30BX 10.95$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34. Normal Saline 1000cc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.690$        Each Case/16 23.66$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Case / 12 qty
35. Normal Saline 250cc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.480$        Each Case/36 53.28$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.44$          Each Case / 36 qty
36. Normal Saline 100cc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.120$        Each Case/64 71.68$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.09$          Each Case / 96 qty
TOTAL -$       -$       -$       418.80$  1,155.19$ 64.59$    574.26$  612.24$  
Isa minimum quantity required for delivery
Ability to deliver at designated locations with 48 hrs.
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200.64$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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