
11/18/2010

Item No.  Work or Material
Constr. 

Spec. No. Quantity     Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

1 Mobilization & Demobilization 8 1 Lump Sum 35,000.00$    35,000.00$      35,000.00$    35,000.00$      30,000.00$    30,000.00$      

2 Structure Removal 3 1 Lump Sum 5,500.00$      5,500.00$        60,500.00$    60,500.00$      5,000.00$      5,000.00$        

3 Structure Removal Principal 
Spillway Inlet,  Conduit and Pipe 

3 1 Lump Sum 12,500.00$    12,500.00$      23,000.00$    23,000.00$      15,000.00$    15,000.00$      

4 Pollution Control 5 1 Lump Sum 18,000.00$    18,000.00$      4,000.00$      4,000.00$        13,000.00$    13,000.00$      

5 Seeding 6 13 Acre 1,800.00$      23,400.00$      2,500.00$      32,500.00$      650.00$         8,450.00$        

6 Construction Surveys 7 1 Lump Sum 18,000.00$    18,000.00$      6,500.00$      6,500.00$        4,500.00$      4,500.00$        

7 Removal of Water 11 1 Lump Sum 23,000.00$    23,000.00$      39,000.00$    39,000.00$      30,000.00$    30,000.00$      

8 Excavation, Common 21 22,220 Cu. Yd. 4.60$             102,212.00$    4.00$             88,880.00$      10.00$           222,200.00$    

9 Earthfill 23 14,470 Cu. Yd. 4.75$             68,732.50$      6.50$             94,055.00$      9.00$             130,230.00$    

10 Drainfill, Graded 24 534.0 Cu. Yd. 58.00$           30,972.00$      56.00$           29,904.00$      65.00$           34,710.00$      

11 Salvaging and Placing Topsoil 26 38,059 Sq. Yd. 1.75$             66,603.25$      1.00$             38,059.00$      0.70$             26,641.30$      

12 Diversions 27 910 Lin. Ft. 5.25$             4,777.50$        4.00$             3,640.00$        9.00$             8,190.00$        

13 Concrete, Structural 31 46.2 Cu. Yd. 1,250.00$      57,750.00$      1,400.00$      64,680.00$      1,400.00$      64,680.00$      

14 Concrete, Pipe Cradle 31 32.7 Cu. Yd. 700.00$         22,890.00$      1,800.00$      58,860.00$      500.00$         16,350.00$      

15 Reinforcing Steel, Structural 34 7,205 Lb. 1.90$             13,689.50$      1.00$             7,205.00$        1.00$             7,205.00$        

16 Concrete Pipe, Pressure, 30" I.D. 41 210 Lin. Ft. 239.19$         50,229.90$      500.00$         105,000.00$    430.00$         90,300.00$      

17 Pipe PVC Plastic, 4" 45 518 Lin. Ft. 18.00$           9,324.00$        12.00$           6,216.00$        18.00$           9,324.00$        

18
Rock Riprap 61 494 Ton 57.43$           28,370.42$      105.00$         51,870.00$      45.00$           22,230.00$      

19 Water Control Gate, 18"X18", 
Principal Spillway Inlet 71 1 Each 10,250.00$    10,250.00$      9,501.00$      9,501.00$        10,000.00$    10,000.00$      

20 Trash Rack and Manhole Cover, 
Principal Spillway Inlet 81 1 Each 12,500.00$    12,500.00$      23,000.00$    23,000.00$      10,000.00$    10,000.00$      

21 Fence, Chain Link 91 66.0 Lin. Ft. 73.00$           4,818.00$        35.00$           2,310.00$        40.00$           2,640.00$        
22 Fence, Smooth Wire 92 4,275.0 Lin. Ft. 6.00$             25,650.00$      17.00$           72,675.00$      7.00$             29,925.00$      
23 Contractor Quality Control 94 1 Lump Sum 40,000.00$    40,000.00$      35,000.00$    35,000.00$      45,000.00$    45,000.00$      
24 Safety Fence 492 4,100 Lin. Ft. 3.75$             15,375.00$      2.00$             8,200.00$        6.00$             24,600.00$      

$699,544.07 $899,555.00 $860,175.30

Item No.  Work or Material
Constr. 

Spec. No. Quantity     Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
25 Irrigation System 6 1.0 Lump Sum 25,000.00$    25,000.00$      No Bid No Bid 22,000.00$    22,000.00$      
26 Irrigation Water 6 2080.0 1,000 gal. 9.00$             18,720.00$      No Bid No Bid 6.00$             12,480.00$      

43,720.00$      $0.00 $34,480.00

743,264.07$    $899,555.00 $894,655.30TOTAL  THIS  SITE

ERS Inc. EarthbuildersOptional Bid Items Beavers Contracting
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BID TABULATION

EAST FORK ABOVE LAVON WATERSHED
SITE 2B REHAB



11/18/2010

Item No.  Work or Material Constr. Spec. No. Quantity     Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

1 Mobilization & Demobilization 8 1 Lump Sum 35,000.00$    $35,000.00 17,500.00$    $17,500.00 30,000.00$    $30,000.00
2 Structural Removal, Existing 

Principal Spillway Inlet and 
Appurtenance

3 1 Lump Sum 15,000.00$    $15,000.00 $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

3 Pollution Control 5 1 Lump Sum $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
4 Seeding 6 11.0 Acre $1,800.00 $19,800.00 $2,499.00 $27,489.00 $650.00 $7,150.00
5 Construction Surveys 7 1 Lump Sum $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
6 Excavation, Common, 

Embankment
21 4,900 Cu. Yd. $4.81 $23,569.00 $4.50 $22,050.00 $10.00 $49,000.00

7 Excavation, Unclassified, 
Auxilliary Spillway

21 13,000 Cu. Yd. $2.75 $35,750.00 $6.50 $84,500.00 $14.00 $182,000.00

8 Earthfill, Embankment 23 12,569 Cu. Yd. $4.35 $54,675.15 $8.00 $100,552.00 $10.00 $125,690.00
9 Drainfill, Graded 24 283 Cu. Yd. $58.00 $16,414.00 $55.00 $15,565.00 $65.00 $18,395.00
10 Salvaging and Placing Topsoil 26 12,950 Sq. Yd. $2.75 $35,612.50 $1.00 $12,950.00 $0.70 $9,065.00
11 Diversions 27 610.0 Lin. Ft. $5.25 $3,202.50 $9.00 $5,490.00 $9.00 $5,490.00
12 Concrete, Strucural 31 17.8 Cu. Yd. $1,500.00 $26,700.00 $1,500.00 $26,700.00 $1,500.00 $26,700.00
13 Reinforceing Steel, Structural 34 2,618 Lb. $2.65 $6,937.70 $1.00 $2,618.00 $1.00 $2,618.00
14 Concrete Pipe, Pressure, 24" I.D. 41 40 Lin. Ft. $245.00 $9,800.00 $449.00 $17,960.00 $480.00 $19,200.00
15 Pipe, PVC, Plastic, 6" 45 465 Lin. Ft. $18.75 $8,718.75 $16.00 $7,440.00 $25.00 $11,625.00
16 Rock Riprap 61 1,067 Ton $57.81 $61,683.27 $115.00 $122,705.00 $45.00 $48,015.00
17 Slide Gate, 18" x 18", Principal 

Spillway Inlet
71 1 Ea. $9,250.00 $9,250.00 $9,501.00 $9,501.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00

18 Trash Rack and Manhole Cover, 
Principal Spillway Inlet

81 1 Ea. $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $22,500.00 $22,500.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00

19 Fence, Barbed Wire 92 3,510 Lin. Ft. $6.00 $21,060.00 $9.00 $31,590.00 $6.00 $21,060.00
20 Contractor Quality Control 94 1 Lump Sum $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $33,500.00 $33,500.00 $42,000.00 $42,000.00
21 Geotextile 95 1,910 Sq. Yd. $4.50 $8,595.00 $2.00 $3,820.00 $2.00 $3,820.00

$454,767.87 $585,930.00 $651,828.00

Item No.  Work or Material Constr. Spec. No. Quantity     Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
22 Irrigation System 6 1 Lump Sum  $   25,000.00 $25,000.00 No Bid No Bid  $   20,000.00 $20,000.00

Earthbuilders

BID TABULATION

Base Items

Base Item Total

Optional Bid Items Beavers Contracting

EAST FORK ABOVE LAVON WATERSHED
SITE 17 REHAB

Beavers Contracting ERS Inc. Earthbuilders

ERS Inc. 



11/18/2010

Item No.  Work or Material Constr. Spec. No. Quantity     Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Base Items

23 Irrigation Water 6 1760 1,000 Gal. $9.00 $15,840.00 No Bid No Bid $6.00 $10,560.00
$40,840.00 $0.00 $30,560.00

$495,607.87 $585,930.00 $682,388.00

Optional Item Total

TOTAL  THIS  SITE



11/18/2010

$1,577,043.30

Earthbuilders

$899,555.00

EAST FORK ABOVE LAVON WATERSHED
SITE 2B & 17 REHAB

BID TABULATION

$585,930.00
$894,655.30
$682,388.00

Total Site 2B & Site 17
$495,607.87

$1,238,871.94

ERS Inc. Beavers Contracting

$743,264.07

Summary

Site 2B Base Bid Item + Optional Bid Item Total
Site 17 Base Bid Item + Optional Bid Item Total

$1,485,485.00


