
Total Price $2,760.35
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended

$1,399.25
1.1 4" Broken, White 1 LF $0.65
1.2 4" Solid, White 1 LF $1.00
1.3 6" Broken, White 1 LF $1.25
1.4 6" Solid, White 1 LF $1.35
1.5 8" Broken, White 1 LF $1.65
1.6 8" Solid, White 1 LF $1.85
1.7 12" Solid, White 1 LF $5.00
1.8 18" Solid, White 1 LF $6.00
1.9 24" Solid, White 1 LF $7.00

1.10 Arrow (White, Single) 1 EA $145.00
1.11 Arrow (White, Combo) 1 EA $255.00
1.12 Yield Triangle (Symbol) (18" x 24") 1 EA $70.00
1.13 Yield Triangle (Symbol) (24" x 36") 1 EA $90.00
1.14 Word (White) 1 EA $165.00
1.15 Symbol (White) 1 EA $600.00
1.16 4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF $0.65
1.17 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $1.00
1.18 8" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $1.85
1.19 12" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $5.00
1.20 24" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $7.00
1.21 4" Shadow, Black 1 LF $4.00
1.22 6" Shadow, Black 1 LF $4.00
1.23 Preformed In-Lane (TRANS) Rumble Strip 1 LF $25.00

$19.25
2.1 4" Broken, White 1 EA $0.65
2.2 4" Solid, White 1 EA $1.00
2.3 6" Broken, White 1 EA $1.25

UNIT BID TABULATION
SOLICITATION NO. 22-28FP

STREET STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKING MATERIALS

Total Highway Maintenance, LLC

SECTION I. THERMOPLASTIC (TYPE I) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (60 MIL) (HAND WORK)

SECTION II. THERMOPLASTIC (TYPE I) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (60 MIL) (LONG-LINE) (CITY)
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2.4 6" Solid, White 1 EA $1.35
2.5 8" Broken, White 1 EA $1.65
2.6 8" Solid, White 1 EA $1.85
2.7 4" Broken, Yellow 1 EA $0.65
2.8 4" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $1.00
2.9 8" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $1.85

2.10 4" Shadow, Black 1 EA $4.00
2.11 6" Shadow, Black 1 EA $4.00

$3.30
3.1 4" Broken, White 1 EA $0.65
3.2 4" Solid, White 1 EA $1.00
3.3 4" Broken, Yellow 1 EA $0.65
3.4 4" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $1.00

$828.90
4.1 4" Broken, White 1 EA $0.35
4.2 4" Solid, White 1 EA $0.45
4.3 6" Broken, White 1 EA $0.55
4.4 6" Solid, White 1 EA $0.60
4.5 8" Broken, White 1 EA $0.75
4.6 8" Solid, White 1 EA $0.65
4.7 12" Solid, White 1 EA $2.00
4.8 18" Solid, White 1 EA $3.00
4.9 24" Solid, White 1 EA $4.00

4.10 Arrow (White, Single) 1 EA $55.00
4.11 Arrow (White, Combo) 1 EA $100.00
4.12 Yield Triangle (Symbol) (18" x 24") 1 EA $30.00
4.13 Yield Triangle (Symbol) (24" x 36") 1 EA $40.00
4.14 Word (White) 1 EA $125.00
4.15 Symbol (White) 1 EA $300.00
4.16 Stenciled Lettering (Parking Space) 1 EA $25.00
4.17 4" Broken, Yellow 1 EA $0.35
4.18 4" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $0.45
4.19 8" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $0.75
4.20 12" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $2.00
4.21 24" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $4.00
4.22 4" Shadow, Black 1 EA $3.00
4.23 6" Shadow, Black 1 EA $3.00
4.24 6" Red w/ White Letters (Fire Lane) 1 EA $1.00
4.25 12" Red w/ White Letters (Fire Lane Curb) 1 EA $2.00

SECTION III. THERMOPLASTIC (TYPE I) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (60 MIL) (LONG-LINE) (RURAL)

SECTION IV. PAINT (TYPE II) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (HAND WORK)
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4.26 Handicap Pad (6’x6’ Max. Blue w/ White Symbol) 1 EA $125.00
$10.80

5.1 4" Broken, White 1 EA $0.35
5.2 4" Solid, White 1 EA $0.45
5.3 6" Broken, White 1 EA $0.55
5.4 6" Solid, White 1 EA $0.60
5.5 8" Broken, White 1 EA $0.75
5.6 8" Solid, White 1 EA $0.65
5.7 4" Broken, Yellow 1 EA $0.35
5.8 4" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $0.45
5.9 8" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $0.65

5.10 4" Shadow, Black 1 EA $3.00
5.11 6" Shadow, Black 1 EA $3.00

$1.60
6.1 4" Broken, White 1 EA $0.35
6.2 4" Solid, White 1 EA $0.45
6.3 4" Broken, Yellow 1 EA $0.35
6.4 4" Solid, Yellow 1 EA $0.45

No Bid
7.1 4" Broken, White 1 EA No Bid
7.2 4" Solid, White 1 EA No Bid
7.3 6" Broken, White 1 EA No Bid
7.4 6" Solid, White 1 EA No Bid
7.5 8" Broken, White 1 EA No Bid
7.6 8" Solid, White 1 EA No Bid
7.7 12" Solid, White 1 EA No Bid
7.8 18" Solid, White 1 EA No Bid
7.9 24" Solid, White 1 EA No Bid

7.10 Arrow (White, Single) 1 EA No Bid
7.11 Arrow (White, Combo) 1 EA No Bid
7.12 Yield Triangle (Symbol) (18" x 24") 1 EA No Bid
7.13 Yield Triangle (Symbol) (24" x 36") 1 EA No Bid
7.14 Word (White) 1 EA No Bid
7.15 Symbol (White) 1 EA No Bid
7.16 4" Broken, Yellow 1 EA No Bid
7.17 4" Solid, Yellow 1 EA No Bid
7.18 8" Solid, Yellow 1 EA No Bid
7.19 12" Solid, Yellow 1 EA No Bid
7.20 24" Solid, Yellow 1 EA No Bid

SECTION V. PAINT (TYPE II) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (LONG-LINE) (CITY)

SECTION VI. PAINT (TYPE II) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (LONG-LINE) (RURAL)

SECTION VII. METHYL METHACRYLATE (MMA) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (HAND WORK)
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$454.25
8.1 4" Line, Broken 1 EA $1.00
8.2 4" Line, Solid 1 EA $1.00
8.3 6" Line 1 EA $1.25
8.4 8" Line 1 EA $2.00
8.5 10" Line 1 EA $3.00
8.6 12" Line 1 EA $4.00
8.7 18" Line 1 EA $5.00
8.8 24" Line 1 EA $6.00
8.9 Arrow 1 EA $100.00

8.10 Word 1 EA $125.00
8.11 Symbol 1 EA $200.00
8.12 Miscellaneous Markings 1 EA $3.00
8.13 Traffic Button / RPM 1 EA $3.00

$43.00
9.1 Type I-A, 1-Way Amber Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $5.00
9.2 Type I-C, 1-Way Clear Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $5.00
9.3 Type II-A-A, 2-Way Amber Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $5.00
9.4 Type II-A-R, 2-Way Amber / Red Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $5.00
9.5 Type II-C-R, 2-Way Clear / Red Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $5.00
9.6 Type II-B-B, 2-Way Blue Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $10.00
9.7 Traffic Button, Non-reflective, Round (Type W) 1 EA $4.00
9.8 Traffic Button, Non-Reflective, Round (Type Y 1 EA $4.00

SECTION VIII. REMOVAL OF PAVEMENT MARKINGS  MARKERS

SECTION IX. REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS
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