

Event Number 21-31FP
Event Title Monocular Night Vision Devices (MNVD)

The City of McKinney is soliciting bids toward establishing an annual fixed price contract for Monocular Night Vision Devices (MNVD) and related accessories on an as-needed basis.

Event Description
Event Type ITB
Issue Date 4/4/2021 08:00:01 AM (CT)
Close Date 4/22/2021 02:00:00 PM (CT)

Organization McKinney Purchasing
Workgroup City of McKinney, Texas

Event Owner Brandon Champion, CPPB
Email bchampion@mckinneytexas.org
Phone (972) 547-2897
Fax (972) 547-7585

Responding Supplier	City	State	Response Submitted	Lines Responded	Response Total
Kiesler Police Supply	Jeffersonville	IN	4/22/2021 01:05:03 PM (CT)	4	\$83,087.58
Night Vision Devices, Inc.	Whitehall	PA	4/20/2021 02:30:59 PM (CT)	2	\$84,052.00
USIQ, Inc.	Northbrook	IL	4/20/2021 03:18:10 PM (CT)	3	\$85,080.00
TNVC, Inc. (TNVC)	Redlands	CA	4/6/2021 11:51:21 AM (CT)	8	\$92,510.00
Down Range Thermal	Spicewood	TX	4/22/2021 11:26:57 AM (CT)	8	\$94,455.00
Sellmark Corporation	Mansfield	TX	4/21/2021 09:38:03 AM (CT)	8	\$106,799.00

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification. No alternate response data is included.

Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	QTY	UOM	Estimated	Kiesler Police Supply		Night Vision Devices, Inc.		USIQ, Inc.		TNVC, Inc. (TNVC)		Down Range Thermal		Sellmark Corporation	
							Total Price	\$83,087.58	Total Price	\$84,052.00	Total Price	\$85,080.00	Total Price	\$92,510.00	Total Price	\$94,455.00	Total Price	\$106,799.00
							Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Monocular Night Vision Devices (MNVD) spe			20	EA		\$3,975.00	\$79,500.00	\$3,979.60	\$79,592.00	\$3,949.00	\$78,980.00	\$3,999.00	\$79,980.00	\$4,109.00	\$82,180.00	\$4,125.00	\$82,500.00
2	Night Vision Helmet Mount specifications: *			20	EA		No Bid		\$223.00	\$4,460.00	\$305.00	\$6,100.00	\$311.00	\$6,220.00	\$299.00	\$5,980.00	\$324.50	\$6,490.00
3	Helmet Counter Weight System specification			20	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$63.00	\$1,260.00	\$65.00	\$1,300.00	\$53.90	\$1,078.00
4	Ballistic Helmet Cover specifications: * Colo			20	EA		\$45.54	\$910.80	No Bid		No Bid		\$49.00	\$980.00	\$52.00	\$1,040.00	\$385.00	\$7,700.00
5	Ballistic Helmet Suspension System specifica			20	EA		\$127.37	\$2,547.40	No Bid		No Bid		\$165.00	\$3,300.00	\$166.00	\$3,320.00	\$385.00	\$7,700.00
6	Infrared Patch specifications: * Infrared refl			30	EA		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$20.00	\$600.00	\$15.50	\$465.00	\$38.50	\$1,155.00
7	Galvion Batlskin Front Mounts specifications			2	EA		\$64.69	\$129.38	No Bid		No Bid		\$85.00	\$170.00	\$85.00	\$170.00	\$88.00	\$176.00
8	State percentage discount off published list			1	EA		No Bid		No Bid		10.0%		10.0%		10.0%		20.0%	