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10' Precast Inlet

Must meet specifications in accordance with the 

latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction 

Standards, Division 6000 Storm Water Drainage

EA  No Bid EA  No Bid EA  $3,550.00 

4'x4' Precast Wye Inlet

Must meet specifications in accordance with the 

latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction 

Standards, Division 6000 Storm Water Drainage

EA  No Bid EA  No Bid EA  10 x Price 

18" x 24" Forged Storm Sewer Grate

Must meet specifications in accordance with the 

latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction 

Standards, Division 6000 Storm Water Drainage

EA  No Bid EA  No Bid EA  $   400.00 

19" Inlet Lid (with McKinney Logo)

Must meet specifications in accordance with the 

latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction 

Standards, Division 6000 Storm Water Drainage

EA  No Bid EA  No Bid EA  $   400.00 

21" Inlet Lid (with McKinney Logo)

Must meet specifications in accordance with the 

latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction 

Standards, Division 6000 Storm Water Drainage

EA  No Bid EA  No Bid EA  $   400.00 

24" Manhole Lid (with McKinney Logo)

Must meet specifications in accordance

with the latest NCTCOG Public Works

Construction Standards, Division 6000

Storm Water Drainage

EA  No Bid EA  No Bid EA  $   400.00 

#1 Flex Base
Flexible base, TX DOT Item 247, Type A, Grade 1 

(Quarried material)
TN  $     21.00 TN  $     16.35 TN  $     18.00 

Type B, Grade 3 Aggregate
Aggregate for surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, 

Crushed stone, Grade 3
TN  $     23.00 TN  $     25.00 TN  $     26.00 

Type B, Grade 4 Aggregate
Aggregate for surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, 

Crushed stone, Grade 4
TN  $     23.00 TN  $     24.75 TN  $     26.00 

Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate
Aggregate for surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, 

Crushed stone, Grade 5
TN  $     23.00 TN  $     24.75 TN  $     26.00 

Concrete Wash Sand

Must meet specifications in accordance with the 

latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction 

Standards, Division 300 Roadway Construction

TN  $     23.00 TN  $     15.95 TN  $     18.95 

Screened Cushion Sand

Must meet specifications in accordance with the 

latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction 

Standards, Division 300 Roadway Construction 

(Sieve Square-Opening less than or equal to ¼ “)

TN  $     10.50 TN  $     10.30 TN  $     13.00 

Manufactured Sand

Must meet specifications in accordance with the 

latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction 

Standards, Division 300 Roadway Construction 

(Sieve Square-Opening less than or equal to ½”)

TN  $     19.00 TN  $     16.50 TN  $     20.00 

Rose Contracting

McKinney, TX

Inlets, Grates, and Lids

Aggregate (Material must meet specifications in accordance with the latest TX DOT Standard 

Specifications for Construction of Highways, Streets, and Bridges)

Sand

David Copeland Sand 

& Gravel

Princeton, TX

Liberty Sand & Gravel

McKinney, TX
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