
Vendor Medians ROW Parks

Fire & Public 

Safety

Water Towers & 

Pump Stations

Code 

Compliance

Sadler 6,730.00$               532.00$                 10,812.00$            620.00$                 2,113.00$              70.00$                

MET Lawn Care 11,710.00$             700.00$                 6,245.00$              800.00$                 1,680.00$              220.00$              

Weisz Selection 6,740.00$               453.00$                 9,780.00$              535.00$                 1,860.00$              160.00$              

Gen-X Lawn Care No Bid 340.63$                 No bid 550.00$                 1,413.00$              No bid

4-D Property Maintenance 6,398.50$               474.50$                 7,064.50$              600.00$                 1,636.84$              95.00$                

DWW Landscaping No Bid No Bid 5,915.00$              860.00$                 1,605.00$              100.00$              

Meridian Property Maintenance No Bid 876.54$                 No bid 1,275.00$              4,406.80$              127.50$              

Martin Property Maintenance 9,165.00$               1,023.00$              10,577.00$            755.00$                 2,255.00$              115.00$              

Lillard Lawn & Landscaping 6,981.00$               450.00$                 6,758.00$              656.00$                 1,722.00$              110.00$              

Valleycrest 11,500.00$             745.00$                 12,926.00$            1,080.00$              4,354.00$              172.00$              

Blade Turners 9,484.00$               1,564.00$              9,765.00$              995.00$                 2,160.00$              145.00$              

Newell No bid 890.00$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid 105.00$              

50% PURCHASE PRICE

30% REPUTATION OF THE BIDDER'S GOODS OR SERVICES (verified through reference checks)

20% EQUIPMENT

Contract Mowing Bid

Bid No. 13-06SC
February 21, 2013

BEST VALUE EVALUATION CRITERIA AND FACTORS – Award of contract was made to to the bidder(s) who provide services at the best value for the City 

taking into consideration the relative importance of price and other factors set forth below. Best value evaluation criteria was grouped into percentage factors 

as follows:


