il
MCcKINNEY

Bid Tabulation

EENCawearwm3 20-03FP Purchase and Delivery of Tires
Bid Opening: November 14, 2019 at 2:00 PM CST

Continental BestDrive
(Bid 25 of 37 line items -
Alternate Brands)

Southern Tire Mart, LLC
(Bid 35 of 37 line items -
Alternate Brands)

THOMASON TIRE INC
(Bid 36 of 37 line items)

the Goodyear Tire &
Rubber Company
(Bid 36 of 37 line items)

Total Price| $253,215.45| Total Price| $273,236.47| Total Price| $338,512.42| Total Price| $313,191.24
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY* UOM Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended

1 P255/70R16 SRA Goodyear 10 EA $114.92 $1,149.20 $117.94 $1,179.40 $117.94 $1,179.40
1ALT1 255/70R16 111T FR Grabber APT OWL General 04507920000 10 EA $108.12 $1,081.20

2 225/60R16 RSA Goodyear 10 EA No Bid $96.85 $968.50 $111.58 $1,115.80 $90.00 $900.00

3 P245/70R17 SRA Goodyear 30 EA $104.96 $3,148.80 $126.56 $3,796.80 $118.00 $3,540.00
3ALT1  P245/70R17 108S Grabber HTS General 15448420000 30 EA $111.43 $3,342.90

4 P265/70R17 SRA Goodyear 10 EA $118.26 $1,182.60 $117.22 $1,172.20 $117.72 $1,177.20
4 ALT1 265/70R17 115S FR Grabber HTS60 General 04504780000 10 EA $114.75 $1,147.50

5 P235/70R17 SRA (Fortitude) Goodyear 50 EA $106.63 $5,331.50 $133.24 $6,662.00 $133.24 $6,662.00
5ALT1 235/70R17 111T XL FR Grabber HTS60 OWL General 04504760000 50 EA $109.39 $5,469.50

6 235/55R17 RSA Goodyear 20 EA $110.70 $2,214.00 $122.11 $2,442.20 $105.00 $2,100.00
6 ALT1  235/55ZR17 99W FR G-Max General 15509710000 20 EA $86.95 $1,739.00

7 LT 225/90R16 (7.50X16) Not Brand Specific 30 EA No Bid $83.08 $2,492.40 $94.72 $2,841.60 $88.75 $2,662.50

8 11.00-20 (G124) Goodyear 4 EA No Bid $344.30 $1,377.20 $405.14 $1,620.56 $505.46 $2,021.84

9 LT235/85R16 SA Goodyear 10 EA $113.81 $1,138.10 $171.00 $1,710.00 $118.92 $1,189.20
9 ALT1 LT235/85R16 120/116R LRE FR Grabber HTS€ General 04505080000 10 EA $121.12 $1,211.20

10 385/65R22.5 (G296) Goodyear 5 EA $475.00 $2,375.00 $623.34 $3,116.70 $550.00 $2,750.00
10 ALT1  385/65R22.5 160K TL Grabber OA LRL General 05350140000 5 EA $470.00 $2,350.00

11 P225/70R19 (G647) Goodyear 40 EA No Bid $248.00 $9,920.00 $279.23 $11,169.20 $248.40 $9,936.00

12 7.00-15/ST205D15 Not Brand Specific 50 EA No Bid $67.20 $3,360.00 $80.28 $4,014.00 $71.25 $3,562.50

13 LT245/75R17 SRA Goodyear 50 EA $127.76 $6,388.00 $140.25 $7,012.50 $158.00 $7,900.00
13 ALT1  LT245/75R17 121/118S LRE Grabber HD General 04507200000 50 EA $125.00 $6,250.00

14 P265/70R17 AT Wrangler Goodyear 10 EA $124.64 $1,246.40 $163.34 $1,633.40 $170.00 $1,700.00
14 ALT1  265/70R17 Grabber HTS60 General 04504780000 10 EA $114.75 $1,147.50

15 P235/70R16 SRA Goodyear 6 EA $108.14 $648.84 $113.60 $681.60 $113.60 $681.60
15 ALT1  235/70R16 106T FR Grabber HTS60 General 04504660000 6 EA $91.29 $547.74

16 P255/65R17 SRA Goodyear 6 EA $110.58 $663.48 $116.34 $698.04 $113.99 $683.94
16 ALT1  255/65R17 110T FR Grabber HTS60 OWL General 04504840000 6 EA $120.36 $722.16

17 11R24.5 (G661) STEER Goodyear 10 EA $347.00 $3,470.00 $443.30 $4,433.00 $333.86 $3,338.60
17 ALT1  11R24.5 General HS LRH (16 ply) General 05111230000 10 EA $325.00 $3,250.00

18 LT225/75R16 SRA Goodyear 5 EA $110.52 $552.60 $130.59 $652.95 $105.82 $529.10
18 ALT1  225/75R16 Grabber HTS60 OWL General 04504590000 5 EA $83.89 $419.45

19 P235/75R17 SA Goodyear 20 EA $112.00 $2,240.00 $135.18 $2,703.60 $134.52 $2,690.40
19 ALT1  235/75R17 Grabber HTS General 15485520000 20 EA $121.89 $2,437.80

20 LT245/75R16 SRA Goodyear 15 EA $109.07 $1,636.05 $152.83 $2,292.45 $115.00 $1,725.00
20 ALT1  245/75R16 Grabber HTS General 15483640000 15 EA $93.58 $1,403.70

21 P265/60R17 RSA Goodyear 500 EA $122.40 $61,200.00 $135.79 $67,895.00 $116.00 $58,000.00
21 ALT1  265/60R17 108V FR G-Max Justice General 15553960000 500 EA $120.91 $60,455.00

22 P245/55R18 RSA Goodyear 100 EA $129.84 $12,984.00 $142.11 $14,211.00 $116.00 $11,600.00
22 ALT1  245/557ZR18 G-Max AS-05 General 15509660000 100 EA $122.14 $12,214.00

23 235/75R17.5 (RM160) Goodyear 5 EA $132.00 $660.00 $195.80 $979.00
23 ALT1  235/75R17.5 HTL2 Eco-Plus LRJ (18-ply) Continental 05310180000 5 EA $235.00 $1,175.00
23 ALT1  235/75R17.5 143J RH KMAX T BLT TL Goodyear 756680641 5 EA $255.00 $1,275.00

24 365/70/22.5 Michelin or Goodyear 4 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $804.14 $3,216.56

25 425/65R22.5 Goodyear 30 EA $520.00 $15,600.00 $692.61 $20,778.30 $692.61 $20,778.30
25 ALT1  425/65R22.5 Grabber OA LRL (20-ply) General 05350120000 30 EA $495.00 $14,850.00

26 11R22.5 (G661) STEER (Endurance) Goodyear 120 EA $327.00 $39,240.00 $430.75 $51,690.00 $422.30 $50,676.00
26 ALT1  11R22.5 General HS LRH (16-ply) General 05111220000 120 EA $310.00 $37,200.00

27 11R22.5 (G182) LUG Goodyear 100 EA $320.00 $32,000.00 S444.07 $44,407.00 $461.48 $46,148.00
27 ALT1  11R22.5 General RD LRH (16-ply) General 05211040000 100 EA $320.00 $32,000.00

28 11L-16 OFF ROAD Not Brand Specific 4 EA No Bid $103.00 $412.00 $153.38 $613.52 No Bid

29 225/70R19.5 LUG (G622) Goodyear 60 EA $238.00 $14,280.00 $260.84 $15,650.40 $260.84 $15,650.40
29 ALT1  225/70R19.5 HDR LRG Continental 05221460000 60 EA $260.00 $15,600.00

30 12X16.5 Not Brand Specific 10 EA No Bid $149.00 $1,490.00 $213.85 $2,138.50 $111.81 $1,118.10

31 12.5X80-18 Not Brand Specific 10 EA No Bid $215.00 $2,150.00 $243.63 $2,436.30 $332.00 $3,320.00

32 12R22.5 STEER (Endurance) Goodyear 100 EA $347.00 $34,700.00 $485.65 $48,565.00 $362.22 $36,222.00
32 ALT1  12R22.5 HSR3 LRH (16-ply) Continental 05124390000 100 EA $450.00 $45,000.00
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Total Price| $253,215.45| Total Price| $273,236.47| Total Price| $338,512.42| Total Price| $313,191.24
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY* UOM Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
33 14X17.5 LOADER NHS Not Brand Specific 10 EA No Bid $233.00 $2,330.00 $248.14 $2,481.40 $239.76 $2,397.60
34 P235/70R17 SA Goodyear 20 EA $106.63 $2,132.60 $145.00 $2,900.00 $135.00 $2,700.00
34 ALT1  235/70R17 Grabber HTS60 OWL General 04504760000 20 EA $109.39 $2,187.80

35 LT245/75R17 SA Goodyear 20 EA No Bid $127.76 $2,555.20 $140.95 $2,819.00 $158.00 $3,160.00

36 State percent discount off full price sheet/catalog for all other tires available to the

City. 1 EA 20% 10% 50% **

37 Tire Delivery 1 EA $14.00 $14.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
37.1 If delivery fee applies please indicate the cost. 1 EA $14.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

*Quantities based on fiscal year 2019 usage
**Discount shown is for Police Pursuit tires. Other discounts are: (a) Automobile, 45.0%; (b) light truck, 45.0 %; (c) Light Commercial D/139, 60.0%; (d) medium commercial. 60.0%; (e) bias-ply and radial off-road tires, 28.0%
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