City of McKinney Bid Name: Erosion Control Materials and Emergency Repairs
Bid Tabulation Bid No.: 12-13FP
Bid Date: May 3, 2012

Item No.
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1
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25

26
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DESCRIPTION

Mobilization
Mobilization Fee

Estimated Response Time

Equipment: Cost per hour including operator(s)
Dump Truck #1

Dump Truck #2

Dump Truck #3

953 Cat Track Loader (or comparable)

320 Cat Excavator (or comparable)

308 Mini Excavator (or comparable)

Zero Turn Mower

Tractor with 6ft mower

Tractor with 16ft mower

Bobcat with 6ft mower

Concrete Pump Truck with minimum 125' reach
1500 Gallon Water Truck (or comparable)

1000 HP Vermeer Tub Grinder (or comparable)
TOTAL - SECTIONS A & B

Installed Materials: Cost per unit including installation
Construction Entrance

4" x 8" Gabion Riprap

8" x 12" Riprap

18" x 24" Riprap

24" x 36" Riprap

6'x 3' x 3' PVC Coated Gabion

9'x 3' x 1' PVC Coated Gabion

9'x 3' x 1.5' PVC Coated Gabion

9' x 3' x 3' PVC Coated Gabion

12' x 3' x 1' PVC Coated Gabion

12' x 3' x 1.5' PVC Coated Gabion

12' x 3' x 3' PVC Coated Gabion

150' Gabion Roll Top Lid

Galvanized Hog Rings - 100 per box

David Copeland Sand & Gravel

Princeton, TX

Unit

EA
HR

HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR

EA
TN
TN
TN
TN
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
BX

UNIT PRICE

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Erosion Control Mgmt Svs

McKinney, TX

Unit UNIT PRICE
EA $ 75.00
HR 6
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid
HR No Bid

$ 75.00
EA $ 750.00
TN $ 75.00
TN $ 80.00
TN $ 90.00
TN $ 100.00
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
BX $ 25.00

Shane Evans Construction

McKinney, TX

Unit UNIT PRICE
EAURON | s 25000
HR 0 MINUTES
HR $ 65.00
HR $ 65.00
HR $ 65.00
HR $ 65.00
HR $ 65.00
HR $ 45.00
HR $ 8.00
HR $ 35.00
HR $ 45.00
HR $ 50.00
HR $ 187.00
HR $ 45.00

HR No Bid
$ 990.00
EA $ 200.00
TN $ 33.00
TN $ 37.50
TN $ 37.50
TN $ 45.00
EA $ 235.00
EA $ 300.00
EA $ 315.00
EA $ 352.00
EA $ 400.00
EA $ 420.00
EA $ 470.00
EA $ 10.00
BX $ 50.00

Excel Garden Products
Grand Prairie, TX

Unit

EA
HR

HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR

EA
TN
TN
TN
TN
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
BX

UNIT PRICE

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Hanes Geo Components
Grapevine, TX

Unit

HR

HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR
HR

EA
TN
TN
TN
TN
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
BX

UNIT PRICE

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Rose Contracting

McKinney, TX
Unit UNIT PRICE
EA $ 750.00
HR 1
HR $ 65.00
HR $ 65.00
HR $ 65.00
HR $ 125.00
HR $ 125.00
HR $ 75.00
HR $ 45.00
HR $ 60.00
HR $ 75.00
HR $ 75.00
HR $ 250.00
HR $ 65.00
HR $ 950.00
$ 2,790.00
EA $ 750.00
TN $ 32.00
TN $ 33.00
TN $ 33.50
TN $ 36.00
EA $ 235.00
EA $ 300.00
EA $ 315.00
EA $ 352.00
EA $ 400.00
EA $ 420.00
EA $ 470.00
EA $ 850.00
BX $ 200.00

Page 1 of 4



City of McKinney Bid Name: Erosion Control Materials and Emergency Repairs
Bid Tabulation Bid No.: 12-13FP
Bid Date: May 3, 2012
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29

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

38

39

40

41

42

43

44

45

46

47

48

49

50

51

52

53

54

Section D

55

56

57

58

59

DESCRIPTION
Geo Textile Fabric (8 oz material)

12" Class Il RCP including trench, embedment, backfill, and compaction
15" Class Il RCP including trench, embedment, backfill, and compaction
18" Class Il RCP including trench, embedment, backfill, and compaction
24" Class Il RCP including trench, embedment, backfill, and compaction
30" Class lll RCP including trench, embedment, backfill, and compaction
36" Class lll RCP including trench, embedment, backfill, and compaction
48" Class Ill RCP including trench, embedment, backfill, and compaction
60" Class Il RCP including trench, embedment, backfill, and compaction
5'x 7' Class Ill Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert

Bermuda Hydromulch

C 350 Coconut Mesh Curlex material 40 sy (6.5' x 55.5")

P 550 Curlex material 40 sy (6.5' x 55.5")

S 75 Straw Curlex material 100 sy (8' x 112.5")

Compacted Granular Fill

Flowable Fill

Orange Safety Fence

Inlet Protection Rock Basket Filter

Rock Check Dam for Sediment Collection (4" x 8" Rip Rap)

8" Silt Fence Cable Ties

Silt Fence T Post (4' metal posts)

Wire Back Silt Fence

Temporary Irrigation

Topsoil

Trench Safety

Wheat Straw Hay Bales

TOTAL

Furnished Materials: Cost per unit for materials only

4" x 8" Gabion Riprap

8" x 12" Riprap

18" x 24" Riprap

24" x 36" Riprap

6' x 3'x 3' PVC Coated Gabion

David Copeland Sand & Gravel

Princeton, TX

Unit
SF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
SY
SY
SY
SY
CY
CY
LF
EA
TN
EA
EA
LF
LF
CY
LF
EA

TN
TN
TN
TN
EA

B B B

UNIT PRICE

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

29.50
35.00
37.00
40.00
No Bid

Erosion Control Mgmt Svs

McKinney, TX
Unit UNIT PRICE
SF $ 1.50
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
S $ 0.66
SY $ 1.10
S $ 7.20
SY $ 0.95
CY No Bid
CY No Bid
LF $ 1.50
EA $ 200.00
TN $ 75.00
EA $ 0.09
EA $ 2.85
LF $ 1.00
LF $ 7.50
CY No Bid
LF No Bid
EA $ 15.00
$ 1,434.35
TN $ 75.00
TN $ 80.00
TN $ 90.00
TN $ 100.00
EA No Bid

Shane Evans Construction

McKinney, TX
Unit UNIT PRICE
SF $ 3.50
LF $ 30.00
LF $ 35.00
LF $ 50.00
LF $ 54.00
LF $ 115.00
LF $ 150.00
LF $ 250.00
LF $ 400.00
LF $ 450.00
SY $ 280.00
SY $ 5.00
SY $ 7.00
SY $ 2.50
CY $ 45.00
CY $ 100.00
LF $ 1.30
EA $ 50.00
TN $ 45.00
EA $ 0.25
EA $ 2.50
LF $ 1.35
LF $ 10.00
CY $ 16.00
LF $ 30.00
EA $ 6.00
$ 5,044.40
TN No Bid
TN No Bid
TN No Bid
TN No Bid
EA No Bid

Excel Garden Products
Grand Prairie, TX

Unit
SF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
SY
SY
SY
SY
CcY
CY
LF
EA
TN
EA
EA
LF
LF
CY
LF
EA

TN
TN
TN
TN
EA

UNIT PRICE

$

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
92.50

Hanes Geo Components
Grapevine, TX

Unit
SF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
SY
SY
SY
SY
CY
CY
LF
EA
TN
EA
EA
LF
LF
CcY
LF
EA

TN
TN
TN
TN
EA

UNIT PRICE

$

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
63.55

Rose Contracting

McKinney, TX

Unit UNIT PRICE
SF $ 0.62
LF $ 80.00
LF $ 80.00
LF $ 80.00
LF $ 88.00
LF $ 125.00
LF $ 177.00
LF $ 310.00
LF $ 490.00
LF $ 500.00
SY $ 2.80
SY $ 5.50
SY $ 10.00
SY $ 1.25
CY $ 45.00
CY $ 100.00
LF $ 2.25
EA $ 125.00
TN $ 45.00
EA $ 40.00
EA $ 4.50
LF $ 1.65
LF $ 2.50
CY $ 25.00
LF $ 40.00
EA $ 8.00

$ 6,815.57
TN $ 32.00
TN $ 33.50
TN $ 33.50
TN $ 36.00
EA $ 235.00
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City of McKinney Bid Name: Erosion Control Materials and Emergency Repairs
Bid Tabulation Bid No.: 12-13FP
Bid Date: May 3, 2012

Item No.
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DESCRIPTION
9'x 3'x 1' PVC Coated Gabion

9'x 3' x 1.5' PVC Coated Gabion

9' x 3' x 3' PVC Coated Gabion

12' x 3' x 1' PVC Coated Gabion

12' x 3' x 1.5' PVC Coated Gabion

12' x 3' x 3' PVC Coated Gabion

150" Gabion Roll Top Lid

Galvanized Hog Rings - 100 per box

Geo Textile Fabric (8 oz material)

Pneumatic Hog Ring Gun (Stanley brand or equivalent)
12" Class Ill RCP

15" Class Ill RCP

18" Class Ill RCP

24" Class Il RCP

30" Class Il RCP

36" Class Ill RCP

48" Class Ill RCP

60" Class Il RCP

5'x 7' Class lll Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert

C 350 Coconut Mesh Curlex material 40 sy (6.5' x 55.5")
P 550 Curlex material 40 sy (6.5' x 55.5")

S 75 Straw Curlex material 100 sy (8' x 112.5")
Compacted Granular Fill

Flowable Fill

Orange Safety Fence

Inlet Protection Rock Basket Filter

Rock Check Dam for Sediment Collection (4" x 8" Rip Rap)
8" Silt Fence Cable Ties

Silt Fence T Post (4' metal posts)

Wire Back Silt Fence

Sod Staples - 8" metal staples - 100 per box

Topsoil

Trench Safety

David Copeland Sand & Gravel

Princeton, TX

Unit
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
BX
SF
EA
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
SY
SY
SY
CcY
CY
LF
EA
TN
EA
EA
LF
BX
CY
LF

UNIT PRICE

$

$

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
29.50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
20.00
No Bid

Erosion Control Mgmt Svs

McKinney, TX
Unit UNIT PRICE
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
BX $ 25.00
SF $ 1.50
EA No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
SY $ 1.10
SY $ 7.20
SY $ 0.95
CcY No Bid
CY No Bid
LF $ 1.50
EA $ 200.00
TN $ 75.00
EA $ 0.09
EA $ 2.85
LF $ 1.00
BX $ 25.00
CY No Bid
LF No Bid

Shane Evans Construction

McKinney, TX
Unit UNIT PRICE
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
BX No Bid
SF No Bid
EA No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
LF No Bid
SY No Bid
SY No Bid
SY No Bid
CY No Bid
CY No Bid
LF No Bid
EA No Bid
TN No Bid
EA No Bid
EA No Bid
LF No Bid
BX No Bid
CY No Bid
LF No Bid

Excel Garden Products
Grand Prairie, TX

UNIT PRICE

Unit
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
BX
SF
EA
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
SY
SY
SY
CY
CY
LF
EA
TN
EA
EA
LF
BX
CY
LF

$
$
$
$
$
$

$

$

77.50
91.25
135.00
101.25
117.50
170.00
No Bid
6.64
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
217
2.43
0.25
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
25.00
No Bid
No Bid

Hanes Geo Components
Grapevine, TX

UNIT PRICE

Unit
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
BX
SF
EA
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
LF
SY
SY
SY
CY
CcY
LF
EA
TN
EA
EA
LF
BX
CY
LF

I R A - R S - S T S - R -

®» B B

®» ©B B »

57.65
67.05
90.60
75.30
83.55
109.00
540.00
115.00
0.09
2,700.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
2.81
5.90
0.21
No Bid
No Bid
0.11
No Bid
No Bid
16.50
1.74
0.21
7.25
No Bid
No Bid

Rose Contracting

McKinney, TX
Unit UNIT PRICE
EA $ 300.00
EA $ 315.00
EA $ 352.00
EA $ 400.00
EA $ 420.00
EA $ 470.00
EA $ 850.00
BX $ 200.00
SF $ 450.00
EA $ 2,500.00
LF $ 80.00
LF $ 80.00
LF $ 80.00
LF $ 88.00
LF $ 125.00
LF $ 177.00
LF $ 310.00
LF $ 490.00
LF $ 330.00
SY $ 5.50
SY $ 10.00
SY $ 1.25
CY $ 45.00
CY $ 100.00
LF $ 2.25
EA $ 125.00
TN $ 45.00
EA $ 40.00
EA $ 4.50
LF $ 1.65
BX $ 130.00
CY $ 25.00
LF $ 40.00
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City of McKinney Bid Name: Erosion Control Materials and Emergency Repairs

Bid Tabulation

Bid No.: 12-13FP

Bid Date: May 3, 2012

David Copeland Sand & Gravel

Erosion Control Mgmt Svs

Shane Evans Construction

Excel Garden Products

Hanes Geo Components

Rose Contracting

Princeton, TX

Item No.

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

93 Wheat Straw Hay Bales

TOTAL

$ 191.00

Delivery of items will be made within__ working days of receipt of purchase order

Does Bidder agree to the minimum specifications? Yes/No

Exceptions (if any)

Acknowledgment of Addenda (if any)

Supplier Shane Evans Construction has been deemed non responsive.

McKinney, TX

UNIT PRICE
$ 701.19

McKinney, TX

UNIT PRICE

Grand Prairie, TX

UNIT PRICE

 EA  moms | EBA s 10| EA  Noma | EA | hoso

Grapevine, TX

UNIT PRICE

$ 821.49 $ 3,936.52

7 or earlier

erosion control
matting comes
100 sq yd per roll

McKinney, TX
UNIT PRICE
$ 8.00
$ 8,970.15
$ 1.00
Yes

Yes
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