City of McKinney Bid Tabulation

06-49FP EMS Supplies

Mercury Medical

Quadmed, Inc

Midwest Medical Supply Co., LLC

Boundtree Medical

Taylor Distribution Group

Guardian EMS Products

Clearwater, FL Jacksonville, FL. Earth City, MO Dublin, OH Carrollton, TX Visalia, CA
D | D | D | | PREFERRED D | |
ITEM PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF.
A. 02 DELIVERY DEVICES
1. Adult Non-Rebreather Mask NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |g 3549  Csel50 Ventlab 2101 NA $ 3190  Csel50 Ventlab 1201 NA $ 3200 Casel50 VENTLAB CORP / BTM 87-2101EA NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |[$ 3550 Cse/50 Guardian EMS Products/Q2032
2. Nasal Cannula $ 6368  Case West Med/FD0568 NA $ 1794  Cse/50 Ventlab 1007 NA $ 1213 Csel50 Ventiab 1007 NA $ 1300 Casel50 MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL / BTM 301-100EA NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1250 Cse/50 Guardian EMS Products/Q2024
3. Pediatric Non-Rebreather Mask NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 3892  Each Ventlab 2202 NA $ 071  Each Ventlab 2201 NA $ 064  Each VENTLAB CORPORATION / BTM 87-2202EA NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 073 Each Guardian EMS Products/Q2033
4. Nebulizer $ 5972  Case West Med/FS0209 NA $ 3878  Cse/50 Dynarex 5601 NA $ 3340  Csel50 MedSource MSOMS-22883 NA $ 3300 Cse/50 WESTMED, INC. / BTM 301-200EA NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 4450 Cse/50 Guardian EMS Products/Q2014
5. Standard O2 Tubing NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 042 Each Westmed 0007 NA $ 022  Each Ventiab 3007 NA $ 032  Each TELEFLEX MEDICAL / BTM D6146 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 029 Each Medline Industries/MIIHCS4507
. Ambu Spur II Y Y Ambu Spur II
6. Adult Bag Valve Mask $ 78  FEach Mercury Medical/1056005 ” s 1129 Each Ambu 520-211-000 $ 700  Each Life Systems LSG1604 $ 829  Each AMBU, INC. / BTM 2442-52002 ” NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 1295 Each Ambu/AMB521611001
Ambu Spur II Y Y Ambu Spur II
7. Pediatric Bag Valve Mask $ 832  Each Mercury Medical/1056105 $ 1733 Each Ambu 530-213.000 $ 778  Each Life Systems LSG5002 $ 815  Each AMBU, INC. / BTM 520-211 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1306 Each Ambu/AMB530213000
8. Infant Bag Valve Mask $ 1142 Each Mercury Medical/ 1056202 Y $ 1733 Each Ambu 530-212-000 Y $ 868  Each Life Systems LSG2801 Y $ 910  Each AMBU, INC. / BTM 540-211 Ambu Spur II NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1306 Each Ambu/AMB544212000
9. Portable Oxygen Regulator 1-25psi NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 2818  Each  Cramer AREG8725-82D NA $ 5420  Each Meret MEPEMSREG8725 NA $ 7759  Each INOVO / BTM D2400 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 2873 Each Cramer Decker/MRTARES725-B2D
10. Portable Oxygen O-Rings NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 078 Each Western 2544-2 NA $ 049  Each Meret MEPAREG100WB50 NA $ 085  Each MERET / BTM 2345-25020 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 048 Each Cramer Decker/MRTARE-10Q
11. O2 Portable Cylinder Wrench - Metal NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 169  Each Western MCW-28 NA $ 262  Each SunMed SUN7-9900-02 NA $ 111  Each WESTERN ENTERPRISES / BTM 96-MCW-28 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 141 Each Western Enterprises/SEEN7174
12. Large Cylinder O2 Regulator NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 5876  Each Mada 1633-1 NA $ 7875  Each INVO IN02800-R-2 NA $ 6315  Each INOVO / BTM D2404 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 4329 Each GenStar Technologies/MRTPRPG54-2D
13. Wall Mount O2 Regulator NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid  Each No Bid NA $ 2247  Each Precision PRMBMFA1001 NA $ 3689  Each PRECISION MEDICAL / BTM D4114 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 2432 Each GenStar Technologies/MIIGTFM197B15LOH
14-Flush-Mount
15-Ohio Mount
16. Green Nut & Nipple NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 049  Each Hyper 033-048 NA $ 039  Each SunMed SUN8-2311-50 NA $ 021  Each HYPERKINETICS / BTM 11187 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 054 Each Western Enterprises/SEEN7178
17. CPR Pocket Mask w/one way valve NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 412 Each  Medsource MS-PM103W NA $ 297  Each Medtech MTH10050 NA $ 090  Each  MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL / BTM 533-MS-PMVEA NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 280 Each Guardian EMS Products/Q4001
18. D Cyiinder - Aluminum NoBid __ NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 5091  Each Catalina 9021 NA $ 5116  Each Meret MEPK870MDT NA $ 4313  Each MERET / BTM D4150 NA NoBid __NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 5115 Each Cramer Decker/MRTK870MDZ
B. AIRWAY
19. Oropharyngeal Airway Size 0 $ 272 Each Teleflex/12124700-0 NA $ 020  Each Rusch 121801 NA $ 014  Each Rusch TEL1280 NA $ 011  Each  ASIA CONNECTION-TAIWAN (MEDSTORM)/BTM 12975 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 024 Each DynaRex/Dyn4725
20. Oropharyngeal Airway Size 1 $ 272 Each Teleflex/12124700-1 NA $ 020  Each Rusch 121850 NA $ 014  Each Rusch TEL121802 NA $ 011  Each  ASIA CONNECTION-TAIWAN (MEDSTORM)/BTM 12976 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 034 Each Teleflex Med/TEM122070
21. Oropharyngeal Airway Size 2 $ 272 Each Teleflex/12124700-2 NA $ 020  Each Rusch 121870 NA $ 014  Each Rusch TEL12870 NA $ 011  Each  ASIA CONNECTION-TAIWAN (MEDSTORM)/BTM 12977 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 024 Each DynaRex/Dyn4735
22. Oropharyngeal Airway Size 3 $ 272 Each Teleflex/12124700-3 NA $ 020  Each Rusch 121803 NA $ 014  Each Rusch TEL12803 NA $ 011  Each  ASIA CONNECTION-TAIWAN (MEDSTORM)/BTM 12978 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 024 Each DynaRex/Dyn4745
23. Oropharyngeal Airway Size 4 $ 272 Each Teleflex/12124700-4 NA $ 020  Each Rusch 121804 NA $ 014  Each Rusch TEL121804 NA $ 011  Each  ASIA CONNECTION-TAIWAN (MEDSTORM)/BTM 12979 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 024 Each DynaRex/Dyn4755
24. Oropharyngeal Airway Size 5 $ 272 Each Teleflex/12124700-5 NA $ 020  Each Rusch 121905 NA $ 014  Each Rusch TEL121805 NA $ 011  Each  ASIA CONNECTION-TAIWAN (MEDSTORM)/BTM 12980 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 024 Each DynaRex/Dyn4765
Y Y Y Rusch Robertazzi
25. Nasalpharyngeal Airway 28 French $ 472 Each Sunmed/531507528 $ 222 Each Rusch 123128 $ 157  Each MedSource MSOMS-23928 $ 207  Each SUN MED NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 255 Each TelefleTEM123328
Y Y Y Rusch Robertazzi
26. Nasalpharyngeal Airway 30 French $ 472 Each Sunmed/531507530 $ 222 Each Rusch 123130 $ 157  Each MedSource MSOMS-23930 $ 207  Each SUN MED 123130 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 262 Each Teleflex/TEM123330
Y Y Y Rusch Robertazzi
27. Nasalpharyngeal Airway 32 French $ 472 Each Sunmed/531507532 $ 222 Each Rusch 123132 $ 157  Each MedSource MSOMS-23932 $ 207  Each SUN MED 123132 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 262 Each TeleflexTEM123332
Y Y Y Rusch Robertazzi
28. Nasalpharyngeal Airway 34 French $ 472 Each Sunmed/531507534 $ 222 Each Rusch 123134 $ 157  Each MedSource MSOMS-23934 $ 207  Each SUN MED 123134 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 262 Each Teleflex/TEM123334
Y Y Y Rusch Robertazzi
29. Nasalpharyngeal Airway 36 French $ 472 Each Sunmed/531507536 $ 222 Each Rusch 123136 $ 157  Each MedSource MSOMS-23936 $ 207  Each SUN MED 123136 NoBid _ NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 262 Each TeleflexTEM123336
C. SUCTION
No Bid Y Y BEMIS MANUFACTURING COMPANY Bemis 424410
30. 800 ML Self Suction Contained NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 245  Each Bemis 424410 $ 227  Each Bemis BEM424410 $ 247  Each BTM 592041 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 279 Each BEM15/SEEBE424410
No Bid Y Y BEMIS MANUFACTURING COMPANY Bemis 484410
31. 1200 Suction Canister NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 289 Each Dynarex 4675 $ 277 Each Bemis BEM484410 $ 275  Each BTM 598041 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 369 Each BEM15/SEEBE484410
NA NA NA ASIA CONNECTION SHANGHA | (MEDSTORM) NA
32. 8 French Suction Catheter $ 024  Each Dynarex 4808 $ 023 Each Dynarex 4808 $ 017  Each Dynarex DYN4808 $ 012  Each BTM 36091 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 021 Each DynaRex/Dyn4808
NA NA NA ASIA CONNECTION SHANGHA | (MEDSTORM) NA
33. 12 French Suction Catheter $ 024  Each Dynarex 4812 $ 023 Each Dynarex 4812 $ 017  Each Dynarex DYN4812 $ 012  Each BTM 36093 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 021 Each DynaRex/Dyn4812
NA NA NA ASIA CONNECTION SHANGHA | (MEDSTORM) NA
34. 16 French Suction Catheter $ 024  Each Dynarex 4816 $ 023 Each Dynarex 4816 $ 017  Each Dynarex DYN4816 $ 012  Each BTM 36095 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 021 Each DynaRex/Dyn4816
NA NA NA ASIA CONNECTION SHANGHA | (MEDSTORM) NA
35. Yankauer Rigid Suction Catheter $ 025  Each Dynarex JS-4812 $ 039 Each Conmed 0034870 $ 035  Each Dynarex DYN4690 $ 035  Each BTM 16108 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 036 Each Guardian EMS Products/Q2202
36. Rigid Suction Tubing $ 453 Each Precision Medical 1955 NA $ 078 Each Conmed 0036280 NA $ 0.82 Each Dynarex DYN4693 NA $ 0.50 Each MEDLINE INDUSTRIES, INC./BTM 325021 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.67 Each Guardian EMS Products/Q2200
37. V-VAC Starter Kit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Each No Bid Y $ 77.99 Each Laerdal LAE9850000 Y $ 7560 Each LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP./BTM 590100 V-VAC-985000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 97.79 Each Laerdal/SEELA985000
38. V-VAC Canister No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Each No Bid Y $ 1913 Each Laerdal LAE9850001 Y $ 1869 Each LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP./BTM 530200 V-VAC-985001 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2378 Each Laerdal/SEELA985001
39. V-VAC Tip Adaptor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Each No Bid Y $ 5.87 Each Laerdal LAE9850002 Y $ 5.85 Each LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP./BTM 590300 V-VAC-985002 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $  26.09 Each Laerdal/SEELA985002
40. V-VAC FR CATH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Each No Bid Y $ 282 Each Laerdal LAE9850004 Y $ 268 Each LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP./BTM 530400 V-VAC-985004 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1438 Each Laerdal/SEELA985004
41. Meconium Aspirator NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid | s 4.67 Each Neotech 0101 NA $ 424 Each Neotec NEON0101 NA $ 3.84 Each NEOTECH PRODUCTS, INC. / BTM 590101 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |8 4.26 Each Neotech Products/N0101
No Bid NA No Bid S-SCORT II-15006
42. S-SORT 2 - Portable Suction Unit NoBid _ NoBid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid _ NoBid No Bid $ 52641  Each SSCOR, INC. / BTM 596400 NoBid _NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D. ADVANCED AIRWAY
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
43. 2.5 Endotracheal Tube — No Cuff $ 1147 BXI10 Sunmed/5317330-25 $ 955  BX10 Sunmed 1-7330-25 $ 700  BXI10 SunMed SUN1733025 $ 540 Box10aty BTM 2113-20325 100382025 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 17.90 Box/10qty Teleflex'TEM100382025
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
44. 3.0 Endotracheal Tube — No Cuff $ 1147  BYI10 Sunmed/5317330-30 $ 781 BX10 Smiths 100/101/030 $ 568  BYIO Smiths 100/101/030 $ 540 Box/10qty BTM2113-20330 100382030 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 17.90  Box/10qty Teleflex/TEM100382030
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
45.3.5 Endotracheal Tube — No Cuff $ 1147 BXI10 Sunmed/5317330-35 $ 781 BW10 Smiths 100/101/035 $ 568  BXI10 Smiths 100/101/035 $ 540 Box10aty BTM2113-20335 100382035 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 17.90  Box/10aty Teleflex'TEM100382035
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
46. 4.0 Endotracheal Tube — No Cuff $ 1147  BYI10 Sunmed/5317330-40 $ 781 BX10 Smiths 100/101/040 $ 568  BYIO Smiths 100/101/040 $ 540 Box/10qty BTM2113-20340 100382040 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 17.90  Box/10qty Teleflex/TEM100382040
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
47. 4.5 Endotracheal Tube — No Cuff $ 1147 BXI10 Sunmed/5317330-45 $ 781 BW10 Smiths 100/101/045 $ 568  BXI10 Smiths 100/101/045 $ 540 Box10aty BTM2113-20345 100382045 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 17.90 Box/10qty Teleflex'TEM100382045
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
48. 5.0 Endotracheal Tube — No Cuff $ 1147  BYI10 Sunmed/5317330-50 $ 781 BX10 Smiths 100/101/050 $ 568 B0 Smiths 100/101/050 $ 540 Box/10qty BTM2113-20350 100382050 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 17.90  Box/10qty Teleflex/TEM100382050
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
49. 5.5 Endotracheal Tube — Cuffed $ 1555  BXI10 Sunmed/5317333-55 $ 988  BX10 Smiths 100/100/055 $ 795  BXI0 Smiths 100/100/055 $ 540 Box10aty BTM2113-20355 100382055 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 17.90  Box/10qty Teleflex'TEM100382055
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
50. 6.0 Endotracheal Tube — Cuffed $ 1555 B0 Sunmed/5317333-60 $ 988  B¥10 Smiths 100/100/060 $ 795 B0 Smiths 100/100/060 $ 540 Box/10qty BTM2113-20360 100382060 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1790 Box/10qty Teleflex/TEM100382060
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Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
51. 6.5 Endotracheal Tube - Cuffed $ 1555 B0 Sunmed/5317333-65 $ 988  B¥10 Smiths 100/100/065 $ 795  BWI1O Smiths 100/100/065 $ 540 Box/l0qty BTM2113-20365 100382065 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 17.90 Box/10qty Teleflex/TEM100382065
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
52. 7.0 Endotracheal Tube - Cuffed $ 1555  BXI10 Sunmed/5317333-70 $ 988  BX10 Smiths 100/100/070 $ 795  BXI10 Smiths 100/100/070 $ 540 Box10aty BTM2113-20270 100382070 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1790  Box/10qty Teleflex/TEM100382070
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
53. 7.5 Endotracheal Tube - Cuffed $ 1555  BWI10 Sunmed/5317333-75 $ 988  B¥10 Smiths 100/100/075 $ 795  BYI1O Smiths 100/100/075 $ 750 Boxl0qty BTM2113-20275 100382075 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 17.90  Box/10qty Teleflex'TEM100382075
Y Y Y MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/ RUSCH-
54. 8.0 Endotracheal Tube - Cuffed $ 1555  BXI10 Sunmed/5317333-80 $ 988  BX10 Smiths 100/100/080 $ 795  BXI10 Smiths 100/100/080 $ 750 Box10aty BTM2113-20280 100382080 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1790  Box/10qty Teleflex/TEM100382080
Y Y Y ASIA CONNECTION SHAHGHAI N
55. Adult Stylette - Slick Stylette $ 352  Each Rusch/1000 $ 260  Each Rusch 1000R $ 261  Each SunMed SUN9-0209-73 $ 08  Each (MEDSTORM)/BTM12998 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 315 Each Teleflex’TEM1000R
Y Y Y ASIA CONNECTION SHAHGHAI RUSCH-750
56. Pedi Stylette ~Slick Stylette $ 366  Each Rusch/500 $ 260  Each Rusch 750 $ 261  Each SunMed SUN9-0209-72 $ 083  Each NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 315 Each TeleflexTEM750
57. AMBU Endotracheal Tube Holder $ 387  Each Laerdal/600-3000 Y $ 338 Each Ambu 320264040 Y $ 311  Each Ambu AMB320-264-040 Y $ 221  Each AMBU, INC./BTM 022640 AMBU-264-040 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 299 Each Ambu/AMB320264040
58. “BAAM” Whistle Tip NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 800  Each Great Plains BAAM Y $ 780  Each BAAM M0065338 N $ 568  Each BTM 021410 BAAM-MARK-V1 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
59. KY Jelly Packet - 3 gram pkg $ 713 BX144 Dynarex/1250 NA $ 587  Bx/144 Dynarex 1250 NA $ 567 Bx144 Dynarex DYN1250 NA $ 818 Boxld4aty NICE-PAK/BTM 440128 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 720 Box/144qty DynaRex/DyNP-TD0128
Y Y Y RUSCH-8621000
60. Larygnscope Adult Handle $ 6027  Each Sunmed/5023609 $ 875  Each Zulco 261101 $ 954  Each MedSource MSOMS-46000 $ 2276  Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM A216313 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 2152 Each Teleflex'TEM08621000
Y Y Y RUSCH-8621000
61. Larygnscope Pediatric Handle $ 6027  Each Sunmed/5023610 $ 1398  Each Zulco 040-022U $ 954  Each MedSource MSOMS-46001 $ 2276  Each TRUPHATEK, INC/BTM 76-145100 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 2152 Each Teleflex/TEM08620100
Y Y Y RUSCH-8615050
62. #0 Miller Blade $ 44.07 Each Sunmed/535523301 $ 7.79 Each Zulco 040-130U $ 715 Each MedSource MSOMS-46020 $ 5.00 Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM 2142-82100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 27.49 Each Teleflex TEM08621505
Y Y Y RUSCH-8616100
63. #1 Miller Blade $ 4407  Each Sunmed/535523301 $ 779 Each Zulco 040-131U $ 715  Each MedSource MSOMS-46021 $ 500  Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM 2142-82101 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 2749 Each Teleflex/TEM08616100
Y Y Y RUSCH-8617200
64. #2 Miller Blade $ 44,07 Each Sunmed/535523302 $ 7.79 Each Zulco 040-132U $ 715 Each MedSource MSOMS-46022 $ 5.00 Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM 1242-82202 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 27.49 Each Teleflex TEM08617200
Y Y Y RUSCH-8618300
65. #3 Miller Blade $ 4407  Each Sunmed/535523303 $ 779 Each Zulco 040-133U $ 715  Each MedSource MSOMS-46023 $ 500  Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM 2142-82303 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 2749 Each Teleflex/TEM08618300
Y Y Y RUSCH-8619400
66. #4 Miller Blade $ 44,07 Each Sunmed/535523304 $ 7.79 Each Zulco 040-134U $ 715 Each MedSource MSOMS-46024 $ 5.00 Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM 2142-82404 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 27.49 Each Teleflex TEM08619400
Y Y Y RUSCH-8601100
67. #1 Macintosh Blade $ 4407  Each Sunmed/535523101 $ 779 Each Zulco 040-110U $ 715  Each MedSource MSOMS-46011 $ 500  Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM 2142-84101 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 2749 Each Teleflex/TEM0861100
Y Y Y RUSCH-8602200
68. #2 Macintosh Blade $ 44,07 Each Sunmed/535523102 $ 7.79 Each Zulco 040-111U $ 715 Each MedSource MSOMS-46012 $ 5.00 Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM2142-84202 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 27.49 Each Teleflex TEM00860220
Y Y Y RUSCH-8613300
69. #3 Macintosh Blade $ 4407  Each Sunmed/535523103 $ 779 Each Zulco 040-112U $ 715  Each MedSource MSOMS-46013 $ 500  Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM2142-84303 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 2749 Each Teleflex/TEMO00860330
Y Y Y RUSCH-8616400
70. #4 Macintosh Blade $ 44,07 Each Sunmed/535523104 $ 7.79 Each Zulco 040-113U $ 715 Each MedSource MSOMS-46014 $ 5.00 Each TRUPHATEK, INC./BTM2142-84404 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 27.49 Each Teleflex TEM00860440
N Y Y RUSCH-481150
71. #0 Miller Blade Disposable $ 476  Each SunMed/5533300 $ 438 Each Rusch 004850050 $ 365  Each Truphatelc TRU4020 $ 326  Each SUN MED/BTM 301-B3100EA NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
N Y Y RUSCH-482250
72. #1 Miller Blade Disposable $ 4.76 Each Sunmed/5533301 $ 438 Each Rusch 004851100 $ 3.65 Each Truphatelc TRU4021 $ 3.26 Each SUN MED/BTM 301-B3110EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
N Y Y RUSCH-083550
73. #2 Miller Blade Disposable $ 476  Each Sunmed/5533302 $ 438 Each Rusch 004852200 $ 365  Each Truphatele TRU4022 $ 326  Each SUN MED/BTM 301-B3120EA NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
74. #3 Miller Blade Disposable $ 476  Each Sunmed/5533303 N $ 438 Each Rusch 004853300 Y $ 365  Each Truphatelc TRU4023 Y $ 326  Each SUN MED/BTM 301-B3130EA RUSCH NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
75. #2 Macintosh Blade Disposable $ 476  Each Sunmed/5533202 N $ 393  Each Truphatek 4021 Y $ 365  Each Truphatele TRU4041 Y $ 326  Each SUN MED/BTM 301-B302EA RUSCH NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
76. #3 Macintosh Blade Disposable $ 476  Each Sunmed5533203 N $ 393 Each Truphatek 4022 Y $ 365  Each Truphatele TRU4043 Y $ 326  Each SUN MED/BTM 301-B303EA RUSCH NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
77. #4 Macintosh Blade Disposable $ 476  Each Sunmed5533204 N $ 393  Each Truphatek 4044 Y $ 365  Each Truphatele TRU4044 Y $ 326  Each SUN MED/BTM 301-B3040EA RUSCH NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid Y Y RUSCH-8629100
78. Small Laryngoscope Bulb No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 179 Each Rusch 008629100 $ 134 Each SunMed SUN5-0234-01 $ 122 Each TELEFLEX MEDICAL/BTM 02317 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 167 Each TelefleX TELRU8629100
No Bid Y Y RUSCH-8628300
79. Large Laryngoscope Bulb NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 179 Each Rusch 008628300 $ 134  Each SunMed SUN5-0234-04 $ 122  Each TELEFLEX MEDICAL/BTM 020318 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 167 Each Teleflex/TELRU868300
80. “C" Cell Battery No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |s 1035  Bwi2 Duracell 52012 N $ 686  12ipk Energizer EVEEN93 N $ 4824  Case ENERGIZER BATTERY CO., INC./BTM E9204 PC1400 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 768 Box/noqty Duracel/SETPC1400-EA
Y Y Y Nellcor Puritan
81. Pedi ETCO2 - Disposable Easy Cap $ 12353 Bx/20 Mercury Medical/1055371 $ 56.12 Bx/6 Covidien 8105022 $ 54.20 Bx/6 Nellcor MALEPEDICAP $ 53.94 Box/6qty COVIDIEN/BTM 530025 Bennett Pedicap6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Y Y Y Nellcor Puritan
82. Adult ETCO2 Detector - Disposable Easy Cap $ 12353  Bx20 Mercury Medical/1055370 $ 5612 BX/6 Covidien EasyCap Il $ 5420 BX/6 Nellcor MALEASYCAP Ii $ 5394 Box/6qty COVIDIEN/BTM 530024 Bennett easycap 116 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
83. RUSCH Cricothyroid Kit-Pedi NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 13506  Each VBM 30-10-004-1 Y $ 13133  Each Rusch TEL120900040 Y $ 13188  Each TELEFLEX MEDICAL/BTM 020040 Rusch-120900040 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84. RUSCH Cricothyroid Kit-Adult NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 15625  Each Rusch 120900020 Y $ 13133  Each Rusch TEL12090020 Y $ 13188  Each TELEFLEX MEDICAL/BTM 020041 Rusch-12090020 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
85. Umbilical Twill Tape NoBid _ NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid _NoBid No Bid NA $ 1056 Roll Valley Prod VAL05-1/2-W-72 NA $ 889 Roll MEDLINE INDUSTRIES, INC./BTM 401183 NA NoBid _NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
E. EKG SUPPLIES
No Bid NA NA LEONHARD LANG USA, INC./ NA
86. EKG Paper 4 IN Lifepak 12 Paper NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 167  Each Printmedia 6693246 $ 180  Each Leanharl ang LE012394 $ 846  Each BTM 492-12394PK NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 196 Each Leonhard Lang/MDPLEO12394
No Bid NA NA SPACELABS HEALTHCARE/ Medtronic
87. Adult NIBP Cuff NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 959  Each Meditronic PHC11160-000006 $ 933  Each BTM US2635ML-05 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid NA NA SPACELABS HEALTHCARE/ Medtronic
88. Large Adult NIBP Cuff NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 959  Each Medtronic PHC11160-000008 $ 1108  Each BTM US3242ML-05 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid NA NA SPACELABS HEALTHCARE/ Medtronic
89. Pediatric NIBP Cuff NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 775 Each Meditronic PHC11160-000004 $ 698 NoBid BTM US1320ML-05 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NA Y NA Nellcor Puritan
90. Capnoline Adult Endotracheal No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 25106  Csel25  Oridion 11996-000081 $ 29820  Case Medtronic PHC11996-000163 $ 91500 Box/100aty COVIDIEN/BTM 177268 Bennett 060281 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NA Y NA Nellcor Puritan
91. Filterline ALT/PEDI - Nasal Cannula No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 100500 Cse/l00  Oridion 11996-000163 $ 23863  Case Physio PHC11996-000081 $ 70400 Box/100qty COVIDIEN/BTM 174620 Bennett 10000653 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
92. LifePak 12 - 4 Lead EKG Attachment NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid NA $ 30545  Each Physio PHC11111-000018 NA $ 26025  Each PHYSIO-CONTROL, INC./BTM 2743-01811 Medironic NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
93. LP12 - 6 LEAD EKG Attachment NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid NA $ 12272 Each Physio PHC11111-000022 NA $ 10584  Each PHYSIO-CONTROL, INC./BTM 2743-02211 Medironic NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
94. EKG Leads LP12 3 Lead NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid NA $ 11636  Each Physio PHC11110-000029 NA $ 3667  Each MERIT INDUSTRIES/BTM 530-41320 Medtronic NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NA Y Y Kendall 31013926
95. Adult EKG Pads $ 699 BX Covidien 31013926 $ 8660  BX30 Kendall 31013926 $ 453  PK30 Kendall KEN31013926 $ 434 Pack/30aty COVIDIEN/BTM E5910 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 10560  Box/noaty Kendal/KEN31013926
N Y N Ballard 3112-1731
96. Adult Combo-Pad $ 57031  Bx10 Conmed 3112-1731 $ 14118 BX10 Conmed 3112-1731 $ 15380  BWI10 Skintact LEODF20 $ 14170 Box/10qty HEART SYNC/BTM 16384 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 357.00 Box/10qty ConMed/CMD3112-1731
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City of McKinney Bid Tabulation
06-49FP EMS Supplies

Mercury Medical

Quadmed, Inc

Midwest Medical Supply Co., LLC

Boundtree Medical

Taylor Distribution Group

Guardian EMS Products

Clearwater, FL Jacksonville, FL. Earth City, MO Dublin, OH Carrollton, TX Visalia, CA
D | D | | D | | PREFERRED D | |
ITEM PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF, BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF.
N Y N Ballard 3112-1730
97. Pediatric Combo-Pad $ 57031  Bx10 Conmend 3112-1730 $ 14118 BX10 Conmed 3112-1730 $ 17700  Bx10 HeartSync HSIPEDIATRIC $ 16450 Box10qty HEART SYNC/BTM 16383 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 357.00 Box/10qty ConMed/CMD3112-1730
98. Defibrillation Gel $ 6.49  Pertube Clinical Health 36-700290 NA $ 1.39 Each Spectra 12-02 NA $ 8.81 Each Parker PAR15-25 NA $ 3.00 Each PHARMACEUTICAL INNOVATION/BTM C2151 NA NoBid _ NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 1.40 Each SignaGel/PKL15-60
E. VENIPUNCTURE & IV
99. 14 Gauage IV Catheter- Protectiv $ 149.83 BxX/50 Smiths Med 3068 N $ 88.99 BX/25 Smiths 3068 Y $ 4125 Bx/25 Medex POR306801 N $ 4100 Box/25qty SMITHS MEDICAL ASD, INC./BTM 353068 Medex 3068 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 49.50  Box/25qty Medex/CMG3068
100. 14 Gauage 2 Inch IV Catheter NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 4589  NoBid Terumo SR-OX 1451 NA $ 2150 BX/25 Termo TERSR-OX145ICA NA $ 2100 Box25qty SMITHS MEDICAL ASD, INC./BTM 601451C Jelco NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
101. 16 Gauage IV Catheter - Protectiv $  149.83 BX/50 Smiths Med 3062 Y $ 88.99 BX/25 Smiths 3062 Y $ 4125 Bx/25 Medex POR306201 N $ 4050 Box/25qty SMITHS MEDICAL ASD, INC./BTM 353062 Medex 3062 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 49.50  Box/25qty Medex/CMG3062
102. 18 Gauage IV Catheter - Protectiv $ 14983 BX/50 Smiths Med/3065 Y $ 88.99 BY25 Smiths 3065 Y $ 4125 BX/25 Medex POR306501 N $ 4050 Box25qty SMITHS MEDICAL ASD, INC./BTM 353065 Medex 3065 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 4950 Box/25qty Medex/CMG3065
103. 20 Gauage IV Catheter - Protectiv $ 149.83 BX/50 Smiths Med/3066 Y $ 88.99 BX/25 Smiths 3066 Y $ 4125 Bx/25 Medex POR306601 N $ 4050 Box/25qty SMITHS MEDICAL ASD, INC./BTM 353066 Medex 3066 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 49.50  Box/25qty Medex/CMG3066
104. 22 Gauage IV Catheter - Protectiv $  149.83 BX/50 Smiths Med/3060 Y $ 88.99 BX/25 Smiths 3060 Y $ 4125 Bx/25 Medex POR306001 N $ 4050 Box/25qty SMITHS MEDICAL ASD, INC./BTM 353060 Medex 3066 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 49.50  Box/25qty Medex/CMG3060
105. 24 Gauage IV Catheter - Protectiv $ 149.83 BxX/50 Smiths Med/3063 Y $ 88.99 BX/25 Smiths 3063 Y $ 4125 Bx/25 Medex POR306301 N $ 4050 Box/25qty SMITHS MEDICAL ASD, INC./BTM 353063 Medex 3063 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 49.50  Box/25qty Medex/CMG3063
106. 18 gauge Interosseous Needle NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 9.88 Each Cardinal DIN1518 NA $ 1962 Each Carefusion ALGDIN1518X NA $ 2683 Each PARENT PRODUCTION/BTM 36614 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid $ 1219 Each Cardinal Health/SEECDDIN1518
107. Veniguard — Adult Size $ 72.36 BXx/100 ConMed 705-4431 Y $ 35.29 Bx/100 Conmed 705-4431 Y $ 25.34 Bx/100 MedSource MSOMS-11101 Y $ 3536 Box/100 qty CONMED CORPORATION/BTM 36002MS Conmed 705-4431 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 42.68  Box/100 qty ConMed/CMB705-4431
108. Tourniquet — Latex Free NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 0.09 Each Elastomer P209T NA $ 0.07 Each Graham Field G/F4109-1LF NA $ 0.19 Each KENT ELASTOMER PRODUCTS/BTM 357002 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 017 Each Medline/MIIDYND75020
109. 10 Drop IV Tubing $ 21826  Csel48 Baxter 2C6425 Y $ 229  Cseld8 Amsino AC3110 Y $ 13232  Csel48 Baxter BAX2C6425 Y $ 8688 Case/d8qty  BAXTER HEALTHARE-DMG/BTM 118/-EMS3110EA Baxter 2C6425 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
110. 60 Drop IV Tubing $ 24586 Each Baxter 2C6424 Y $ 214 Each Baxter 2C6424 Y $ 311 Each Baxter BAX2C6424 Y $ 3.00 Each BAXTER HEALTHCARE-DMG/BTM 356424 Baxter 2C6424 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NA Y Y BAYER HEALTHCARE DIABETES CARE/ Bayer 3873
111. Glucometer - Ascensia Elite N/C Advocate BMBOO1 $ 1006 Each Medline MIS-71039Z NoBid  Bx/50 Foragd20 LINGD20FMO1 $ - Each BTM 2761-95563 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Y Y Y BAYER HEALTHCARE DIABETES CARE/ Bayer 3885
112. Glucometer Strips - Ascensia Elite $ 929  BXS50 Advocate BMB002 $ 1645  Bx/100 Medline MIS-71041 $ 2300  BX/100 Foragd20 LINGD20FS50 $ 2984 Box/100 aty BTM 2763-09950 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Y Y Y Surgilance
MEDI PURPOSE (SURGILANCE) SLN240100015
113. Lancets - 2.4mm Orange $ 2000  Bx200 Advocate 634 $ 9.90  BX/100 Statmed SAN-100 $ 9.30  Bx/100 Surgilance SURSLN240 $ 1328 Box/100 aty BMT E6254 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1485 Box/100qty Surgilance/MDPSLN240
114. Alcohol Preps $ 1786  Bx/1200 Dynarex 1113 NA $ 149 Bx100 Dynarex 1113 NA $ 068  BX/100 Emphasis EMP2200S NA $ 082 Box/100aty BTM F1653 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |8 089  Box/100qty DynaRex/DYN1114
115. 1 CC Syringe with needle $ 2183  Bx/100 B-D 309623 Y $ 11.08  BX/100 Covidien 1188127012 Y $ 1534  Bx100 BD B/D309623 NA $ 800 Box100aty B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC/BTM 1631-42225 BD 309623 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
116.3 CC Syringe with needle $ 886  Bx/100 B-D 309574 Y $ 1235  BX/100 Covidien 1180322112 Y $ 1210  Bx/100 BD B/D309574 Y $ 540 Box/100aty B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC/BTM 1631-31122 BD 309574 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
117. 10 CC Syringe with needle $ 2537  Bx/100 B-D 309645 Y $ 1482 BX/100 Covidien 1181220112 Y $ 1932  Bx/100 BD B/D309645 NA $ 1480 Box/100 aty EXEL INTERNATIONAL, INC./BTM 6256253 BD 309645 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
118. 20 CC Syringe without needle NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 033  Each BD 309661 Y $ 020  Each BBRAUN BBM4617207V-02 NA $ 020  Each B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC./BTM 1633-20720 BD 309661 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
119. 18 GA Syringe Needle $ 699  Bx/100 B-D 305195 Y $ 556  BX/100 Covidien 1188818100 Y $ 250  Bx/100 BBRAUN BBM4665118-02 NA $ 230 Box B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC./BTM 1641-11818 BD 305195 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
120. 22 GA Syringe Needle $ 1017  Bx/100 B-D 305155 Y $ 556  BX/100 Covidien 1188822100 Y $ 414 Bx Exel EXE26411 NA $ 221 Box B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC./BTM 1641-65922 BD 305155 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
121. 25 GA Syringe Needle $ 1019  Bx/100 B-D 305125 Y $ 556  BX/100 Covidien 1188825100 Y $ 414 Bx Exel EXE26405 NA $ 408  Each B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC./BTM 1641-15825 BD 305125 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid Y Y Wolfe Tory
122. MAD 3 ML Syringe NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 4.89 Each Wolfe Tory 74016 $ 405  Each Wolfe Tory WLFMAD100 $ 408  Each TELEFLEX MEDICAL/BTM 400124 MAD100 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [s$ 434 Each Teleflex’W TMAD100
123. Normal Saline Lock No Bid No Bid No Bid NA $ 10889  NoBid Smiths SM5000 NA $ 6500  Bx100 Medex PORMX498 NA $ 4650 Case/50 qty ICU MEDICAL/BTM SFB1042 Medex MX498 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
124. Normal Saline Flush - Prefilled Syringe NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid NA $ 3773 BX/100 Excelsior EMCE0100-01 NA $ 13200 Case/400aty AM USA/BTM 600-05 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1699  Box/30qty Becton Dickson/BED306545
125. "Dial-a-Flow" Extension Set NoBid _ NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid _ NoBid No Bid NA $ 4.80 Each Hospira HRM11742-28 NA $ 477 Each HOSPIRA WORLDWIDE, INC/BTM 1712-74218 NA NoBid _ NoBid No Bid No Bid $ 319 Each Hospira/AB19140
G. BANDAGE & SPLINTING
126.3X3'S $ 3.87 BX/50 Dynarex 3353 NA $ 179 BXx200 Dynarex 3232 NA $ 140  BX100 Ardes EMPGA33820 NA $ 1.78  Box/200 qty COVIDIEN/BTM 087703 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 326  Box/100 qty DynaRex/Dyn3353
127.4%4's $ 3.23 BX/50 Dynarex 3354 NA $ 237 Bx200 Dynarex 3254 NA $ 164  BX100 Ardes EMPGA44820 NA $ 165 Box/25qty DUKAL CORP/BTM 276-8503TY NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 5.44  Box/100 qty DynaRex/Dyn3354
128.5X9'S NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 229 Bx/20 Dynarex 3501 NA $ 159 Each Dynarex DYN3501 NA $ 2.46 Box/25aty DUKAL CORP/BTM 085590 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 232 Box/20aty DynaRex/Dyn3501
129. Vaseline Gauze 3'x9" $ 944  Each PSS Medical 232640 NA $ 045  Each Integrity 25-1390 NA $ 061  Each Kendall KEN8884413605 NA $ 057  Each COVIDIEN/BTM 150066K1. NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 0.75 Each Kendall/SEED5120
130. Burn Sheets $ 321 Each Dynarex 3520 NA $ 2.49 Each Dynarex 3520 NA $ 156  Each MedSource MSOMS-BS0033 NA $ 178  Each MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/BTM 30061MS NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 2.89 Each Basic Medical/MESBC-27016
131. Trauma Dressing $ 144 Each Dynarex 3532 NA $ 1.08 Each Dynarex 3532 NA $ 0.76 Each MedSource MSOMS-GZM001 NA $ 0.92 Each MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/BTM 16353 NA NoBid _ NoBid No Bid NoBid | $ 1.05 Each Basic Medical/MESBC-G2001CS
132. 4" Sterile Kerlix $  166.20 Case Kendall 6730 NA $ 1.67 BY/12 Everready 0200062 Y $ 6375 Each Dukal DUK645 Y $ 750 Box/10 aty COVIDIEN/BTM 47-6120BX Kendall 6730 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
133. 6" Sterile Kling $ 1810 BX/12 Kendall 2238 Y $ 3.09 BX/6 Dynarex 3116 Y $ 292 Each Dynarex DYN3116 Y $ 132  Box6qty DYNAREX CORPORATION/BTM 279-3106BG Kendall 2238 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
134, Cravats No Bid No Bid No Bid NA $ 3.44 Pk/12 Everready 0300024NW NA $ 228 12/pk MedSource MSOMS-11050 NA $ 0.24 Set ADI MEDICAL/BTM J2050 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 456  Pkg/12aqty DynaRex/Dyn368
135. Band-Aids $ 185 BX/100 Dynarex 3602 NA $ 134 BX100 Dynarex 3601 NA $ 0.98 BX/100 ASO ASOCBD2018-012-000 NA $ 2.00 BoX/100 gty COVIDIEN/BTM 1122-11950 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 155  Box/100 qty DynaRex/Dyn3602
136. 1" Durapore Tape $ 1319 BX/12 3M 1538-1 Y $ 10.49 BX/12 3M 1538-2 Y $ 8.40 BX/12 3M 3/M1538-1 Y $ 7.64 Box/12qty DUKAL CORP./BTM 080110 3M 1538-1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
137. 2" Durapore Tape $ 1283 BX/6 3M 1538-2 Y $ 8.70 BX/6 Dynarex 3563 Y $ 8.40 BX/6 3M 3/M1538-2 Y $ 7.64  Box6qty DUKAL CORP./BTM 080210 3M 1538-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138. 1" Cloth Tape $ 9.94 BX/12 Dynarex 3562 NA $ 8.70 BY/12 Dynarex 3562 NA $ 7.93 BX/12 Dynarex DYN3562 NA $ 7.30 Box12aty DYNAREX CORPORATION/BTM F165631 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 838  Box/12aty DynaRex/Dyn3562
139. 500 ML Saline Irrigation No Bid No Bid No Bid NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NA $ 2318  Csel18 Bbraun BBMR5201-01 NA $ 1568 Case/16qty B. BAUN MEDICAL, INC./BTM 355001 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 4536 Case/24qty Hospira/HOS613803
NA NA NA ASIA CONNECTION SHANGHAI (MEDSTORM) NA
140. Cold Pack $ 929  Csel24 Dynarex 4511 $ 1294  Csel24 Dynarex 4512 $ 935  Csel24 Dynarex DYN4512 $ 2500 Case/25qty BTM 11405 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |8 816 Case/24qty Morrison/MOM6601
NA NA NA ASIA CONNECTION SHANGHAI (MEDSTORM) NA
141, Warm Pack $ 1357  Csel24 Dynarex 4516 $ 17.98  Csel24 Dynarex 4516 $ 1357  Csel24 Dynarex DYN4516 $ 2576 CaselBX BTM 11406 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1104 Case/24qty Morriso/MOM6610
No Bid Y NA Z-MEDICA LLC Z-Medica
142. Quick-Clot NoBid __ NoBid No Bid $ 1974 Each Z-Medica 475 $ 1708  Each Z-Medica ZME475 $ 617  Each BTM 1214-10205 NoBid _NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H. PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIP.
No Bid Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL CORPORATION/ Microflex SY-911-S
143. Synetron Small NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 13133  Cse/l0 Microflex Sy-911-S $ 8430  Cse/l0 Digitcare DIGDCER-18 $ 10450 Case/10BX NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 13650 Case/10qty Microflex/SEEMXSY911-S
No Bid Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL CORPORATION/ Microflex SY-911-M
144. Synetron Medium NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 13123  Cse/l0 Microflex Sy-911-M $ 8430  Csell0 Digitcare DIGDCER-28 $ 2090 Casel50BX BTM 290912 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 13650 Case/10qty Microflex/SEEMXSY911-M
No Bid Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL CORPORATION/ Microflex SY-911-L
145. Synetron Large NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 13123 Cse/l0 Microflex Sy-911-L $ 8430  Csell0 Digitcare DIGDCER-38 $ 2090 Case/50BX NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 13650 Case/10qty Microflex'SEEMXSY911-L
No Bid Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL CORPORATION/ Microflex SY-911-SL
146. Synetron XL NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 13123  Cse/l0 Microflex Sy-911-XL $ 8430  Csell0 Digitcare DIGDCER-48 $ 2090 Casel50BX BTM 290914 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 13650 Case/10qty Microflex/SEEMXSY911-XL
No Bid Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL CORPORATION/ Microflex
147. Synetron XXL NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 13123  Cse/l0 Microflex Sy-911-2X $ 8430  Cse/l0 Digitcare DIGDCER-58 $ 2090 Casel50BX BTM SY-911SSL NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 13650 Case/10qty Microfle’SEEMXSY911-X2
Y Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL COPORATION/ Microflex
148. NEOPRO EC Small $ 6896  Cselld Microflex JV-199100 $ 11148  Cse/l0 Microflex NEC-288-S $ 10120  Cse/l0 Microflex MICNEC-288-S $ 1828 Casel50BX BTM 290140 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Y Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL COPORATION/ Microflex
149. NEOPRO EC Medium $ 6896  Csell0 Microflex JV-199200 $ 11148  Cse/l0 Microflex NEC-288-M $ 10120  Cse/l0 Microflex MICNEC-288-M $ 1828 Casel50BX NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Y Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL COPORATION/ Microflex
150. NEOPRO EC Large $ 6896  Cselld Microflex JV 199300 $ 11148  Cse/l0 Microflex NEC-288-L $ 10120  Cse/l0 Microflex MICNEC-288-L $ 1828 Casel50BX BTM 290142 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Mercury Medical

Quadmed, Inc

Midwest Medical Supply Co., LLC

Boundtree Medical
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Clearwater, FL Jacksonville, FL. Earth City, MO Dublin, OH Carrollton, TX Visalia, CA
D | D | | D | | PREFERRED D | |
ITEM PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF.
Y Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL COPORATION/ Microflex
151. NEOPRO EC X-Large $ 6896  Cselld Microflex JV 199350 $ 11148  Cse/l0 Microflex NEC-288-XL. $ 10120  Csell0 Microflex MICNEC-288-XL $ 1828 Casel50BX BTM 290143 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid Y Y MICROFLEX MEDICAL COPORATION/ Microflex
152. NEOPRO EC XX-Large NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 11148  Cse/l0 Microflex NEC-288-2X $ 10120  Cse/l0 Microflex MICNEC-288-XXL $ 1828 Case/50BX BTM 290139 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
153. Glove Holder NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 8.92 Each Bowman GW-029 NA $ 2410  Each Bowman BOWGB-001 NA $ 712 INNOVATIVE MEDICAL / BTM 295548 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 7024 Each Healthcare Logistics/11950
154. Infection Control Kit NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 406 Each Quadmed EIC-620099 NA $ 388  Each Safetec SAF17606 NA $ 570 PARENT PRODUCTION / BTM 295814 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 447 Each Safetec of America/SOF17606
N Y N MOLDEX-METRIC, INC./BTM 1511 (SMALL); Inovel
BTM 1512 (MED); BTM 1513 (LRG)
155. TB Mask $ 3571  Bagl20 3M 4511-1860 $ 2575  Bg20 Inovel $ 2007  Bg/20 Inovel $ 1662 BG NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
156. Isolation Mask With Shield $ 17329  BX/100 Busse 373 Y $ 2987  BX25 KC 47147 N $ 1278  BX25 Dukal DUK1560 NA $ 2271 Box25qly HALYARD HEALTH/BTM 29080 Busse 373 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
157. Goggles $ 787  Each  Molkycke Health Care 1701 NA $ 453 Each Pyramex 53079 NA $ 126  Each Graham Field G/F9675 NA $ 148  Each ERB, INC/BTM 29117 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 142 Each UVEX Safety/UVXS301CS
158. Portable Sharps Container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.37 Each Kendall 8303 Y $ 334 Each Kendall KEN8303SA Y $ 3.24 Each COVIDIEN/BTM 29/8303 Kendall 8303 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.85 Each Kendall/KEN8303SA
159. 5 Quart Wall Sharps Container #4838 $ 410  Each Coridien 4838 NA $ 459 NoBid Kendall 8507SA NA $ 268  Each Kendall KEN31144010 NA $ 300  Each COVIDIEN/BTM 47-31144010EA NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 3.09 Each Kendal/KEN31144010
160. Antibacterial Hand Cleaner $ 160  Each Gogo Ind 9631-24 NA $ 0.92 Each GoJo 8507SA NA $ 056  Each Dukal DONHS3787 NA $ 120  Each SAFETEC/BTM R3119 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 115 Each Safetex/SOF17350
161. Envirocide Spray $ 1293  Each Metrex 13-3324 N $ 1058  Each Metrex 13-1024 Y $ 902  Each Metrex MET13-3324 N $ 960  Each METREX RESEARCH CORPORATION/BTM 200024 Metrex 13-3324 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
162. Envirocide Refill $ 3720  Gallon Metrex 13-3300 N $ 2462  Gallon Safetec 35815 Y $ 2658  Gallon Metrex MET13-3300 N $ 2465  Gallon QMED CORPORATION/BTM 200128 Metrex 13-3300 NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
163. Hydrogen Peroxide $ 099  Each Mckesson 23-D0012 NA $ 0.89 Each Medline MDS098001Z NA $ 057  Each Hydrox HYDD0012 NA $ 08l  Each MEDIQUE PRODUCTS/BTM 25711 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 085 Each Medique Products/25711
164. Rubbing Alcohol $ 463  Each Mckesson 23-D0024 NA $ 227 Each Medline MDS098003Z NA $ 122 Each Hydrox HYDD0022 NA $ 160  Each QMED CORPORATION/BTM 201001 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 132 Each Medique Products/26811
NA NA NA MEDLINE INDUSTRIES, INC./ NA
165. Bio Hazard Red Bag 10-15 Gallon $ 2981  Bx80  Colonial Bag Corp. PXR-36 $ 227 Each Medline MDS098003Z $ 3712 Bw250 Medical Action ACT10814 $ 7275 S0RLCase BTM NONHDR24FL NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
166. Absorb UP — Red Z No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.27 Each Safetec 48657 NA $ 4.14 Each Safetec SAF41101 NA $ 9.54 Each SAFETEC/BTM 294113 SafeTex 95224 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
L PACKAGING EQUIP.
Y Y Y Ambu
167. Adult Adjustable C-Collar $ 1500  Each Laerdal 980010 $ 509  Csel30 Ossur PHP-PA $ 17190  Csel30 Ambu AMB000-281-000 $ 14610 Case/30 aty AMBU, INC./BMT 260281 000-281-000 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 16290 Case/30aty Ambu/Amb000-281-000
Y Y Y Ambu
168. Pediatric Adjustable C-Collar $ 1500  Each Laerdal 98002 $ 5.09 Each Ossur PHP-PP $ 573  Each AMB000-281-106 $ 14610 Case/30qty AMBU, INC./BTM 260280 000-281-106 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 543 Each Amb/Amb000-281-106
NA NA NA EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS, INC./ NA
169. C-Collar Bag $ 6850  Each Meret M50012 $ 1796  Each Quadmed ECC-1681 $ 1750  Each Safety Int| SF11418 $ 4987  Each BTM LA0700 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1232 Each Basic MedicalMESMS0CCBag
170. Backboard Strap NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 784  Each Quadmed EST-1300-BK NA $ 627  Each Dick Medical DKM11142BK NA $ 615  Each DMS/BTM 506022BK NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
171. Head Block NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 5733  Each KEMP 10-001-BLU NA $ 7885  Each Dick Medical DKM50100BL NA $ 2667  Each LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP./BTM L983060 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 8828 Each Morrison/MOM1420-BL
172. Replacement Block NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 2397 Each Kemp 10-011 NA $ 4217  Each Dick Medical DKM50101BL NA $ 2334  Each LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP./BTM L983092 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 3825 Each Morrison/MOM1422-6
173. Small Board Splint NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 3.19 Each DMS 60012 NA $ 180  Each Dick Medical DKM60015 NA $ 949  Each DMS/BTM F0061 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 219 Each Dick Medical/DMS60015
174. Medium Board Splint NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 442 Each DMS 60024 NA $ 336  Each Dick Medical DKM60036 NA $ 1275  Each DMS/BTM F0062 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 341 Each Dick Medical/DSM60024
175. Large Board Splint NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 648  Each DMS 60054 NA $ 423 Each Dick Medical DKM60054 NA $ 1979  Each DSM/BTM F0063 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 5.08 Each Dick Medeical/DSM60048
176. Disposable Head Block NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 513 Each Laerdal 58929 NA $ 439 Each Laerdal LAE700-00001 Y $ 368  Each LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP./BTM 260975 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 548 Each Laerdal/SEEST1975
177. Adult Traction Splint NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 7935  Each EP&R EP800 NA $ 13977  Each Faretec FAR1126514 NA $ 14993  Each GENSTAR TECHNOLOGIES, INC./BTM 95001 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 12858 Each Genstar/S1008-Adult
178. Pedi Traction Splint NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 15372 Each Faretec 1126512 NA $ 13977  Each Faretec FAR1126512 NA $ 11850  Each GENSTAR TECHNOLOGIES, INC./BTM 95002 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 12658 Each Genstar/SI108-PEDI
179. Stair Chair No Bid No Bid No Bid NA $ 719600  Each Ferno 731368 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
180. SCOOP - plastic NoBid  NoBid No Bid NA $ 84302 Each Hartwell CC220P NA $ 40147  Each MedSource MSOMS-SCP123 NA $ 41645  Each MORRISON MEDICAL PRODUCTS/BTM 3245-12419 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 46219 Each Quantum/Q-62170
181. KED NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 5825  Each Medsource MS-ED2253 NA $ 5494  Each MedSource MSOMS-ED2253 NA $ 5188  Each MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/BTM 15329 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 7073 Each Basic MedicallMESBC-25012
182. Vacuum Splint NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 113313 Kit Hartwell EVS 9075-6C NA $ 470,00 Kit Hartwell HTMEV3000 Y $ 42800 KIT HARTWELL MEDICAL/BTM 563100 Hartwell NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
183. Pedi Mate NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 27189 Each Ferno 0313778 NA $ 28110  Each Ferno FER0313778 Y $ 22006  Each FERNO WASHINGTON/BTM 473560 Femno NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 267.98 Each Ferno/SEEFW678
No Bid NA Y Life Support
184. Pedi-Pac NoBid  NoBid No Bid $ 21074  Each Quadmed EBB-175099 $ 28588  Each LSP ALLL484C $ 28482  Each FERNO WASHINGTON/BTM 260078 Products NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
185. Backboard NoBid _ NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 12690 Each LSP-Xtra EBB-175099 NA $ 15500 Each Laerdal LAE982599 Y $ 13417 Each LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP./BTM L982500 Laerdal NoBid _ NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 178.00 Each
J. PT ASSESSMENT EQUIP
186. Infant B/P Cuff NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 7.01 Each Medsource MS-BP400 NA $ 4.95 Each Veridian VRD02-1084 NA $ 4176 Each AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP./BTM 2611-70715 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 7.92 Each Basic Medical/MESBC-BP400
187. Pedi B/P Cuff NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 7.37 Each Medsource MS-BP300 NA $ 4.95 Each Veridian VRD02-1083 NA $ 4176 Each AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP./BTM 2611-70722 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 7.92 Each Basic Medical/MESBC-BP300
188. Adult B/P Cuff NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 5.94 Each Dynarex 7107 NA $ 5172 Each ADC AME703-11ABK NA $ 4176 Each AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP./BTM 2611-71102 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 5.79 Each DynaRex/DYN7107
189. Large Adult B/P Cuff NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 854 Each Dynarex 7108 NA $ 511 Each Veridian VRD02-1082 NA $ 4385 Each AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP./BTM 2611-71221 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 7.92 Each Basic Medical/MESBC-BP200
190. Wall Mount B/P Cuff NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 92.39 Each ADC 750W-11AN NA $ 6445 Each ADC AME750W-11ABK NA $ 6289 Each AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP./BTM h1645 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
191. ADC Stethoscope NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 238 Each Medsource MS-70031 NA $ 459 Each Veridian VRD05-11001 NA $ 6.00 Each AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP./BTM 1317BK NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 5.79 Each Basic Medical/MESBC-STR
192. Pen Lights NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 439 PK/6 Medsource 1800037 NA $ 331 Pkg/6 Veridian VRD14-823 NA $ 4.87 Pkl aty PROPOSE, INC./BTM 400015P NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 548  Pkg/6aqty Emergency Med Int/MESBC-PEL300
193. AD Temp Probe NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 243 Each ADC 1800037 NA $ 3.49 Each ADC AME413B NA $ 4.29 Each AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP./BTM 2611-70715 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 242 Each ADC/ADZ412-00
194. AD Temp Covers NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid g 178 BX/50 Mabis 15-618-000 NA $ 2.05 BX/50 ADC AME416-100 NA $ 252  Box/25aty WELCH ALLYN, INC./BTM 400018 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 365 Box/100 qty Briggs Healthcare/MAB15-618-000
195. BCI O2 SAT Monitor NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid NA $ 39565 Each Smiths POR3301AI N $ 43385 Each SMITHS MEDICAL ASD, INC./BTM 14830 Smiths NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
196. SAT Finger Probe NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid  NoBid No Bid NA $ 4200 Each Smiths MEDCSTO060-3104 NA $ 1065 Each SMITHS MEDICAL ASD, INC./BTM 171300 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
197. SAT Carry Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A $ 4396 Each Smiths POR3315 N $ 3996 Each SAFETY INTERNATIONAL/BTM 171190 Smiths 3315 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
198. Replacement B/P Gauge NoBid __ NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid __ NoBid No Bid NA $ 7.15 Each ADC AMEBO9IN NA $ 3416 Each AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP./BTM 540104 NA NoBid __NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
K. MISC EQUIP.
199. Razor $ 009  Each Dynarex 4250 NA $ 0.12 Each Dynarex 4250 NA $ 034  Each Dynarex DYN4251 NA $ 033  Each DYNAREX CORPORATION/BTM 540047 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1799  Box/50qty DynaRex/Dyn4251
200. Sting Ease Swab $ 1143 each Dynarex 1503 NA $ 555  Pki25 Certified 235-089 NA $ 075  PK10 Medique TEX231-12 NA $ 293 Box10aty DYNAREX CORPORATION/BTM 279-1407 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NA NA NA HONEYWELL SAFETY PRODUCTS USA, INC/ NA
201. Ammonia Inhalants $ 240  PK10 Dynarex 1401 $ 205 PKI10 Dynarex 1401 $ 190  PK10O Dynarex DYN1401 $ 290 Box10qty BTM 900234 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 109  Pkg/10qty Safetec/SOF52022
202. EMT Scissors $ 1153  Each Pss Medical 10-90319 NA $ 0.97 Each NA NA $ 067  Each MedSource MSOMS-SH001B NA $ 077  Each MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL/BTM 533-MS-SHO0018 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 0.97 Each MedSource/MESBC-SHO0018
203. Window Punch $ 1157  Each EMI 8N365 NA $ 493 Each R-071 NA $ 509  Each ADC AME360 NA $ 432  Each E.M.L/BTM 400022 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 536 Each Emergency Med Int/EMI1076
204. Small Magill Forceps $ 804  Each Mercury Medical 1082760 NA $ 367 Each NA NA $ 380  Each ADC AME315 NA $ 28  Each SURGICAL DESIGN, INC/BTM 0128 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 426 Each Magnum Med/MAM10-2750
205. Large Magill Forceps $ 1100  Each Mercury Medical 1082750 NA $ 367 Each NA NA $ 415  Each ADC AME316 NA $ 335  Each SURGICAL DESIGN, INC/BTM 0129 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 426 Each Magnum Med/MAM10-2760
206. OB Kit $ 7143 case/10 Dynarex 4902 NA $ 511 Box NA NA $ 482  Each Motion Medical MMD1702 NA $ 615  Each Parent Production/ BTM 4440010 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 609  Box/noqty DynaRex/Dyn4902
207. Silver Swaddler $ 250  Each Dynarex 3538 NA $ 206  Each Dynarex 3538 NA $ 425  Each Gam DMI650-4006-0600 NA $ 256  Each Primacare Medicall BTM 0345 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 451 Each Gam Industries/SEED5326
208. Convenience Bag $ 40557 case240 GKR Ind 7000 NA $ 0.79 Each Medline NON70600 NA $ 1023  Each Emphasis EMPEB100 NA $ 21840 Case/240qty GKR Industries/ BTM J2250 NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 031 Box/noqty MedLine/MIINON70600
209. Ring Cutter $ 5310  Each PSS Medical 13723 NA $ 4.69 Each Needi 47-373 NA $ 1190  Each ADC AME380 NA $ 511  Each Magnum Medical, Inc. / BTM400010 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 417 Each Medique/74901
210. Pedi-Wheel NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |s 8.42 Each EMSADV 226P Y $ 926  Each PediWheel EMS211P Y $ 760  Each EMS Advantage/ BTM 480224 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid |$ 9.02 Each EMS Advantage/SEEP7803
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City of McKinney Bid Tabulation
06-49FP EMS Supplies

Mercury Medical Quadmed, Inc Midwest Medical Supply Co., LLC Boundtree Medical Taylor Distribution Group Guardian EMS Products
Clearwater, FL Jacksonville, FL. Earth City, MO Dublin, OH Carrollton, TX Visalia, CA
D | D D PREFERRED D | |
ITEM PRICE UoMm MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE UoMm MANUF. BRAND PRICE MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF. BRAND PRICE uom MANUF.
TOTAL $ 58866 $ 4203 $ 5716 $  257.28 $ - $ 5803
L. BAGS & CASES
211. Intubation Roll $ 39087 Roll Sunmed 8-1050-85 NA $ 2698 Roll __Quadmed ECC-237100-BL NA $ 3175 Roll Safety Int| SFI15485-AE1250BLUE NA $ 2700 Lushgreen Enterprises/ BTM 12326 NA NoBid  NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 1225 BAG Basic Medica/MESBC-16011
TOTAL $  390.87 $ 2698 $ 3175 $ - $ 10923
Ability to order via internet? No Yes Yes No. Yes Yes
Local sales rep within 100 miles? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Ability to deliver within 48 hrs with no additional charge? Yes Yes yes Yes Yes No
Ability to ship to multiple deliver Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Ability to track up to 24 months of purchase history? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
|RUSH order policy submitted? Yes Yes Yes NA Per Bid No.
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