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1 Delivery Five Day Delivery Expedited Delivery
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended How many working          List cost per purcha              Would delivery of p         
Ad Vision 1 $102.90 $102.90 14 $25.00 Yes
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $834.35 $834.35 14 $20.00 Yes

1.1
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $154.20 $154.20

1.2
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $169.60 $169.60

1.3
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $37.25 $37.25

1.4
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $40.95 $40.95

1.5
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $75.80 $75.80

1.6
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $83.35 $83.35

1.7
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $31.80 $31.80

Section I. Class A Firefighter Uniform

Dress Coat, Class A  

Dress Coat, Class A

Dress Pant, Class A  

Dress Pant, Class A Oversize Charge

Dress Pant, Class A (Chief Officer)  

Dress Pant, Class A (Chief Officer) Oversize Charge

Dress Shirt, Short Sleeve, Class A (Chief Officer)  



16-26FP Addendum 1 - Page 2

Ad Vision 1 $40.95 $40.95

1.8
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $8.00 $8.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $40.95 $40.95

1.9
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $35.75 $35.75
Ad Vision 1 $43.95 $43.95

1.10
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $10.00 $10.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $46.50 $46.50

1.11
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $71.80 $71.80

1.12
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.00 $0.00
Ad Vision 1 No Bid

1.13
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $46.40 $46.40

1.14
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.00 $0.00
Ad Vision 1 No Bid

2 Delivery Five Day Delivery Expedited Delivery
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended How many working          List cost per purcha              Would delivery of p         

Dress Shirt, Short Sleeve, Class A (Chief Officer) Oversize Charge

Dress Shirt, Long Sleeve, Class A (Chief Officer)  

Dress Shirt, Long Sleeve, Class A (Chief Officer) Oversize Charge

Hat, Class A (Chief Officer)  

Hat, Class A (Chief Officer) Oversize Charge

Hat, Class A  

Hat, Class A Oversize Charge

Section II. Class B Firefighter Uniform
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Ad Vision 1 $654.50 $654.50 14 $25.00 Yes
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $1,993.49 $1,993.49 21 $20.00 Yes

2.1
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $71.50 $71.50
Ad Vision 1 $78.00 $78.00

2.2
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $16.00 $16.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $95.11 $95.11

2.3
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $90.04 $90.04
Ad Vision 1 $95.00 $95.00

2.4
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $22.00 $22.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $120.06 $120.06

2.5
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $91.67 $91.67
Ad Vision 1 $92.50 $92.50

2.6
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $20.00 $20.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $114.61 $114.61

2.7
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $71.50 $71.50
Ad Vision 1 $78.00 $78.00

2.8

Shirt, Short Sleeve, Class B  

Shirt, Short Sleeve, Class B Oversize Charge

Shirt, Long Sleeve, Class B  

Shirt, Long Sleeve, Class B Oversize Charge

Pant, Full-Cut Industrial, Class B  

Pant, Full-Cut Industrial, Class B Oversize Charge

Shirt, Short Sleeve, Class B (Women’s)  

Shirt, Short Sleeve, Class B (Women’s) Oversize Charge
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Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $16.00 $16.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $95.11 $95.11

2.9
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $90.04 $90.04
Ad Vision 1 $95.00 $95.00

2.10
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $22.00 $22.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $120.06 $120.06

2.11
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $83.25 $83.25
Ad Vision 1 $90.50 $90.50

2.12
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $20.00 $20.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $103.89 $103.89

2.13
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $284.65 $284.65

2.14
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $327.50 $327.50

2.15
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $100.75 $100.75

Shirt, Long Sleeve, Class B (Women’s)  

Shirt, Long Sleeve, Class B (Women’s) Oversized Charge

Pant, Industrial, Class B (Women’s)  

Pant, Industrial, Class B (Women’s)Oversize Charge

Jacket, Emergency Response, Class B   

Jacket, Emergency Response, Class B Oversize Charge

Jacket, Softshell Fleece, Class B   
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2.16
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $125.85 $125.85

2.17
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $3.60 $3.60
Ad Vision 1 $4.50 $4.50

2.18
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.00 $0.00
Ad Vision 1 $0.00 $0.00

2.19
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $4.30 $4.30
Ad Vision 1 $5.00 $5.00

2.20
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.00 $0.00

3 Delivery Five Day Delivery Expedited Delivery
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended How many working          List cost per purcha              Would delivery of p         
Ad Vision 1 $61.75 $61.75 14 $25.00 Yes
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $114.53 $114.53 21 $0.00 No

3.1
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $10.75 $10.75
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $11.80 $11.80

3.2
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.00 $0.00
Ad Vision 1 $0.00 $0.00

Jacket, Softshell Fleece, Class B Oversize Charge

Cap, Mesh Back, Class B   

Cap, Mesh Back, Class B Oversize Charge

Cap, Pro Mesh, Class B   

Cap, Pro Mesh, Class B Oversize Charge

Section III. Physical Training Uniform

Shorts, Physical Training  

Shorts, Physical Training Oversize charge
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3.3
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $5.00 $5.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $6.20 $6.20

3.4
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $1.50 $1.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $8.15 $8.15

3.5
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $3.50 $3.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $4.07 $4.07

3.6
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $1.50 $1.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $6.17 $6.17

3.7

Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $8.50 $8.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $9.25 $9.25

3.8
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $1.50 $1.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $12.00 $12.00

3.9

Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $12.25 $12.25
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $13.56 $13.56

3.10
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended

T-Shirt, Short Sleeve, Physical Training  

T-Shirt, Short Sleeve, Physical Training Oversize Charge

T-Shirt, Short Sleeve, Physical Training (Training Recruit)  

T-Shirt, Short Sleeve, Physical Training (Training Recruit) Oversize 

T-Shirt, Long Sleeve, Physical Training  
http://www.hanes.com/hanes/hanes/men/tshirts/crewneck-t-

T-Shirt, Long Sleeve, Physical Training Oversize Charge.

Sweatpant, Physical Training  
http://www.portandcompany.com/site-

Sweatpant, Physical Training Oversize Charge
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Ad Vision 1 $1.50 $1.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $15.13 $15.13

3.11
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $10.25 $10.25
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $11.25 $11.25

3.12
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $2.00 $2.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $14.70 $14.70

3.13

Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $2.25 $2.25
Ad Vision 1 $3.50 $3.50

3.14
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.00 $0.00
Ad Vision 1 $0.00 $0.00

4 Delivery Five Day Delivery Expedited Delivery
Supplier QTY Price Extended How many working          List cost per purcha              Would delivery of p         
Ad Vision 1 $32.75 $32.75 14 $25.00 Yes
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $79.95 $79.95 7 $20.00 Yes

4.1
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $7.00 $7.00

4.2
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $10.00 $10.00

Sweatshirt, Physical Training

Sweatshirt, Physical Training Oversize Charge

Knit Cap, Physical Training  
http://www.portandcompany.com/site-

Knit Cap, Physical Training Oversize Charge

Section IV. Alterations for Firefighter Uniforms

Alterations: Section I. Class A Firefighter Uniform: Dress Coat, Sew on 

Alterations: Section I. Class A Firefighter Uniform: Dress Coat, Setup 



16-26FP Addendum 1 - Page 8

4.3
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.50 $0.50

4.4
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.75 $0.75

4.5
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.75 $0.75

4.6
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $0.95 $0.95

4.7
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $2.00 $2.00

4.8
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $1.00 $1.00

4.9
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $1.50 $1.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $6.00 $6.00

4.10
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $1.50 $1.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $5.00 $5.00

Alterations: Section I. Class A Firefighter Uniform: Dress Coat, Silver 

Alterations: Section I. Class A Firefighter Uniform: Dress Coat, Gold 

Alterations: Section I. Class A Firefighter Uniform: Dress Coat, Silver 

Alterations: Section I. Class A Firefighter Uniform: Dress Coat, Gold 

Alterations: Section I. Class A Firefighter Uniform: Dress Coat, Take 

Alterations: Section I. Class A Firefighter Uniform: Dress Coat, Sew on 

Alterations: Section II. Class B Firefighter Uniform: Shirts, Emergency 

Alterations: Section II. Class B Firefighter Uniform: Shirts, Sew patch 
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4.11

Supplier QTY Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $2.25 $2.25
Ad Vision 1 $4.25 $4.25

4.12

Supplier QTY Price Extended
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $1.00 $1.00
Ad Vision 1 $1.50 $1.50

4.13
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 No Bid
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $15.00 $15.00

4.14

Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $3.00 $3.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $4.00 $4.00

4.15

Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $7.00 $7.00
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $7.50 $7.50

4.19
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $2.50 $2.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $3.00 $3.00

4.20
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $3.75 $3.75
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $4.25 $4.25

Alterations: Section II. Class B Firefighter Uniform: Shirts, Emergency 
Response Jacket & Fleece, Sew EMS patch (provided by Vendor) on 

Alterations: Section II. Class B Firefighter Uniform: Shirts, Emergency 
Response Jacket & Fleece, Sew McKinney Fire Department patch 

Alterations: Section II. Class B Firefighter Uniform: Emergency 

Alterations: Section II. Class B Firefighter Uniform: Cap, Mesh Back, 
Pro Mesh- 1 Color Embroidered (Department Designation) on front, 

Alterations: Section III. Physical Training Uniform: T-Shirts, 1 Color-
Screen Print “Name Tag”, “Rank”, “EMS Designation”, 2 Color-Screen 

Section III. Physical Training Uniform: T-Shirts, 1 Color-Screen Print on 

Section III. Physical Training Uniform: Shorts, 2 Color-Screen Print  on 
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4.21
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $4.25 $4.25
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $5.00 $5.00

4.22
Supplier QTY Price Extended
Ad Vision 1 $3.50 $3.50
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $4.00 $4.00

5 Delivery Five Day Delivery Expedited Delivery
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended How many working          List cost per purcha              Would delivery of p         
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, In1 $187.25 $187.25 45 $50.00 No
Ad Vision 1 $223.45 $223.45 49 $0.00 No
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $250.00 $250.00 25 $0.00 No

5.1
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, In1 $63.93 $63.93
Ad Vision 1 $76.85 $76.85
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $85.35 $85.35

5.2
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, In1 $63.93 $63.93
Ad Vision 1 $76.85 $76.85
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $85.35 $85.35

5.3
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, In1 $59.39 $59.39
Ad Vision 1 $69.75 $69.75
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $79.30 $79.30

6 Delivery Five Day Delivery Expedited Delivery
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended How many working          List cost per purcha              Would delivery of p         
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, In1 $70.63 $70.63 45 $50.00 No
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $94.50 $94.50 25 $0.00 No

Section III. Physical Training Uniform: Sweatpants, 2 Color-Screen 

Section VI. Hat Badge

Section III. Physical Training Uniform: Knit Cap, 1 Color embroidered 

Section V. Uniform Badge

Oval Badge, Gold (Chief Officer)  

Oval Badge, Gold (Chief Officer & Captain)   

Oval Badge, 
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Ad Vision 1 $96.50 $96.50 49 $0.00 No

6.1
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, In1 $36.92 $36.92
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $49.50 $49.50
Ad Vision 1 $49.75 $49.75

6.2
Supplier QTY Unit Price Extended
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, In1 $33.71 $33.71
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 $45.00 $45.00
Ad Vision 1 $46.75 $46.75

7
Supplier QTY Percentage Extended
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, In1 35
Got You Covered Uniforms 1 30
Ad Vision 1 15

Maltese Cross Badge, Gold  

Maltese Cross Badge, Rhodium  

Percentage discount for all catalog items not listed in Sections I 
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