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e Ny and Striping Services Contractor Contractor
Section 1 - Sidewalk Construction and Repair U.0O.M. Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Furnish concrete sidewalk RECONSTRUTION in compliance with the attached specifications labeled 2170MA and
1/2170MB under "Exhibit A" Please provide the cost for the following unit price: Remove & Replace
A 0-500 square feet, 4" thick Per Sq. Ft. 20.00 7.50 14.08 7.00
B. Price for more than 500 square feet, 4" thick Per Sq. Ft. 20.00 7.25 12.83 6.75
C Price if City of McKinney furnishes concrete (only) Per Sq. Ft. 12.00 5.25 10.38 5875}
Furnish concrete sidewalk NEW INSTALLATION, as needed, compliance with the attached specifications labeled
2[2170MA and 2170MB under Exhibit A. Please provide the cost for the following unit price:
A. 0-500 square feet, 5" thick PER SQ. FT. 22.00 7.50 12.05 7.00
B. Price for more than 500 square feet, 4" thick PER SQ. FT. 22.00 7.25 10.89 6.75
C Price if City of McKinney furnishes concrete (only) PER SQ. FT. 13.00 5.25 7.81 5.75
Furnish concrete sidewalk NEW INSTALLATION of Hike and Bike Trails, as needed, in compliance with the
attached Hike and Bike Standards specifications labeled 2170MA and 2170MB under Exhibit A. Please provide the
3|cost for the following unit price:
A Installation 0 to 200 square feet, 5" thick PER SQ. FT. 25.00 7.50 13.96 7.00
B. Price for more than 200 square feet, 5" thick PER SQ. FT. 22.00 7.25 11.73 7.00
C InstallationO to 200 square feet, 6" thick PER SQ. FT. 30.00 8.50 14.61 7.50
D Price for more than 200 square feet, 6" thick PER SQ. FT. 32.00 8.25 12.38 7.50
Furnish 4000 PSI concrete and associated materials for the NEW INSTALLATION of retaining walls, as needed, in
4|compliance with the attached specification labeled Exhibit at the following unit price:
A Less than 1-Ft. Height PER LFT. 40.00 30.00 179.76 30.00
B 1-2 Ft. Height PER LFT. 80.00 60.00 206.96 40.00
C 2-3 Ft. Height PER LFT. 120.00 90.00 234.19 50.00
D 3-4 Ft. Height PER LFT. 150.00 120.00 261.40 55.00
E 4-5 Ft. Height PER LFT. 160.00 150.00 288.63 60.00
Install all types of curb ramps in accordance with the United States Proposed Accessibility Guidelines for Pedestrian
Facilities in the Public Right-of-Way labeled 2125A through 2125D under Exhibit A. To include furnishing concrete, placing
5|concrete pavers, and saw cutting and removing EA. $ 3,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,687.50 | $ 1,350.00
Sod placement as needed to areas designated by the Street and Drainage Department Superintendent or his/her
6|designee at the following prices
A. Bermuda Grass (Price to include 4" Topsoil) PER SQ. YD. $ 20.00 | $ 750 | $ 25.00 | $ 6.00
B. St. Augustine grass (Price to include 4" topsoil) PER SQ. YD. $ 20.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 6.00
Section 2 - Street Repairs Sub Total Section 1 $ 3,808.00 | $ 1,539.00 | $ 3,034.16 | $ 1,665.00
1|Furnish concrete and necessary equipment for street repairs remove and replace:
A. 5" (4000 p.s.i.) concrete for pavement (#3 bars 18" O.C.) 0-50 SQ.YD. 145.00 75.00 371.86 63.00
B. 5" (4000 p.s.i.) concrete for pavement (#3 bars 18" O.C.) over 50 SQ. YD. 140.00 72.50 216.79 63.00
C. 6" (4,000 p.s.i. 3-day cure) high early concrete for pavement(#4 at 18" O.C.) 7 sack 0-50 SQ.YD. 275.00 82.50 380.44 67.50
D. 6" (4,200 p.s.i._high early) concrete for pavement(#4 at 18" O.C.) 7 sack over 50 SQ. YD. 265.00 80.25 225.00 65.25
E. 8" (4,000 p.s.i.) concrete for pavement (#4 at 18" O.C.) 0-50 SQ.YD. 165.00 89.75 392.43 74.97
F. 8" (4,000 p. concrete for pavement (#4 at 18" O.C.) over 50 SQ. YD. 160.00 87.15 236.46 72.72
G. 8" (4,200 p.s.i. high early) concrete for pavement (#4 at 18" O.C.) 7 sack PER SQ. YD. 325.00 91.10 392.43 74.52
H. 6" (4,200 p.s.i. high early 7 sack) concrete drive approach up to connecting sidewalk or R.O.W. (#4 at 18" O.C.) PER SQ. YD. 320.00 82.50 7,830.01 85.50
1. Remove/Replace 24" curb and gutter to include 6' curb (4,000) p.s.i.) (#4 at 18" O.C.) 0-150 LFT. 70.00 35.00 70.78 38.00
J. Remove/Replace 24" curb and gutter to include 6' curb (4,000) p.s.i.) (#4 at 18" O.C.) over 150 LFT. 65.00 32.50 51.65 37.00
K. 18" mountable curb and gutter (4,000 p.s.i. 30 day cure) concrete (#4 at 18" O.C.) PER LFT. 70.00 32.50 48.46 28.00
L. Type A Grade 2 Flexbase provided, placed and compacted by contractor (#4 at 18 O.C.) PER SQ. YD. 150.00 65.00 37.50 18.00
M. Flexbase provided by owner, placed and compacted by contractor (#4 at 18" O.C.) PER SQ. YD. 50.00 50.00 31.25 9.00
N. 5-6' depth integral color stamped patterned concrete in medians (4,000 p.s.i.) pavement (#4 at 18" O.C.) PER SQ. YD. 350.00 150.00 308.81 139.50
0. 4" Reinforced Concrete riprap (4,000 p.s.i.) concrete 0-50 SQ.YD. 200.00 65.00 135.00 | no bid
P. 4" Reinforced Concrete riprap (4,000 p.s.i.) concrete over 0-50 SQ. 150.00 63.00 112.50 | no bid
Q. Add Median Nose Construction PER SQ. YD. 200.00 75.00 475.00 | $ 63.00
R. Remove and replace storm water pipe 0-36" pipe supplied by contractor) PER LFT. 300.00 100.00 237.50 | no bid
S. Install 6” French drain up to 1 foot PER LFT. 300.00 35.00 3731 | $ 15.00
Section 3 - Utility Cuts Sub Total Section 2 $ 3,700.00 | $ 1,363.75 [ $ 11,591.18 | $ 913.96
Furnish concrete utility cut repairs in compliance with the attached specifications labeled 2150MA under “Exhibit
A”. Provide the cost for the following unit prices (includes saw cut ):Furnish concrete and necessary
1|equipment for street repairs remove and replace:
A 6" 4000 PSIR.C. Pvmt 0-40SQ YD. 150.00 150.00 303.51 67.50
B. 6” 4000 PSIR.C. Pvmt over 40 SQ.YD. 140.00 140.00 231.40 65.25
C, 8" 4000 PSIR.C. Pvmt 0-40 SQ.YD. 165.00 160.00 315.09 74.97
D. 8" 4000 PSIR.C. Pvmt over 40 SQ.YD. 155.00 150.00 242.48 73.62
E. 8" 4000 PSI R.C. Curb w/18” Gutter over 20 LFT. 85.00 40.00 65.63 30.00
F. 8” 4000 PSI Exposed Aggregate Concrete PER SQ. YD. 200.00 175.00 401.76 117.00
G. 2" Hot Mixed Asphalt Conc. Over 6” Conc. Pvmt. 0-20SQ.YD. 80.00 275.00 359.76 50.00
H. 2" Hot Mixed Asphalt Conc. Over 6” Conc. Pvmt. over 20 SQ.YD. 80.00 250.00 349.40 50.00
l. Price per square yard for High Early 7 Sack or Equal PER SQ YD. 275.00 5.00 510.09 88.80
J IF USING AN EQUIVALENT, PLEASE SPECIFY THE BRAND YOU ARE BIDDING EA. n/a n/a n/a n/a
Section 4- Stamped Concrete Sub Total Section 3 $ 1,330.00 | $ 1,345.00 | $ 2,779.12 | $ 617.14
Furnish stamped concrete repairs in compliance with the attached specifications labeled 2150MA. Provide the
1 following unit price. Price per Square Yard to include Integral Color. Price to include remove and replace
A 6” 4000 PSIR.C. Pvmt 0-40S0Q. YD. 350.00 180.00 266.38 139.50
B. 6' 4000 PSI R.C. Pvmt over 40 SQ.YD. 325.00 170.00 228.48 137.25
C. 8" 4000 PSIR.C. Pvmt 0-40 SQ.YD. 375.00 190.00 293.43 143.10
D. 8" 4000 PSIR.C. Pvmt over 0-40 SQ.YD. 350.00 180.00 239.55 140.85
E 8” 4000 PSI R.C. Curb w/18” Gutter 20+ LFT 100.00 100.00 54.08 33.00
F. 9” 4000 PSIR.C. Pvmt 20+ LFT 95.00 200.00 320.89 144.90
G. 5" 4000 PSI Concrete Sidewalk 8+ SQ. YD. 250.00 160.00 315.00 139.50
H. 9” 4000 PSI Exposed Aggregate Concrete PER SQ. YD. 395.00 200.00 393.74 144.90
l. Price per square yard for High Early 7 Sack or Equal PER SQ. YD. 400.00 5.00 398.41 88.80
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J. |IF USING AN EQUIVALENT, PLEASE SPECIFY THE BRAND YOU ARE BIDDING EA. n/a n/a n/a n/a
Section 5 - Striping Sub Total Section 4 $ 2,640.00 | $ 1,385.00 | $ 2,509.96 | $ 1,111.80
1. Remove, prepare, and furnish and install thermoplastic or methyl methacrylate (MMA) pavement markings in
accordance with TxDOT Item 666/DMS-8220 or raised pavement markings in accordance with TxDOT Item
1|672/DMS-4200 labeled under “Exhibit A” for the followina tvpes:
A 1.4” White Line, MMA PER LFT. 3.25 3.30 [ no bid no bid
B. 6” White Line, MMA PER LFT. 4.80 4.95 | no bid no bid
C. 8” White Line, MMA: PER LFT. 6.40 6.60 | no bid no bid
D. 12" White stop bar, MMA PER SQ. YD. 9.60 8.25 | no bid no bid
E. 24" White stop bar, MMA PER SQ YD. 12.00 16.50 | no bid no bid
F. White yield bar, MMA PER SQ. YD. 12.00 16.50 | no bid no bid
G. |4 Yellow line, MMA PER LFT. 3.20 3.30 [ no bid no bid
H. 6" Yellow yield bar, MMA PER LFT. 4.80 4.95 | no bid no bid
I 8” Yellow line, MMA PER LFT. 6.40 6.60 | no bid no bid
J. 4" Red fire lane, MMA PER LFT. 4.80 3.30 | no bid no bid
K. 6" Red fire lane, MMA PER LFT. 6.40 4.95 | no bid no bid
L. 6" Red fire lane, Curb, MMA PER LFT. 6.40 5.50 | no bid no bid
M. |8” Red fire lane MMA PER LFT. 9.00 6.60 | no bid no bid
N. Railroad symbol, MMA EA. 700.00 2,475.00 | no bid no bid
0. Left or right arrow, MMA EA. 200.00 495.00 | no bid no bid
P. Straight arrow, MMA EA. 200.00 495.00 | no bid no bid
Q. 2 combination arrow, MMA EA. 300.00 660.00 | no bid no bid
R. 3 combination arrow, MMA EA. 350.00 825.00 | no hid no bid
S. Only, MMA EA. 450.00 495.00 | no bid no bid
T. Bike lane “Man” symbol, MMA EA. 200.00 1,750.00 | no bid no bid
U. Bike lane “Sharrow” symbol, MMA EA. 150.00 1,750.00 | no bid no bid
V. 4” White line, Thermo PER LFT. 3.00 1.10 | no bid no bid
W. 6" White line, Thermo PER LFT. 4.50 1.65 | no bid no bid
X. 8” White line, Thermo PER LFT. 6.00 2.20 | no bid no bid
Y. 12" White stop bar, Thermo PER LFT. 9.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
Z. 24” White stop bar, Thermo PER LFT. 18.00 6.60 | no bid no bid
AA. |4” Yellow line, Thermo PER LFT. 3.00 1.10 | no bid no bid
BB. [6” Yellow line, Thermo PER LFT. 4.50 1.65 | no bid no bid
CC. |[8” Yellow line, Thermo PER LFT. 6.00 2.20 | no bid no bid
DD. [Railroad symbol, Thermo EA. 2,200.00 825.00 | no hid no bid
EE. [Left or right arrow, Thermo EA. 300.00 165.00 | no bid no bid
FF. [Straight arrow, Thermo EA. 300.00 165.00 | no bid no bid
GG. |2 combination arrow, Thermo EA. 540.00 220.00 | no bid no bid
HH. |3 combination arrow, Thermo EA, 790.00 275.00 | no bid no bid
I. Only, Thermo EA. 325.00 165.00 | no bid no bid
JJ. Bike lane “Man” symbol, Thermo EA. 1,200.00 580.00 | no hid no bid
KK. [Bike lane “Sharrow” symbol, Thermo EA 1,300.00 580.00 | no bhid no bid
LL. 1I-CR, acrylic, reflective RPM clear/red 4” EA 10.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
MM. [II-CR, acrylic, reflective RPM clear/red 4” EA 10.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
NN. [lI-AA, acrylic, reflective RPM amber/amber 4” EA 10.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
00. [lI-CC, acrylic, reflective RPM clear/clear 4” EA 10.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
PP. [lI-BB, acrylic, reflective RPM blue/blue 4” EA 12.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
QQ. [lI-AR, acrylic, reflective RPM amber/red 4” EA 12.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
RR. [lI-RR, acrylic, reflective RPM red/red 4” EA 12.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
SS. [I-C, acrylic, reflective clear 4” EA 10.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
TT. |I-C, acrylic, reflective amber 4” EA. 10.00 4.40 | no bid no bid
UU. |RPM removal concrete EA. 3.00 1.10 | no bid no bid
VV. |RPM removal asphalt EA 4.00 1.40 | no bid no bid
WW. | Surface marking removal, grinding PER SQ. FT. 4.50 2.75 | no bid no bid
XX. _|White yield bar, Thermo PER SQ. FT. 60.00 5.50 | no bid no bid
Sub Total Section 5 9,815.55 12,082.55 | no bid no bid
GRAND TOTAL ALL
SECTIONS| $ 2129355 | $ 17,71530 [ $ 19,914.42 | $ 4,307.90
Questions Camcrete Jim Bowman | G2 Contractors | C.l. Pavement
1 Does your company provide street striping services? Yes Yes No Yes
2 If yes, would this be self-performed or subcontracted out? Subcontracted Subcontracted | n/a Both
3 If yes, what is the minimum work order cost for road striping service? $ 3,200.00 | $ 1,650.00 | n/a $ 1,800.00
4 Would you be willing to accept a secondary/alternate award based on Section IV, Item C? Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-emergency work requires at least a 48 — 72 hour response time and a 24 hour receipt of notification in writing via
5 email to the Streets and Drainage Superintendent. Would your company be able to meet these requirements? Yes Yes Yes Yes
6 Some emergency work requires less than 48 hours of response time. What is your response time for emergencies? 48 hours 24-48 hours 24 hours 24-48 hours
$2800 move in per
concrete work order
(under $10K) This is
Exceptions to Terms and Conditions gjr:lyc, osn ec[r]gtr:\[\gof:l;m Sﬁlll)jperé?[] Og
striping minimum $800.00 minimum
work order cost at (mobilization
7 $3200.00. none none charge)




