Recommend Award

Lattimore Materials Corp. CJA Enterprises LLP Liberty Sand & Gravel, Inc. |David Copeland Sand & Gravel, Inc.
Total Price $235,000.00 Total Price $812,500.00 Total Price $892,850.00 Total Price $1,105,820.00
Line # Description aQry |uom Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
#1 Flex Base - Flexible base, TXDOT Item 247,
1 Type A, Grade 1 (Quarried material) 10000 Tons |No Bid $20.75 $207,500.00 $19.75 $197,500.00 $28.00 $280,000.00
Type B, Grade 3 Aggregate - Aggregate for
2 surface, TXDOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed stone,
Grade 3 2000 Tons |No Bid $22.00 $44,000.00 $26.80 $53,600.00 $30.00 $60,000.00
Type B, Grade 4 Aggregate - Aggregate for
3 surface, TXDOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed stone,
Grade 4 5000 Tons |No Bid $22.50 $112,500.00 $27.05 $135,250.00 $30.00 $150,000.00
Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate - Aggregate for
4  surface, TXDOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed stone,
Grade 5 5000 Tons |No Bid $22.00 $110,000.00 $27.05 $135,250.00 $30.00 $150,000.00
Concrete Wash Sand - Must meet specifications
in accordance with the latest NCTCOG Public
2 Works Construction Standards, Division 300
Roadway Construction 5000 Tons $24.50 $122,500.00 $20.50 $102,500.00 $24.20 $121,000.00 $34.40 $172,000.00
Screened Cushion Sand - Must meet
specifications in accordance with the latest
6 NCTCOG Public Works Construction Standards,
Division 300 Roadway Construction (Sieve
Square-Opening less than or equal to “) 5000 Tons |No Bid $11.50 $57,500.00 $12.65 $63,250.00 $15.38 $76,900.00
Manufactured Sand - Must meet specifications in
accordance with the latest NCTCOG Public Works
7  Construction Standards, Division 300 Roadway
Construction (Sieve Square-Opening less than or
equal to”) 5000 Tons $22.50 $112,500.00 20.50 $102,500.00 $21.40 $107,000.00 $28.00 $140,000.00
8  Topsoil - Topsoil, TXDOT Item 160 4000 Tons [No Bid 19.00 $76,000.00 $20.00 $80,000.00 $19.23 $76,920.00
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