Primary Secondary
fr MetroPlex Concrete RBR Infrastructure & Road, Jim Bowman Construction Cl Pavement (Alderink ) . . ] ]
CIbE Construction West Texas Rebar Placers, Inc. LLC Company, L.P. Core CMCI Enterprises, Inc) Urban Infraconstruction Summit Paving LLC Arreguin Group Inc HQS Construction
Total Price $4,728.19| Total Price $6,394.25| Total Price $8,475.25| Total Price $8,823.85| Total Price $10,117.00| Total Price $11,033.61| Total Price $11,976.75| Total Price $15,754.05| Total Price $22,147.30| Total Price $31,196.60
Line# |Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY |(UuOM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 0 to 500 Square feet, 4 inch thick 1 SF $6.86 $6.86 $9.75 $9.75 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $20.00 $20.00 $7.40 $7.40 $10.00 $10.00 $7.50 $7.50 $8.35 $8.35 $9.00 $9.00
2 Price for more than 500 square feet, 4 inch 1 SF $5.95 $5.95 $8.50 $8.50 $7.50 $7.50 $7.50 $7.50 $11.00 $11.00 $7.35 $7.35 $8.00 $8.00 $7.25 $7.25 $8.35 $8.35 $9.00 $9.00
3 0 to 500 Square feet, 5 inch thick 1 SF $6.89 $6.89 $10.00 $10.00 $8.50 $8.50 $9.00 $9.00 $21.00 $21.00 $7.40 $7.40 $12.00 $12.00 $7.50 $7.50 $8.50 $8.50 $9.60 $9.60
4 Price for more than 500 square feet, 5 inch 1 SF $6.59 $6.59 $9.00 $9.00 $8.25 $8.25 $8.75 $8.75 $12.00 $12.00 $7.35 $7.35 $10.00 $10.00 $7.25 $7.25 $8.50 $8.50 $9.60 $9.60
5 Installation 0 to 200 square feet, 5 inch thic 1 SF $5.95 $5.95 $11.00 $11.00 $10.00 $10.00 $9.00 $9.00 $21.00 $21.00 $7.50 $7.50 $12.00 $12.00 $7.50 $7.50 $8.80 $8.80 $8.00 $8.00
6 Price for more than 200 square feet, 5 inch 1 SF $5.19 $5.19 $9.00 $9.00 $9.50 $9.50 $8.75 $8.75 $21.00 $21.00 $7.50 $7.50 $10.00 $10.00 $7.25 $7.25 $8.70 $8.70 $8.00 $8.00
7 Installation 0 to 200 square feet, 6 inch thic 1 SF $6.89 $6.89 $11.50 $11.50 $11.00 $11.00 $9.75 $9.75 $21.00 $21.00 $8.10 $8.10 $14.00 $14.00 $8.50 $8.50 $8.80 $8.80 $10.20 $10.20
8 Price more than 200 square feet, 6 inch thic 1 SF $6.59 $6.59 $9.50 $9.50 $10.50 $10.50 $9.50 $9.50 $21.00 $21.00 $8.10 $8.10 $12.00 $12.00 $8.25 $8.25 $8.70 $8.70 $10.20 $10.20
9 Less than 1 foot in height 1 LF $6.30 $6.30 $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $20.00 $30.00 $30.00 $68.00 $68.00 $35.00 $35.00 $55.00 $55.00 $30.00 $30.00 $130.00 $130.00 $65.00 $65.00
10 1 to 2 feet in height 1 LF $6.30 $6.30 $20.00 $20.00 $30.00 $30.00 $60.00 $60.00 $79.00 $79.00 $45.00 $45.00 $99.00 $99.00 $40.00 $40.00 $150.00 $150.00 $95.00 $95.00
11 over 2 to 3 feet in height 1 LF $6.30 $6.30 $28.00 $28.00 $40.00 $40.00 $90.00 $90.00 $90.00 $90.00 $75.00 $75.00 $145.00 $145.00 $50.00 $50.00 $200.00 $200.00 $105.00 $105.00
12 over 3 to 4 feet in height 1 LF $6.30 $6.30 $40.00 $40.00 $80.00 $80.00 $120.00 $120.00 $102.00 $102.00 $95.00 $95.00 $190.00 $190.00 $55.00 $55.00 $300.00 $300.00 $115.00 $115.00
13 over 4 to 5 feet in height 1 LF $29.90 $29.90 $45.00 $45.00 $100.00 $100.00 $150.00 $150.00 $113.00 $113.00 $105.00 $105.00 $220.00 $220.00 $70.00 $70.00 $350.00 $350.00 $130.00 $130.00
14 Install all types of curb ramps in accordance 1 EA $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $750.00 $750.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,450.00 $1,450.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
15 Bermuda grass - price to include 4 inch Tops 1 SF $6.00 $6.00 $8.00 $8.00 $18.00 $18.00 $1.00 $1.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.50 $7.50 $2.00 $2.00 $8.50 $8.50 $2.75 $2.75 $3.00 $3.00
16 St. Augustine grass - price to include 4 inch 1 SF $6.50 $6.50 $8.00 $8.00 $18.00 $18.00 $1.25 $1.25 $8.00 $8.00 $10.00 $10.00 $2.50 $2.50 $8.50 $8.50 $2.85 $2.85 $3.00 $3.00
17 5 inch 4,000 p.s.i. concrete for pavement - 1 SY $78.80 $78.80 $84.00 $84.00 $75.00 $75.00 $79.50 $79.50 $170.00 $170.00 $66.70 $66.70 $100.00 $100.00 $85.00 $85.00 $78.00 $78.00 $90.00 $90.00
18 5inch 4,000 p.s.i. concrete for pavement - N 1 SY $78.60 $78.60 $80.00 $80.00 $73.00 $73.00 $77.00 $77.00 $124.00 $124.00 $66.70 $66.70 $80.00 $80.00 $75.00 $75.00 $78.00 $78.00 $90.00 $90.00
19 6 inch 4,000 p.s.i. high early 6 sack concrete 1 SY $134.50 $134.50 $95.00 $95.00 $82.00 $82.00 $87.50 $87.50 $181.00 $181.00 $89.83 $89.83 $150.00 $150.00 $175.00 $175.00 $180.00 $180.00 $125.00 $125.00
20 6 inch 4,000 p.s.i. high early 6 sack concrete 1 SY $134.45 $134.45 $90.00 $90.00 $82.00 $82.00 $85.00 $85.00 $127.00 $127.00 $89.83 $89.83 $120.00 $120.00 $165.00 $165.00 $180.00 $180.00 $125.00 $125.00
21 6 inch 4,000 p.s.i. 3 day cure high early 7 sa 1 SY $137.50 $137.50 $105.00 $105.00 $85.00 $85.00 $87.00 $87.00 $186.00 $186.00 $79.43 $79.43 $110.00 $110.00 $115.00 $115.00 $180.00 $180.00 $135.00 $135.00
22 6 inch 4,000 p.s.i. 3 day cure high early 7 sa 1 SY $127.50 $127.50 $98.00 $98.00 $85.00 $85.00 $84.50 $84.50 $129.00 $129.00 $78.43 $78.43 $100.00 $100.00 $113.00 $113.00 $195.00 $195.00 $135.00 $135.00
23 6 inch 4,200 p.s.i. high early 7 sack concretg 1 SY $137.50 $137.50 $105.00 $105.00 $80.00 $80.00 $85.00 $85.00 $188.00 $188.00 $80.43 $80.43 $109.00 $109.00 $118.00 $118.00 $180.00 $180.00 $135.00 $135.00
24 6 inch 4,200 p.s.i. high early 7 sack concretd 1 SY $127.50 $127.50 $100.00 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 $82.50 $82.50 $130.00 $130.00 $80.43 $80.43 $99.00 $99.00 $115.00 $115.00 $180.00 $180.00 $135.00 $135.00
25 6 inch 4,200 p.s.i. high early 7 sack concretg 1 SY $142.25 $142.25 $105.00 $105.00 $83.00 $83.00 $85.00 $85.00 $131.00 $131.00 $89.83 $89.83 $145.00 $145.00 $118.00 $118.00 $180.00 $180.00 $135.00 $135.00
26 8 inch 4,000 p.s.i. concrete for pavement ny 1 SY $82.15 $82.15 $120.00 $120.00 $88.00 $88.00 $97.00 $97.00 $192.00 $192.00 $78.76 $78.76 $115.00 $115.00 $91.00 $91.00 $190.00 $190.00 $105.00 $105.00
27 8 inch 4,000 p.s.i. concrete for pavement ny 1 SY $81.75 $81.75 $115.00 $115.00 $88.00 $88.00 $94.50 $94.50 $133.00 $133.00 $76.40 $76.40 $100.00 $100.00 $89.00 $89.00 $195.00 $195.00 $105.00 $105.00
28 8 inch 4,200 p.s.i. high early concrete for pa 1 SY $141.15 $141.15 $140.00 $140.00 $90.00 $90.00 $97.00 $97.00 $133.00 $133.00 $86.00 $86.00 $120.00 $120.00 $93.00 $93.00 $195.00 $195.00 $135.00 $135.00
29 10 inch 4,000 p.s.i. high early concrete for p 1 SY $153.55 $153.55 $150.00 $150.00 $100.00 $100.00 $112.50 $112.50 $215.00 $215.00 $107.50 $107.50 $150.00 $150.00 $195.00 $195.00 $195.00 $195.00 $145.00 $145.00
30 10 inch 4,000 p.s.i. high early concrete for pj 1 SY $153.15 $153.15 $140.00 $140.00 $100.00 $100.00 $110.25 $110.25 $170.00 $170.00 $107.50 $107.50 $130.00 $130.00 $190.00 $190.00 $350.00 $350.00 $145.00 $145.00
31 10 inch 4,200 p.s.i. high early concrete for p 1 SY $154.60 $154.60 $150.00 $150.00 $105.00 $105.00 $112.50 $112.50 $216.00 $216.00 $107.50 $107.50 $150.00 $150.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $145.00 $145.00
32 10 inch 4,200 p.s.i. high early concrete for p 1 SY $154.20 $154.20 $145.00 $145.00 $105.00 $105.00 $110.25 $110.25 $171.00 $171.00 $107.50 $107.50 $130.00 $130.00 $195.00 $195.00 $195.00 $195.00 $145.00 $145.00
33 [Remove/replace 18 inch curb and gutter to 1 LF S47.27 $47.27 $40.00 $40.00 $30.00 $30.00 $43.00 $43.00 $45.00 $45.00 $30.00 $30.00 $58.00 $58.00 $40.00 $40.00 $75.00 $75.00 $95.00 $95.00
34 Remove/replace 18 inch curb and gutter to 1 LF $46.67 $46.67 $37.00 $37.00 $30.00 $30.00 $41.00 $41.00 $40.00 $40.00 $29.00 $29.00 $47.00 $47.00 $35.00 $35.00 $65.00 $65.00 $95.00 $95.00
35 18 inch mountable curb and gutter 4,000 p. 1 LF $39.67 $39.67 $40.00 $40.00 $30.00 $30.00 $43.00 $43.00 $40.00 $40.00 $29.00 $29.00 $48.00 $48.00 $30.00 $30.00 $75.00 $75.00 $85.00 $85.00
36 Type A Grade 2 Flexbase provided, placed a 1 cY $8.67 $8.67 $36.00 $36.00 $75.00 $75.00 $60.00 $60.00 $85.00 $85.00 $34.00 $34.00 $112.00 $112.00 $32.50 $32.50 $80.00 $80.00 $12.00 $12.00
37 5 to 6 inch depth integral color stamped pat 1 SY $93.15 $93.15 $108.00 $108.00 $250.00 $250.00 $155.00 $155.00 $203.00 $203.00 $146.56 $146.56 $115.00 $115.00 $150.00 $150.00 $210.00 $210.00 $130.00 $130.00
38 4 inch Reinforced Concrete riprap 4000 p.s. 1 SY No Bid $82.00 $82.00 $130.00 $130.00 $87.50 $87.50 $183.00 $183.00 $68.00 $68.00 $77.00 $77.00 $75.00 $75.00 $160.00 $160.00 $85.00 $85.00
39 4 inch Reinforced Concrete riprap 4000 p.s. 1 SY No Bid $80.00 $80.00 $130.00 $130.00 $85.00 $85.00 $108.00 $108.00 $65.00 $65.00 $58.00 $58.00 $73.00 $73.00 $140.00 $140.00 $85.00 $85.00
40 Add Median Nose Construction 1 SY $155.10 $155.10 $700.00 $700.00 $200.00 $200.00 $100.00 $100.00 $175.00 $175.00 $70.00 $70.00 $100.00 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $175.00 $175.00
41 Remove and replace storm water pipe 18 in 1 LF No Bid $70.00 $70.00 $400.00 $400.00 $100.00 $100.00 $226.00 $226.00 $800.00 $800.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $350.00 $350.00 $100.00 $100.00
42 Remove and replace storm water pipe 24 in 1 LF No Bid $75.00 $75.00 $500.00 $500.00 $125.00 $125.00 $283.00 $283.00 $800.00 $800.00 $195.00 $195.00 $200.00 $200.00 $350.00 $350.00 $125.00 $125.00
43 |Remove and replace storm water pipe 36 in 1 LF No Bid $80.00 $80.00 $600.00 $600.00 $150.00 $150.00 $339.00 $339.00 $800.00 $800.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $450.00 $450.00 $150.00 $150.00
44 Install 4 inch French drain up to 1 foot 1 LF No Bid $23.00 $23.00 $60.00 $60.00 $35.00 $35.00 $34.00 $34.00 $15.00 $15.00 $60.00 $60.00 $30.00 $30.00 $24.00 $24.00 $300.00 $300.00
45 Install 6 inch French drain up to 1 foot 1 LF No Bid $28.00 $28.00 $70.00 $70.00 $50.00 $50.00 $40.00 $40.00 $16.00 $16.00 $65.00 $65.00 $35.00 $35.00 $24.00 $24.00 $400.00 $400.00
46 6 inch 4000 PSI R.C. PFMT. Price per square 1 SY No Bid $108.00 $108.00 $90.00 $90.00 $123.50 $123.50 $181.00 $181.00 $79.43 $79.43 $109.00 $109.00 $160.00 $160.00 $79.50 $79.50 $125.00 $125.00
47 6 inch 4000 PSI R.C. PFMT. Price per square 1 SY No Bid $100.00 $100.00 $90.00 $90.00 $121.00 $121.00 $130.00 $130.00 $78.43 $78.43 $99.00 $99.00 $150.00 $150.00 $79.50 $79.50 $125.00 $125.00
48 8 inch 4000 PSI R.C. PFMT 0-40 square yard 1 SY No Bid $140.00 $140.00 $100.00 $100.00 $138.00 $138.00 $192.00 $192.00 $78.76 $78.76 $115.00 $115.00 $170.00 $170.00 $82.50 $82.50 $135.00 $135.00
49 8 inch PSI R.C. PFMT over 40 square yards 1 SY No Bid $135.00 $135.00 $100.00 $100.00 $135.50 $135.50 $192.00 $192.00 $76.40 $76.40 $100.00 $100.00 $160.00 $160.00 $82.50 $82.50 $135.00 $135.00
50 8 inch 4000 PSI R.C. Curb with 18 inch Gutts 1 LF No Bid $50.00 $50.00 $30.00 $30.00 $65.00 $65.00 $134.00 $134.00 $35.00 $35.00 $47.00 $47.00 $35.00 $35.00 $82.50 $82.50 $100.00 $100.00
51 2 inch Hot Mixed Asphalt Conc. Over 6" Cor 1 SY $200.00 $200.00 $125.00 $125.00 $153.50 $153.50 $90.00 $90.00 $52.53 $52.53 $150.00 $150.00 $275.00 $275.00 $65.00 $65.00 $125.00 $125.00
52 2 inch Hot Mixed Asphalt Conc. Over 6" Corf 1 SY $180.00 $180.00 $125.00 $125.00 $151.00 $151.00 $17.00 $17.00 $52.53 $52.53 $120.00 $120.00 $250.00 $250.00 $75.00 $75.00 $125.00 $125.00
53 4 inch 4000 PSI Exposed Aggregate Concretg 1 SY $108.00 $108.00 $80.00 $80.00 $130.00 $130.00 $226.00 $226.00 $117.00 $117.00 $85.00 $85.00 $90.00 $90.00 $190.00 $190.00 $100.00 $100.00
54 6 inch 4000 PSI Exposed Aggregate Concrety 1 SY $110.00 $110.00 $90.00 $90.00 $144.50 $144.50 $237.00 $237.00 $117.00 $117.00 $95.00 $95.00 $80.00 $80.00 $190.00 $190.00 $125.00 $125.00
55 |Price per square yard for High Early 7 Sack d 1 SY No Bid $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00(No Bid $93.30 $93.30 $88.00 $88.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $175.00 $175.00
56 6 inch 4000 PSI R.C. PFMT 0-40 square yard 1 SY No Bid $150.00 $150.00 $155.00 $155.00 $190.00 $190.00 $160.00 $160.00 $125.00 $125.00 $160.00 $160.00 $78.50 $78.50 $250.00 $250.00
57 6 inch 4000 PSI R.C. PFMT over 40 square Y4 1 SY No Bid $150.00 $150.00 $152.00 $152.00 $136.00 $136.00 $160.00 $160.00 $110.00 $110.00 $150.00 $150.00 $78.50 $78.50 $250.00 $250.00
58 8 inch 4000 PSI R.C. PFMT 0-40 square yard 1 SY No Bid $250.00 $250.00 $169.50 $169.50 $194.00 $194.00 $170.00 $170.00 $130.00 $130.00 $170.00 $170.00 $82.50 $82.50 $300.00 $300.00
59 8 inch 4000 PSI R.C. PFMT over 40 square Y4 1 SY No Bid $250.00 $250.00 $166.50 $166.50 $138.00 $138.00 $170.00 $170.00 $125.00 $125.00 $160.00 $160.00 $82.50 $82.50 $300.00 $300.00
60 8 inch 4000 PSI R.C. Curb with 18 inch Gutts 1 LFT No Bid $40.00 $40.00 $100.00 $100.00 $45.00 $45.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $55.00 $55.00 $100.00 $100.00 $325.00 $325.00
61 |[Price per square yard for High Early 7 Sack d 1 LF No Bid $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00(No Bid $140.00 $140.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $220.00 $220.00 $175.00 $175.00
62 4 inch White line, Thermo 1 LF No Bid No Bid $1.15 $1.15|No Bid $1.10 $1.10 $1.50 $1.50 $3.50 $3.50 $6.50 $6.50 $10.00 $10.00
63 6 inch White line, Thermo 1 LF No Bid No Bid $1.65 $1.65|No Bid $1.65 $1.65 $2.00 $2.00 $4.50 $4.50 $7.00 $7.00 $15.00 $15.00
64 8 inch White line Thermo 1 LF No Bid No Bid $2.20 $2.20(No Bid $2.20 $2.20 $3.00 $3.00 $5.50 $5.50 $8.50 $8.50 $20.00 $20.00
65 12 inch White stop bar, Thermo 1 LF No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.40|No Bid $4.40 $4.40 $10.00 $10.00 $9.00 $9.00 $32.50 $32.50 $35.00 $35.00
66 24 inch White stop bar, Thermo 1 LF No Bid No Bid $6.60 $6.60|No Bid $6.60 $6.60 $18.00 $18.00 $18.50 $18.50 $65.00 $65.00 $50.00 $50.00
67 4 inch Yellow line, Thermo 1 LF No Bid No Bid $1.15 $1.15|No Bid $1.10 $1.10 $1.50 $1.50 $3.50 $3.50 $4.50 $4.50 $10.00 $10.00
68 6 inch Yellow line, Thermo 1 LF No Bid No Bid $1.65 $1.65|No Bid $1.65 $1.65 $2.00 $2.00 $4.50 $4.50 $5.50 $5.50 $15.00 $15.00
69 8 inch Yellow line, Thermo 1 LF No Bid No Bid S2.20 $2.20|No Bid $2.20 $2.20 $3.00 $3.00 $7.00 $7.00 $7.50 $7.50 $20.00 $20.00
70 Railroad symbol, Thermo 1 EA No Bid No Bid $825.00 $825.00|No Bid $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $800.00 $800.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $550.00 $550.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
71 Left or right arrow, Thermo 1 EA No Bid No Bid $165.00 $165.00|No Bid $165.00 $165.00 $275.00 $275.00 $250.00 $250.00 $800.00 $800.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
71 ALT1 |SECTION 5. STRIPING - Remove, prepare, an|STRIPE-A-ZON|STRIP-A-ZONE|1 EA $950.00

72 Straight arrow, Thermo 1 EA No Bid No Bid $165.00 $165.00|No Bid $165.00 $165.00 $275.00 $275.00 $250.00 $250.00 $800.00 $800.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
73 2 combination arrow, Thermo 1 EA No Bid No Bid $220.00 $220.00|No Bid $220.00 $220.00 $420.00 $420.00 $300.00 $300.00 $800.00 $800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
74 3 combination arrow, Thermo 1 EA No Bid No Bid $275.00 $275.00|No Bid $275.00 $275.00 $600.00 $600.00 $350.00 $350.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
75 Only, Thermo 1 EA No Bid No Bid $165.00 $165.00|No Bid $175.00 $175.00 $320.00 $320.00 $200.00 $200.00 $950.00 $950.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
76 Bike lane "Man" symbol, Thermo 1 EA No Bid No Bid $585.00 $585.00|No Bid $580.00 $580.00 $350.00 $350.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $800.00 $800.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
77 Bike lane "Shallow" symbol, Thermo 1 EA No Bid No Bid $585.00 $585.00|No Bid $580.00 $580.00 $550.00 $550.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $800.00 $800.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
78  |II-CR, acrylic, reflective RPM clear/red 4 inch 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4.40 S4.40|No Bid $4.40 $4.40 $6.00 $6.00 $5.00 $5.00 $6.50 $6.50 $20.00 $20.00
79  |lI-AA, acrylic, reflective RPM amber/amber 4 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4.40 S4.40|No Bid $4.40 $4.40 $6.00 $6.00 $5.00 $5.00 $7.50 $7.50 $20.00 $20.00
80 [II-CC, acrylic, reflective RPM clear/clear 4 in 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4.40 S4.40|No Bid $4.40 $4.40 $6.00 $6.00 $5.00 $5.00 $8.50 $8.50 $20.00 $20.00
81 [II-BB, acrylic, reflective RPM blue/blue 4 ind 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4.40 S4.40|No Bid $4.40 $4.40 $10.00 $10.00 $5.00 $5.00 $9.50 $9.50 $20.00 $20.00
82 II-AR,acrylic, reflective RPM amber/red 4 in( 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.40(No Bid $4.40 $4.40 $6.00 $6.00 $5.00 $5.00 $8.50 $8.50 $20.00 $20.00
83 |II-RR, acrylic, reflective RPM red/red 4 inch 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.40|No Bid $4.40 $4.40 $6.00 $6.00 $5.00 $5.00 $8.50 $8.50 $20.00 $20.00
84  |I-C, acrylic, reflective clear 4 inch 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4.40 S4.40|No Bid $4.40 $4.40 $6.00 $6.00 $5.00 $5.00 $9.50 $9.50 $20.00 $20.00
85 RPM removal concrete 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.40|No Bid $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $0.75 $0.75 $10.00 $10.00
86 RPM removal asphalt 1 EA No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.40(No Bid $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.40 $1.40 $0.75 $0.75 $10.00 $10.00
87 |Surface marking removal, grinding 1 SF No Bid No Bid $2.75 $2.75|No Bid $2.75 $2.75 $10.25 $10.25 $3.15 $3.15 $13.50 $13.50 $10.00 $10.00
88 White yield bar, Thermo 1 SF No Bid No Bid $16.50 $16.50|No Bid $8.25 $8.25 $45.00 $45.00 $6.50 $6.50 $60.00 $60.00 $25.00 $25.00
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