Supplier Name
AV Cabling Contractors Aqua Bore LLC

Total Cost $351,721.00 $125,528.00

Unit
Line Quantity Unit Total Unit Total

Item Description of
Item # P Price Cost Price Cost
Measurement

60 ft. or less for water boring service

#0-1 for %” —1 %" pipe 50 Segment 6,400.00 320,000.00 1,800.00 90,000.00
61 ft. - 100 ft. for water boring
#0-2 service for %” — 1 %" pipe 1 Segment 1,000.00 1,000.00 1,800.00 1,800.00

Cost per foot for water boring
service in excess of 100 ft., for %” — 1

#0-3 %" pipe 1 Linear Foot 25.00 25.00 15.00 15.00
60 ft. or less for boring service for 2"

#0-4 pipe 1 Segment 7,000.00 7,000.00 1,800.00 1,800.00
61 ft. to 100’ for boring service for 2”

#0-5 pipe 1 Segment 1,100.00 1,100.00 1,800.00 1,800.00
Cost per LF for boring service in

#0-6 excess of 100 ft., for 2” pipe 1 Linear Foot 23.00 23.00 15.00 15.00
60 ft. or less for boring service 3"

#0-7 pipe 1 Segment 7,250.00 7,250.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
61 ft. to 100’ for boring service for 3”

#0-8 pipe 1 Segment 1,250.00 1,250.00 2,500.00 2,500.00
Cost per LF for boring service in

#0-9 excess of 100 ft., for 3” pipe 1 Linear Foot 35.00 35.00 18.00 18.00
60 ft. or less for boring service for 4”

#0-10 |pipe 1 Segment 7,500.00 7,500.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
61 ft. to 100’ for boring service for 4”

#0-11 |pipe 1 Segment 1,500.00 1,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00
Cost per LF for boring service in

#0-12 |excess of 100 ft., for 4” pipe 1 Linear Foot 38.00 38.00 20.00 20.00
60 ft. or less for boring service for 6"

#0-13 |pipe 1 Segment No Bid No Bid 2,500.00 2,500.00
61 ft. to 100’ for boring service for 6”

#0-14 |pipe 1 Segment No Bid No Bid 3,000.00 3,000.00
Cost per LF for boring service in

#0-15 |excess of 100 ft., for 6” pipe 1 Linear Foot No Bid No Bid 25.00 25.00
60 ft. or less for boring service for 8"

#0-16 |pipe 1 Segment No Bid No Bid 3,500.00 3,500.00
61 ft. to 100’ for boring service for 8”

#0-17 |pipe 1 Segment No Bid No Bid 3,500.00 3,500.00

Cost per LF for boring service in

#0-18 |excess of 100 ft., for 8” pipe 1 Linear Foot No Bid No Bid 35.00 35.00
#0-19 |2” Core such as into a storm drain 1 Each No Bid No Bid 1,000.00 1,000.00
#0-20 |3” Core such as into a storm drain 1 Each No Bid No Bid 1,000.00 1,000.00
#0-21 |4” Core such as into a storm drain 1 Each No Bid No Bid 1,000.00 1,000.00
#0-22 |2” Connection such as a drain box 1 Each No Bid No Bid 300.00 300.00
#0-23 |3” Connection such as a drain box 1 Each No Bid No Bid 300.00 300.00
#0-24 |4” Connection such as a drain box 1 Each No Bid No Bid 400.00 400.00

Rock Conditions Bore — 2” pipe or

less for water boring service up to 50
#0-25 |ft. 1 Segment No Bid No Bid 2,500.00 2,500.00
State your charge for emergency
#0-26 |service call out (mobilization fee). 1 Each $5,000.00 $5,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00




