23-33FP - Street Materials

Green Dream International

Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC

JCL L4 Construction, LLC

Scoring Summary - Award by line items Total Price $703,975.00( Total Price $826,271.00| Total Price| $1,635,350.00
Line#  Description Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 #1 Flex Base - Flexible base, TXDOT ltem 247, Type A, Grade 1 (Quarried material) $26.48 $264,800.00 $33.46 $334,600.00 $38.75 $387,500.00
5 Type B, Grade 3 Aggregate - Aggregate for surface, TXDOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed

stone, Grade 3 No Bid No Bid $38.75 $77,500.00
3 Type B, Grade 4 Aggregate - Aggregate for surface, TXDOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed

stone, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid $38.75 $193,750.00
4 Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate - Aggregate for surface, TXDOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed

stone, Grade 5 No Bid No Bid $38.75 $193,750.00
5 1/4" Clean Aggregate, multiple fracture No Bid $33.46 $16,730.00 $50.00 $25,000.00
6 3/8" Clean Aggregate, multiple fracture $33.00 $33,000.00 $32.46 $32,460.00 $42.50 $42,500.00
7 1" Utility Rock, TXDOT Item 302 $33.00 $33,000.00 $32.78 $32,780.00 $46.00 $46,000.00

Grade 5 Chip Rock, TXDOT item 302, multiple fracture, cubicle, less than 5% 200
8 screen No Bid No Bid $50.00 $25,000.00
9 Concrete Wash Sand - Must meet specifications in accordance with the latest NCTCOG

Public Works Construction Standards, Division 300 Roadway Construction $40.70 $150,590.00 $39.28 $145,336.00 $32.25 $119,325.00

Screened Cushion Sand - Must meet specifications in accordance with the latest
10 NCTCOG Public Works Construction Standards, Division 300 Roadway Construction

(Sieve Square-Opening less than or equal to ) $28.05 $103,785.00 $39.36 $145,632.00 $22.25 $82,325.00

Manufactured Sand - Must meet specifications in accordance with the latest NCTCOG
11 Public Works Construction Standards, Division 300 Roadway Construction (Sieve

Square-Opening less than or equal to ) No Bid $32.09 $118,733.00 $41.00 $151,700.00
12  Topsoil - Topsoil, TXDOT ltem 160 $29.70 $118,800.00|No Bid $29.00 $116,000.00
13 Asphalt Millings No Bid No Bid $35.00 $175,000.00
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