
Total Price $7,485.29 Total Price $8,360.50 Total Price $9,148.19
Line # Description Mfgr QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 P255/70R16 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $135.40 $135.40 $133.00 $133.00 $110.62 $110.62
2 P245/70R17 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $111.92 $111.92 $118.26 $118.26 $135.67 $135.67
3 P265/70R17 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $135.25 $135.25 $118.26 $118.26 $142.68 $142.68
4 P235/70R17 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $120.00 $120.00 $142.00 $142.00 $147.10 $147.10
5 235/55R17 RSA Goodyear 1 EA $113.90 $113.90 $126.00 $126.00 $131.02 $131.02

6
LT 225/90R16 (7.50X16) Trailer

Not Brand 
Specific 1 EA $119.00 $119.00 No Bid $128.76 $128.76

7
215/75R17.5 (G114) Trailer

Not Brand 
Specific 1 EA $240.00 $240.00 $266.77 $266.77 $266.77 $266.77

8 385/65R22.5 (G296) Goodyear 1 EA $480.00 $480.00 $851.67 $851.67 $690.48 $690.48
9 225/70R19.5 (G647) Goodyear 1 EA $245.00 $245.00 $308.40 $308.40 $308.40 $308.40

10
7.00-15/ST205D15 Trailer

Not Brand 
Specific 1 EA $99.00 $99.00 $95.31 $95.31 $105.14 $105.14

11 LT245/75R17 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $150.02 $150.02 $151.00 $151.00 $172.97 $172.97
12 P265/70R17 AT Wrangler Goodyear 1 EA $161.90 $161.90 $118.26 $118.26 $181.02 $181.02
13 P235/70R16 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $128.17 $128.17 $111.83 $111.83 $118.28 $118.28
14 P255/65R17 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $118.00 $118.00 $122.45 $122.45 $129.52 $129.52
15 11R24.5 (G661) STEER Goodyear 1 EA $375.00 $375.00 $420.63 $420.63 $461.03 $461.03
16 P235/75R17 All Terrain Goodyear 1 EA $123.72 $123.72 $133.46 $133.46 $155.31 $155.31
17 LT245/75R16 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $120.93 $120.93 $121.00 $121.00 $146.36 $146.36
18 P265/60R17 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $126.89 $126.89 $135.00 $135.00 $149.38 $149.38
19 P245/55R18 RSA Goodyear 1 EA $133.39 $133.39 $139.54 $139.54 $154.92 $154.92
20 215/55R16 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $100.63 $100.63 $104.49 $104.49 $104.03 $104.03

21
ST235/80R16 Trailer

Not Brand 
Specific 1 EA $119.00 $119.00 $130.52 $130.52 $159.70 $159.70

22 P275/65R18 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $133.00 $133.00 $142.00 $142.00 $165.99 $165.99
23 235/65R16 Highway Goodyear 1 EA $149.95 $149.95 $93.81 $93.81 $178.28 $178.28
24 255/60R18 Enforcer Goodyear 1 EA $124.37 $124.37 $154.00 $154.00 $170.53 $170.53
25 275/55R20 RSA Goodyear 1 EA $167.94 $167.94 $152.00 $152.00 $157.85 $157.85

26
24/12.00-12 Tractor/lawn 
Mower

Not Brand 
Specific 1 EA $119.00 $119.00 No Bid $106.45 $106.45

27 425/65R22.5 Goodyear 1 EA $545.00 $545.00 $804.14 $804.14 $865.21 $865.21

28
11R22.5 STEER (Endurance) 
Highway Goodyear 1 EA $352.00 $352.00 $537.71 $537.71 $497.33 $497.33

29
11R22.5 (G622) LUG All Terrain Goodyear 1 EA $347.00 $347.00 $523.97 $523.97 $484.63 $484.63
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30
11L-16 OFF ROAD Tractor

Not Brand 
Specific 1 EA $194.70 $194.70 No Bid $180.81 $180.81

31 315/80R22.5 (G289) Goodyear 1 EA $460.00 $460.00 $523.46 $523.46 $547.57 $547.57

32
225/70R19.5 LUG (G622)All 
Terrain Goodyear 1 EA $255.00 $255.00 $313.32 $313.32 $313.32 $313.32

33
12.5X80-18 Tractor

Not Brand 
Specific 1 EA $307.95 $307.95 $255.20 $255.20 $338.44 $338.44

34
12R22.5 STEER (Endurance) 
Highway Goodyear 1 EA $385.00 $385.00 $588.24 $588.24 $554.94 $554.94

35
14X17.5 LOADER NHS

Not Brand 
Specific 1 EA $352.26 $352.26 $424.80 $424.80 $384.19 $384.19

36
26/12.00-12 Tractor/Lawn 
Mower

Not Brand 
Specific 1 EA $135.00 $135.00 No Bid $103.49 $103.49

37 Tire Delivery 1 EA $0.00 $0.00

38
State percent discount off full 
price sheet/catalog for all other 
tires available to the City. 1 EA 20.0% 60.0% 0.0%
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