
Event Number 17-65FP Organization McKinney Purchasing

Event Title Erosion Control and Miscellaneous Drainage RepairsWorkgroup City of McKinney, Texas

Event Description The City of McKinney is accepting sealed bids toward establishing an annual fixed price contract for Erosion Control and Miscellaneous Drainage Repair. THE BID SHALL INCLUDE ALL LABOR, MATERIALS, AND EQUIPMENT TO PROVIDE THE DEFINED SERVICES.Event Owner John Lemmond

Event Type ITB Email jlemmond@mckinneytexas.org

Issue Date 6/25/2017 09:00:01 AM (CT) Phone (972) 547-2087

Close Date 7/13/2017 02:00:00 PM (CT) Fax (972) 547-7585

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)allen TX 7/13/2017 12:16:33 PM (CT) 40 $7,681.83

North Texas Contracting, Inc. Keller TX 7/14/2017 12:50:00 PM (CT) 82 $211,874.00

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification.  No alternate response data is included.
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1

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 PKG $275.00 $275.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 PKG $440.00 $440.00

1.1

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hour $25.00 $25.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hour $40.00 $40.00 Labor per man per hour

1.2

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hour $250.00 $250.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hour $400.00 $400.00 $ 400.00 per day

2

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 PKG $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1500.00 minimum charge to hydromulch

2.1

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Square footNo Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Square foot $1,500.00 $1,500.00

2.2

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 EA No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 EA $1,500.00 $1,500.00 Not including watering

3

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 PKG $1,000.00 $1,000.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 PKG $23,000.00 $23,000.00

3.1

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Minimum site visit charges (if any) per visit.

CONTRACTOR MOBILIZATION

For each project less than $25,000; between the hours of 7:00am and 4:00pm Monday through Friday.

EROSION CONTROL SERVICES:  Labor for repairs

Labor for repairs to existing erosion control not listed.  Price per person, per hour.

Minimum labor charges (if any) per person, per hour.

HYDROMULCH SERVICES:

30 pounds cellulose paper mulch, 2 pounds hulled Bermuda seed 95/85, 10 pounds homogenized fertilizer 13-13-13. Tackifier (Tac) brand and quantity to be 

determined by vendor.  Tac will be required to hold mixture together. Pricing should be based on good, level soil.  Watering requirements should not be 

included in bid as requirements may change with each job.  Must maintain grass until 80% germination.
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jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hour $250.00 $250.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hour $5,000.00 $5,000.00

3.2

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hour $250.00 $250.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hour $5,000.00 $5,000.00

3.3

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hour $250.00 $250.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hour $5,000.00 $5,000.00

3.4

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hour $250.00 $250.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hour $8,000.00 $8,000.00

4

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 PKG $3,170.00 $3,170.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 PKG $28,905.00 $28,905.00

4.1

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each $3,000.00 $3,000.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $6,000.00 $6,000.00 Includes Removal

4.2

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Ton $40.00 $40.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Ton $45.00 $45.00 Material Delivered Only

4.3

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Ton $40.00 $40.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Ton $47.00 $47.00 Material Delivered Only

For any project on weekends (after 4:00pm Friday and before 7:00am Monday).

INSTALLED MATERIALS:  Cost per unit including delivery and installation. 

Slope and channel protection materials including gabion structures, riprap and geotextiles must meet specifications with the latest NCTCOG Public Works 

Construction entrance (rock entrance)

3 to 8 inch gabion rock

8 inch diameter to 12 inch diameter loose rock riprap

For each project $25,000 to $75,000; between the hours of 7:00am and 4:00pm Monday through Friday.

For each project greater than $75,000; between the hours of 7:00am and 4:00pm Monday through Friday.
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4.4

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Ton $40.00 $40.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Ton $50.00 $50.00 Material Delivered Only

4.5

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Ton $50.00 $50.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Ton $60.00 $60.00 Material Delivered Only

4.6

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $1,200.00 $1,200.00 Material Delivered Only

4.7

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $1,800.00 $1,800.00 Material Delivered Only

4.8

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $1,900.00 $1,900.00 Material Delivered Only

4.9

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $2,100.00 $2,100.00 Material Delivered Only

4.10

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $2,500.00 $2,500.00 Material Delivered Only

4.11

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $2,700.00 $2,700.00 Material Delivered Only

9 feet x 3 feet x 3 feet PVC coated gabion basket

12 feet x 3 feet x 1 feet PVC coated gabion basket

12 feet x 3 feet x 1.5 feet PVC coated gabion basket

18 inch diameter to 24 inch diameter loose rock riprap

24 inch diameter to 36 inch diameter loose rock riprap

6 feet x 3 feet x 3 feet PVC coated gabion basket

9 feet x 3 feet x 1 feet PVC coated gabion basket

9 feet x 3 feet x 1.5 feet PVC coated gabion basket
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4.12

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $3,000.00 $3,000.00 Material Delivered Only

4.13

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $7,000.00 $7,000.00 Material Delivered Only

4.14

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Box No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Box $500.00 $500.00 Material Delivered Only

4.15

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Square footNo Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Square foot $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 per SY   Material Delivered Only

5

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 PKG $3,530.00 $3,530.00

5.1

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $200.00 $200.00 10' Minimum Charge

5.2

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $230.00 $230.00 10' Minimum Charge

5.3

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $250.00 $250.00 10' Minimum Charge

18 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

Galvanized hog rings - 100 per box

Geo textile fabric (8 ounce material)

INSTALLED MATERIALS:  Cost per unit including delivery and installation.  

Reinforced concrete pipe (RCP) and reinforced concrete box culvert must meet specifications in accordance with the latest NCTCOG Public Works 

Construction Standards, Division 500 Underground Construction & Appurtenances.  For underground utility construction, a trench safety plan, sealed by a 

12 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

15 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

12 feet x 3 feet x 3 feet PVC coated gabion basket

150 feet gabion roll top lid (mattress)
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5.4

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $270.00 $270.00 10' Minimum Charge

5.5

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $300.00 $300.00 10' Minimum Charge

5.6

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $330.00 $330.00 10' Minimum Charge

5.7

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear Foot $400.00 $400.00 10' Minimum Charge

5.8

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $450.00 $450.00 10' Minimum Charge

5.9

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear Foot $500.00 $500.00 10' Minimum Charge

5.10

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $600.00 $600.00 10' Minimum Charge

6

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 PKG $1,491.83 $1,491.83

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 PKG $2,779.00 $2,779.00 $1500.00 Minimum charge per project

6.1

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Square yard $1.25 $1.25

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Square yard $3.00 $3.00 Watering by the hourly rates

48 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

54 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

60 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

INSTALLED MATERIALS:  Cost per unit including delivery and installation.  

Erosion control materials must meet specifications in accordance with the latest NCTCOG Public Works Construction Standards, Division 200 Site Protection 

Bermuda hydro-mulch

24 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

30 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

36 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction

42 inch Class III RCP including trench, embedment, backfill and compaction
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6.2

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Roll $4.00 $4.00 $4.00 per SY

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Roll $325.00 $325.00

6.3

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Roll $6.00 $6.00 $6.00 per SY

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Roll $700.00 $700.00

6.4

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Roll $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 per SY

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Roll $150.00 $150.00

6.5

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Cubic yard $40.00 $40.00

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Cubic yard $40.00 $40.00

6.6

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Cubic yard $30.00 $30.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Cubic yard $170.00 $170.00 3 CY Minimum

6.7

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Linear foot $1.50 $1.50

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $6.00 $6.00

6.8

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Square Foot $42.00 $42.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Square Foot $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 per each.   10” Inlet Maximum

6.9

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each $0.15 $0.15

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $5.00 $5.00

Orange safety fence 6 foot

Inlet protection rock basket filter

8 inch silt fence cable ties

VMAX C350 Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mat by North American Green or approved equal (6.5 Feet X 55.5 Feet)

VMAX P550 Turf Reinforcement Mat by North American Green or approved equal (6.5 Feet X 55.5 Feet)

EroNet S75 Erosion Control Blanket by North American Green or approved equal (8 Feet x 112 Feet)

Compacted granular fill

Flowable fill
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6.10

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each $4.00 $4.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $30.00 $30.00

6.11

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Linear foot $1.75 $1.75

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Linear foot $3.00 $3.00

6.12

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Cubic yard $30.00 $30.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Cubic yard $60.00 $60.00

6.13

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Each $21.00 $21.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 per CY

6.14

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Cubic yard $145.00 $145.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Cubic yard $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $1750.00 per each

6.15

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Cubic yard $0.18 $0.18

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Cubic yard $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 per Pound

7

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 PKG $147,200.00 $147,200.00

7.1

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $9,000.00 $9,000.00

10 feet precast inlet

Topsoil

Wheat straw hay bales

Redi-rock product (cost per unit includes delivery to our location)

Tank dam seed mixture (sold by the pound)

INLETS, GRATES AND LIDS - furnish, deliver and install.  Inlets, grates and lids must meet specifications in accordance with the latest NCTCOG Public Works 

Construction Standards, Division 6000 Storm Water Drainage.

Silt fence T post (4 feet metal posts)

Wire back silt fence
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7.2

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $8,000.00 $8,000.00

7.3

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $3,000.00 $3,000.00

7.4

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $3,200.00 $3,200.00

7.5

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $4,000.00 $4,000.00

7.6

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $4,500.00 $4,500.00

7.7

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $5,000.00 $5,000.00

7.8

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $5,000.00 $5,000.00

7.9

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $7,000.00 $7,000.00

7.10

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $9,000.00 $9,000.00

7.11

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard curb inlet 12 feet

24 inches inlet lid (with McKinney logo)

32 inches inlet lid (with fish logo)

Standard curb inlet 5 feet

Standard curb inlet 8 feet

Standard curb inlet 10 feet

4 feet x 4 feet precast drop inlet

18 inches x 24 inches forged storm sewer grate

19 inches inlet lid (with McKinney logo)

21 inches inlet lid (with McKinney logo)
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North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $11,000.00 $11,000.00

7.12

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $14,000.00 $14,000.00

7.13

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $20,000.00 $20,000.00

7.14

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $7,000.00 $7,000.00

7.15

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $8,000.00 $8,000.00

7.16

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $7,500.00 $7,500.00

7.17

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $10,000.00 $10,000.00

7.18

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Each $12,000.00 $12,000.00

8

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 PKG $1,745.00 $1,745.00

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 PKG $3,020.00 $3,020.00

8.1

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $100.00 $100.00 1 2000 international 1HSCBAER2YJ075610 35 yd 18 wheeler demo trailer 2 2007 freight liner 1FUJA6C077LZ34167 35 yd 18 wheeler demo trailer

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $150.00 $150.00 Peterbilt 12 CY Tandem

Standard drop inlet 4 feet

Standard drop inlet 5 feet

Standard drop inlet 6 feet

EQUIPMENT: Cost per hour including operator(s).

DUMP TRUCK

Standard curb inlet 15 feet

Standard curb inlet 20 feet

Standard drop inlet 2 feet

Standard drop inlet 3 feet
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8.2

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $150.00 $150.00 88 953 20Z02280 2.25 yd bucket

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $200.00 $200.00 2014 CAT 953 W/2CY Bucket

8.3

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $175.00 $175.00 My tractor is bigger than a 320 catMine is 1998 pc300LC6 A80734 3 yd bucket

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $220.00 $220.00 2014 CAT 321 W/30” Bucket

8.4

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $120.00 $120.00 CAT 308 Mini W/12” Bucket

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $125.00 $125.00 I have a 1996 cat 311B 5PK01607 1/2 yd bucket

8.5

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $60.00 $60.00 John Deere 2016 Platform Mower

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $60.00 $60.00 Badboy 5200 lightning BBL5226KA02111003

8.6

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $80.00 $80.00 2010 Ford w/72” Platform

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $85.00 $85.00 1975 International 674

8.7

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $150.00 $150.00 1 is 1984 613B 38W07547 cat2 is 1979 613B 38W04710 cat

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $400.00 $400.00 Cut Scraper - 8 CY

8.8

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $100.00 $100.00 2014 Kabota 9960 vin 55531

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $270.00 $270.00 2010 Ford W/ 16' Mower

8.9

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $100.00 $100.00 2015 Bobcat 175

12-14 CUBIC YARD SCRAPER

TRACTOR WITH 16 FOOT MOWER

BOBCAT WITH 6 FOOT MOWER

953 CAT TRACK LOADER (or comparable)

320 CAT EXCAVATOR (or comparable) 

308 MINI EXCAVATOR (or comparable)

ZERO TURN MOWER

TRACTOR WITH 6 FOOT MOWER
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jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $100.00 $100.00 2007 252B2 cat 0252BVSCP04663

8.10

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly No Bid

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 Per Trip.  1 Day / 1 Pour Rate

8.11

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $125.00 $125.00 2006 ford 650 2000 gallon tank 3FKNF65E17V479514

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $140.00 $140.00 International 7500

8.12

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $90.00 $90.00 TBD

8.13

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $150.00 $150.00 1984 galion A450E 10963

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $220.00 $220.00 2012 CAT 140H

8.14

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $150.00 $150.00 1996 case 621B JEE0053103

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $200.00 $200.00 2015 Komatsu WA270

8.15

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $150.00 $150.00 1992 D4H 9DB04845

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $200.00 $200.00 2013 CAT D5

8.16

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

North Texas Contracting, Inc. 1 Hourly $120.00 $120.00 Ingersoll Rand 2015 SD-45

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)1 Hourly $125.00 $125.00 1 is 1980 ingersoll rand sp42 smoothdurm 231C2 is 1996 car cp433c sheepfoot 2JM00460

1,000 HP VERMEER TUB GRINDER (or comparable)

MOTOR GRADER

LOADER

BULLDOZER

STEEL WHEEL ROLLER

CONCRETE PUMP TRUCK WITH MINIMUM 125 FOOT REACH

1,500 GALLON WATER TRUCK (or comparable)
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Line # Att # Attribute Name Attribute Note jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)North Texas Contracting, Inc.

Header 1 GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONSI.      BIDDING   

A.
BIDS – The City encourages all responses to be submitted electronically on the City’s eBid system. However, the City will also accept paper bids, if received by the due date and time at the location specified in the legal notice. Paper bids submitted to the office of the Purchasing Manager shall be a minimum of one (1) original and three (3) copies of the executed Bid Form shall be submitted in a sealed envelope; as well as one (1) electronic copy in PDF format on CD, DVD or USB. Copies are to be marked as such.  

B.
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURES – The bid, whether paper or electronic must be executed personally by the vendor or duly authorized partner of the partnership or duly authorized officer of the corporation. If executed by an agent, a power of attorney or other evidence of authority to act on behalf of the vendor shall accompany the bid to become a valid bid.  

C.
LATE BIDS – Bids must be submitted electronically or in the office of the City Purchasing Manager before or at the specifAgree Agree

Header 2 CONTRACT TERM Once a contract is awarded, the unit prices offered by the successful bidder shall remain firm for the term of the contract.  Contract shall commence on date of award and continue for one (1) year period with two (2) one (1) year renewal options.Acknowledge Acknowledge

Header 3 MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONSGENERAL - It is the intent of the following minimum specifications to describe Erosion Control and Miscellaneous Drainage Repairs, including any equipment and material needed to complete the repairs.   
  
DEBRIS DISPOSAL - Depending on the nature of debris, disposal will normally be at North Texas Municipal Water District (NTMWD) Landfill, 3820 Sam Rayburn Hwy, Melissa, Texas or hauled off to facilities permitted specifically for accepting certain hazardous material.   

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY (EPA) REQUIREMENTS - EPA and Resource Conservation & Recovery Act (RCRA) associated requirements of solid waste disposal will apply.   

DAMAGE TO PROPERTY - Property damage is damage to or the destruction of public or private property, caused either by a person who is not its owner or by natural phenomena. Contractor's insurance will apply if damage is result of contractor's negligence.  Damages resulting by City of McKinney systems (overflows, etc.) will be handled by the City of McKinney.   

CONTRACTOR MOBAcknowledge Acknowledge

Header 4 PROJECT ESTIMATES 1.
Contractor shall provide written “not to exceed” estimates on all projects except for emergencies. This estimate shall include the estimated number of hours, contract hourly rate, number and type of employees required, estimated equipment cost, material cost,  and project completion in number of days. It shall be the contractor’s responsibility to ensure they have all information to prepare accurate estimates.  

2.
Non-emergency work shall only be performed with the City’s written authorization by issuance of a Purchase Order. Actual work shall not exceed the contractor’s estimate without prior written authorization by the City.  

3.
The City shall not be required to pay for the cost of preparing estimates for projects.Acknowledge Acknowledge

Header 5 EMERGENCIES STANDARD HOURSDefined as occasions when property is in danger or risk and response time is urgent.  State response time for standard hours Monday 7:00am through Friday 4:00pm.2 hours Initial

Header 6 EMERGENCIES AFTER HOURSDefined as occasions when property is in danger or risk and response time is urgent.  State response time for after standard hours, weekends and holidays.2 hours Initial

Header 7 SPECIFICATIONS - NCTCOGThe City of McKinney, Texas (the “Owner”) has adopted the North Central Texas Council of Governments (NCTCOG) October 2004 Edition of the Public Works Construction Standards - North Central Texas (as amended) (the “NCTCOG Specifications”). The NCTCOG Specifications apply to this project, except as otherwise noted herein. In the event of a contradiction or conflict between the NCTCOG Specifications and these Contract Documents, the information in these Contract Documents shall control.  
   
Bidders are specifically directed to become thoroughly familiar with the NCTCOG Specifications prior to submitting a bid. The NCTCOG Specifications may be purchased from:  
 
North Central Texas Council of Governments - 616 Six Flags Drive
P.O. Box 5888 - Arlington, Texas 76005-5888 (817)461-3300.Acknowledge Acknowledge

Header 8 SAFETY RECORD Pursuant to Section 252.0435 of the Local Government Code, the McKinney City Council will consider the safety records of potential contractors prior to awarding bids on City contracts. The City of McKinney has adopted the following written definitions and criteria for accurately determining the safety record of a bidder prior to awarding bids on City contracts. The term “bidder” includes the firm, corporation, partnership, or other legal entity represented by the bidder or anyone acting for such firm, corporation, partnership or other entity submitting the bid. The definitions and criteria for determining the safety record of a bidder are:
   
“Citations” include notices of violation, notices of enforcement, suspension/revocations of state or federal licenses or registrations, fines assessed pending criminal complaints, indictments, or convictions, administrative orders, draft orders, final orders, and judicial final judgments. Notice of Violations and Notice of Enforcement received from the TCEQ shall includAcknowledge Acknowledge

Header 9 SAFETY RECORD QUESTION 1Has the bidder received any Citations for violations of OSHA within the past five (5) years?No No

Header 10 SAFETY RECORD QUESTION 2Has the bidder received any Citations for violations of environmental protection laws or regulations within the past five (5) years?No No

Header 11 SAFETY RECORD QUESTION 3Has the bidder ever been convicted, within the past ten (10) years, of a criminal offense which resulted in or gave rise to serious bodily injury or death?No No

Header 12 SAFETY RECORD QUESTION  4Has the bidder ever been sued, within the past ten (10) years, for a negligent or wrongful international act or omission arising out of or in conjunction with a project on which the bidder worked that resulted in or gave rise to serious bodily injury or death?No No

Header 13 SAFETY RECORDS-RESPONSE TO QUESTIONSIf the bidder has indicated YES to Safety Record Questions 1, 2 and/or 3 above, the bidder must provide to the City, with its bid submission, the following information: 
A - Date of Citation or offense and location where violation or offense occurred; 
B - Type of violation or offense; 
C - Final disposition of violation or offense, if any; 
D - Penalty assessed  
 
If the bidder has indicated YES to Safety Record Question 4 above, the bidder must provide to the City, with its bid submission, the following information:  
A - Date of negligent or wrongful intentional act or omission and location where such act or omission occurred; 
B - Type of negligent or wrongful intentional act or omission asserted; 
C - Whether gross negligence was asserted;  
D - Whether a finding of gross negligence was made;  
E - Final disposition of litigation, if any; 
F - Amount of judgment awarded.Initial

Header 14 BEST VALUE EVALUATION CRITERIA AND FACTORSAward of contract shall be made to the lowest responsible bidder or to the bidder who provides goods or services at the best value for the municipality taking into consideration the relative importance of price and other factors set forth below.  Best value evaluation criteria will be grouped into points factors as follows: 
40 points - PURCHASE PRICE  
20 points - REPUTATION OF THE BIDDER AND OF THE BIDDER'S GOODS OR SERVICES  
20 points - EXTENT TO WHICH THE GOODS OR SERVICES MEET THE CITY'S NEEDS 
20 points - RESPONSE TIME, STANDARD AND EMERGENCIESAcknowledge Acknowledge

Header 15 CONTRACTOR'S WARRANTYFor a two-year period after the date specified in a written
notice of acceptance of Work, Contractor shall provide and pay for all labor and materials that
the Owner determines are necessary to correct all defects in the Work arising because of
defective materials or workmanship supplied or provided by Contractor or any subcontractor.
This shall also include areas of vegetation that did meet TPDES General Construction Permit
during final close out but have since become noncompliant.  
Forty-five (45) to sixty (60) calendar days before the end of the two-year warranty period, the
Owner may make a warranty inspection of the Work. The Owner shall notify the Contractor of
the date and time of this inspection so that a Contractor representative may be present. After
the warranty inspection, and before the end of the two-year warranty period, the Owner shall
mail to the Contractor a written notice that specifies the defects in the Work that are to be
corrected.  
The Contractor shall begin the remedial work within Acknowledge Acknowledge

Header 16 EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONSIf bidder takes exception to anything in the Terms & Conditions or Specifications, they must be listed below; supplement list if necessary.  If NO exceptions, print NONE in space provided.None City of Allen None

Header 17 INTERLOCAL CLAUSE As permitted under Chapter 791 of the Texas Government Code, other governmental entities may wish to participate under the same Terms & Conditions contained in this contract (i.e. piggyback). In the event any other entity participates, all Purchase Orders will be issued directly from and shipped directly to the entity requiring supplies/services. The City of McKinney shall not be held responsible for any orders placed, deliveries made or payment for supplies/services ordered by another entity. Each entity reserves the right to determine their participation in this contract.   
Would bidder be willing to allow other governmental entities to piggyback off this contract, if awarded, under the same Terms & Conditions?Yes Yes

Header 18 FEDERAL IRS FORM W-9 Bidder has attached IRS Form W-9.Acknowledge Acknowledge

Header 19 OSHA Has the bidder been fined by OSHA for any willful safety violations in the past three (3) years?
 
Please respond YES or NO.  If YES, please attached to your submittal sufficient supporting documentation to indicate the nature and magnitude of the underlying issues.No No

Header 20 NUMBER OF YEARS IN BUSINESSEnter the number of years company has been in business.50 27

Header 21 INSURANCE REQUIREMENTSThe insurance requirements of this solicitation are required from awarded bidder and a Certificate of Insurance shall be submitted to the Purchasing Department.  Please see attached requirements.Acknowledge Acknowledge

Header 22 CONSIDERATION OF LOCATION OF BIDDER'S PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESSSection 271.9051 of the Texas Local Government Code authorizes a municipality with a population of less than 250,000, when considering competitive sealed bids, to enter into a contract for certain purchases with a bidder whose principal place of business is in the municipality and whose bid is within   5 percent of the lowest bid if the lowest bid is from a business outside the municipality and contracting with the local bidder would provide the best combination price and other economic benefits to the municipality.  Request must be submitted with bid package to be considered by the City of McKinney.  Questions should be addressed to the Purchasing Department at 972-547-7580.  

The statutory language is as follows:  

§ 271.9051. CONSIDERATION OF LOCATION OF BIDDER'S PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS IN CERTAIN MUNICIPALITIES.  
	(a) This section applies only to a municipality with a population of less 
than 250,000 that is authorized under this title to purchase real property or personal property that is not affiAcknowledge Acknowledge

Header 23 BIDDER OR AFFECTED SUBCONTRACTORS' COMPETENT PERSONSDoes the bidder or affected subcontractors have competent persons in the following areas? Excavation, cranes or hoists, confined spaces, safety, traffic control.No Yes

Header 24 OSHA INSPECTIONS Has the bidder had any OSHA inspections within the past six (6) months for which no Citations have been received or for which any Citations have been resolved or vacated?
 
Please respond YES, NO or NA.  If YES, please attach to your submittal sufficient supporting documentation to indicate the nature and magnitude of the underlying issues.No No

Header 25 STATE OF TEXAS HOUSE BILL 1295Effective January 1, 2016, the State of Texas enacted House Bill 1295, an ethics law which applies to contracts of a governmental entity or state agency that either (1) requires an action or vote by the governing body of the entity or agency before the contract may be signed or (2) has a value of at least $1 million. This law states that a governmental entity or state agency may enter into a contract with a business entity upon completion of Form 1295. To obtain this form, please refer to:   

https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/whatsnew /elf info form1295.htmAcknowledge Acknowledge

Header 26 REFERENCES List at least three (3) companies or governmental agencies (preferably a municipality) where the same or similar products and/or services as contained in this specification package were recently provided. Include the following information: Company name, contact person, title, address, e-mail, phone number, fax number.City of Allen Jimmy knep 214-455-8511 Southwest erosion Matt edgeman 214-882-5999Scott Mccroskey 214-202-3907See Attached

Header 27 BONDS TEXAS LOCAL GOVERNMENT CODE, SUBCHAPTER B. GENERAL REQUIREMENTS; LIABILITY, SECTION 2253.021    
(a)  A governmental entity that makes a public work contract with a prime contractor shall require the contractor, before beginning the work, to execute to the governmental entity: 
(1)  a performance bond if the contract is in excess of $100,000; and  
(2)  a payment bond if:  
(A)  the contract is in excess of $25,000, and the governmental entity is not a municipality or a joint board created under Subchapter D, Chapter 22, Transportation Code; or  
(B)  the contract is in excess of $50,000, and the governmental entity is a municipality or a joint board created under Subchapter D, Chapter 22, Transportation Code.Acknowledge Acknowledge

Header 28 QUESTIONS All questions regarding the meaning or intent of these documents shall be submitted in writing to jlemmond@mckinneytexas.org no later than 3P.M. on May 30, 2017. The City of McKinney, as it determines necessary for interpretation or clarification, will respond to such questions through addenda. Questions received after cut off date may not be answered. Formal written addenda will be published and made available through https://mckinney.ionwave.net. No other interpretations or clarifications shall have legal effect.Acknowledge Acknowledge

Header 29 DIGITAL SIGNATURE The undersigned agrees, if this bid is accepted, to furnish any and all items upon which prices are offered, at the price and upon the terms and conditions contained in the Bid, Conditions of Bidding, Terms of Contract, and Specifications and all other items made a part of the accepted contract.  

The undersigned affirms that they are duly authorized to execute the contract, that this company, corporation, firm, partnership or individual has not prepared this bid in collusion with any other bidder, and that the contents of this bid as to prices, terms or conditions of said bid have not been communicated by the undersigned nor by any employee or agent to any other bidder or to any other person(s) engaged in this type of business prior to the official opening of this bid.  And further, that neither the bidder nor their employees nor agents have been for the past six (6) months directly nor indirectly concerned in any pool or agreement or combination to control the price of goods or services on, nor to influencJack Carpenter Initial

Header 30 BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGEMENTBidder acknowledges, understands the specifications, any and all addenda, and agrees to the bid terms and conditions and can provide the minimum requirements stated herein.  Bidder acknowledges they have read the document in its entirety, visited the site, performed investigations and verifications as deemed necessary, is familiar with local conditions under which work is to be performed and will be responsible for any and all errors in Bid submittal resulting from Bidder’s failure to do so. Bidder acknowledges the prices submitted in this Bid have been carefully reviewed and are submitted as correct and final.  If Bid is accepted, vendor further certifies and agrees to furnish any and all products upon which prices are extended at the price submitted, and upon conditions in the specifications of the Invitation for Bid.Acknowledge Acknowledge
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Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

jerry carpenter exc. (jack carpenter)Jack Carpenter jackcarpenterexe@gmail.com Hope to here from y'all thanks for the opportunity

North Texas Contracting, Inc.
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